Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 1:53 PM

To: 'Hui Yang Motor'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN 9939R & SJR 6786M ON 19/11/2017

Dear Sandra,
Thank you for your email below.

If so, we will inform to our Principal AlG accordingly and will close the matter at our end.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hui Yang Motor [mailto:hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 11:40 AM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN 9939R & SJR 6786M ON 19/11/2017

Hi Jas,

Our client does not have substantial evidence to prove for his version of the story.
If that's the case, really no choice but to withdraw from this case.

Thank you & Regards,
Sandra

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, December 18, 2017 5:26 PM

To: Hui Yang Motor (hui_yang motor@hotmail.com)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN 9939R & SJR 6786M ON 19/11/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SIN 9939R
Our Ref : CC4/AIG17022555/Kyb3

Dear Bel,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN 9939R & SJR 6786M ON 19/11/2017

We refer to the above matter.



Our insured is strongly disputed that there was no contact in between 2 vehicles. Initially, you client demanded $50
from our insured for private settlement.

Enclosed herewith our insured accident statement for your reference.
Therefore, we would like to request concrete evidences to support your client’s version.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jas Khine | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



