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Norrita (LKKAuto)

S —————————————————— ——————————————————————————————— ——— - —

From: Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM <jeremyzhiweilim@dbs.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 8:59 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); SUR

Ce: Poh Keng TEO; Leng Tat SEE; LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 22/11

Hi LKK,

Do need your assistance to obtain valuation for the following:

Turf City

1. SKHBT1E
Log-cards faxed over.
Thank you!
Regards

Jeremy

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and
may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the
reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution
or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

Sutlf! Tauftkh



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
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 Vehicle Details

| VehiceNo. T T TskMeTIE i o

Vehicle to be Exported No
intended De-registration Date T 30Nov2017

" Vehicle Make - " VOLKSWAGEN

“VehicleModel  PASSAT1BTSIAT3624H7 i
PRI o e )

e -
EngineNo. . } Rl R R

" Chassis No. i = WVWZZZ3CZDED48820 ey
© Maximum Power Output T 7 1180kw (158bhp) T
L SN e e T

" Original Registration Date T 3102012 o
| FirstRegistration Date © 310ct2012

Transfer Count

0
Actual ARF Paid $26,699.00 f B 5 \[& -';5 y
Intended PARF Rebate Details 7 14 /rtL,
PARF Eligibility ' e I i

" PARF Eligibility Expiry Date il Kiaes 30 Oct 2022 T

PARF Rebate Amount $18,689.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

s  COEEwpiryDate T s e e e S RS
| COECaegay 7 B Car(1601cc&above)
e R = o e e :
L qﬁéﬂ_"d'." e, E LNl B o e S A SO

COE Rebate Amount T 34324300

Bl oo i B2y (0920
The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Nov 2017

Z000/2000 R TH MALIASY LIOH¥D X¥d E1:12 L1002 11/22



Used Volkswagen Passat 1.8 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2

SGL ARMART.COMM Al S or M Searc
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Cheap Car Insurance Renewal

Is your car Insurance expiring soon? e S oy
Receive best quatations from multiple insurers in as litde as 2 hours. | £ fonnec [ ——
& Forgat Pasmword
Post an Advertisement L Chperane S Ty Mtnpsaid S e 57 . Think One Automobile [~
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%£58 until it's SOLD! Stavche COMMERCIAL
Post an g Ackyertinar Lixgin Wys af Sailing
[Browse by Category [ %] Sortby Aep. Dete [ (20 resuitsfpage [
11 vehicles Vihswagen Passat 1.8 fduarced Search B Submit
e Moded Frice Depreciatian R Dt Eng Cap Mdeage Vieh Type Status
Search Selection  Volkewagen Passat 1.8 Arey By iz firry Ry Ay Available
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Bankrugbty And Bad Credit Weloome
Faster Auto Trading Mg Detais
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Highesst Papes Value Among All Units Ar §520901 Redbie...
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L &= ‘o ewvangen, Pssar, Pasaal, {sel Volmwage
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Celine I-'nns !LKI{Aum! v

From: Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM <jeremyzhiweilim@dbs.com>
Sent: Monday, 27 November, 2017 3:50 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuta); SUR

Cc: Poh Keng TEOQ; Leng Tat SEE; LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 22/11

Hi Celine,

Please proceed to bill us.

Regards,
leremy

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 27 November 2017 14:38

To: Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM <jeremyzhiweilim@dbs.com=>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: Poh Keng TEO <pohkeng@dbs.com>; Leng Tat SEE <lengtatsee @dbs.com>; LKK Valuation
<valuation@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request @ 22/11

Dear Jeremy,

The Valuation of vehicle as below:

urf Ci
1. SKHB71E MV 565K FS: 562K

As at November 2017

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: leremy Zhi Wei LIM [mailto:jeremyzhiweilim@dbs.com

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 8:59 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lik .com

Cc: Poh Keng TEOQ <pohkeng@dbs.com>; Leng Tat SEE <lengtatsee @dbs.com>; LKK Valuation
<valuation@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 22/11

Hi LKK,

Do need your assistance to obtain valuation for the following:



Celine Funa ELI{KAutn! _

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 November, 2017 2:38 PM

To: ‘Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM'; SUR

Ce: Poh Keng TEO; Leng Tat SEE; LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 22/11

Dear Jeremy,

The Valuation of vehicle as below:
Turf Ci
1. SKHSYV1E MV 365K FS: 362K

As at November 2017

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefonge@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408g33)

From: Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM [mailto:jeremyzhiweilim@dbs.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 8:59 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Poh Keng TEO <pohkeng@dbs.com>; Leng Tat SEE <lengtatsee @dbs.com>: LKK Valuation
<valuation@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 22/11

Hi LKK,

Do need your assistance to obtain valuation for the following:

Turf City

1. SKH8T1E
Log-cards faxed over,
Thank you!
Regards

Jeremy

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:



REF:

Supvaue
ASSIGNMENT (% | er .
From: Date: vehNo:  QKH LTk ¥t Regn: e
Estimated Cost: Type: M.Car/ M.Cycle/ Bus [ Van | Lorry | Taxi/ Prime Mover /
OD/TP /WS /TP RES/OD RES / EVA | INV | MV Truck ! Trailer or
To Inspect Vehicle No: Make: \i;ﬂlnk‘lli'ﬁe‘n Proat e 1A4EL
at Workshop m's Calour - AIC: Insured | Std / NI/ NA
of ) i Sp.Reading TIRadio: Insured / Std | NI | NA
Insured: o Eng/No: . |
i e WNWZZZICZOE "OHEED0
Claims No, Gen. Cond: Good [ Fair / Poor | Burnt
Sum |I1$LleI:.|_f T ol ™ E;:;af;s: e Steering: Inorder / Jammed / Leaked | Burnt or
{Client's Record) - Brake: Inorder/ Jammed [ Leaked | Burnt or I
Make of Veh: Modi: Nil /S/Rim | STD A/Rim or
3 o "} Tyre Size: oo T E ]
{Policy Condition) R:

Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OIS

repair at the time of inspection.

Bal, or Market Value:

IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or No
GIA | PR Seem . Consistent? : Yes or No
Est. Repairs: days Res. Yes or No
Lum Sum: . 48 % 3Val: Yes or No

CA | REV | REP. | 24 HRS
., Vehicle: IN/OUT

Data: Person Contacted:

BS | DUN [ EXNOVA | GY | FS | LIZA | MIC | OHTSU | PIR / SUMI/
TOYO | YOKO or

Eront Rear

RiBal, mm R/Bal. mim
LiBal. e L/Bal L, mm
DOA bol. ﬁlﬂr&b'&
Survey held at

Des. of Damages : Frt [ Rear / O/S | N/S | UIC | Rooftop or

The WC | Chassis frame / Body Structure affected due to collision.

Date/ Time

DateTime, Fia Fass lo? : Preli. Report Days Of Repair:

1) _ E: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: Survey Fee;

Date/Time, Fils Retur to? Transporiation,

3 Add Fee: D: Site Insp  ($ )__S+RS__8
CInterview  ($ )| Photos

Report Format : ' Tech. Invs ($ ) Others

Lump Sum [ LB.L: ($ ) ' Weekend ($

)
TOTAL




