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'Vl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- -
A M
- TEL 6258 1561 FAX B256 4315

Reg. No: 189607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automabile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Ref CC4/lN 7022458/ Upal
405.02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE 049711 Dot - 2pA3E0N Inmmllmmm
Code : 112
8l Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 3144M Veh. Inspected SKN 32668
Policy No. Coverage (8) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 241112017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c. 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Medification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre ' mm
4. Description of Damages
5 General Information
Accident Date  24/11/2017 Inspection Date 2711207
Survey held at VFIX AUTO SERVICEPTELTD
B0 KAK] BUKIT AVE 6, ARK@KB, 417802 KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417862 )
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Pagelotrd

Owner |D Type Business

Owner ID 7502w

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Na. SKN3246B
Vehicle to be Exported Mo

Intended De-registration Date 27 Nov 2017
Vehicle Make TOYOTA

Vehicle Model VELLFIRE 2.4Z G-EDITION CVT 2WD 5DR SR
Primary Colour White
Manufacturing Year 2014

Engine No. 2AZG346886
Chassis No. ANH208324381
Maximum Power Output 125.0 kW (1567 bhp)
Open Market Value £39.896.00
QOriginal Registration Date 30May 2014

First Registration Date 30 May 2014
Transfer Count 0

Actual ARF Paid §47,855.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility Yes

PARF Eligibllity Expiry Date 29 May 2024
PARF Rebate Amount $35,891.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 29 May 2024
COE Category E - Open Category
COE Period(Years) 10

QP Paid $79.000.00

COE Rebate Amount $51.134.00

Total Rebate Amount $87,025.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Nov 2017

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCT... 27/11/2017



Vix Auto Service Pte Lid
60 kafl Bukit Ape &
Ark KB Singapore 417852

vfix :

Email: vfixauto@gmalil.com
Tel. 64489268 Fax 64452368

M/S INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD e 4 ESTIMATE
N /ézx_ﬂ /
64 CECIL STREET : DATE : 24/11/2017
#05-01 10B BUILDING A= (L ACCT DATE . 24/11/2017
SINGAPORE 049711 /- ’j,L_ZQU REF NO. : VFIX-TP20170374
< ; /}f’{" POLICY NO
Attention: Motor Claim Department {:/x, . j,fé’ / l’
“a7/ i)
RE : VEHICLE NO.SKN32668B TOYOTA ALPHARD
DESCRIPTION L AMOUNT 55
1 1 REARBUMPER r LD 133950 —
2 1 REARBUMPER SIDE RETAINER Ty T260 —
3 1 REARFENDERCOWLING ""‘73— vadler Cove A& 102.00 |
4 1 REARBUMPER REFLECTOR A1 7050 X
1,584.60
> LESS 25% 396.15
K S 1,188.45
DESCRIPTION  (SPECIAL NETT) AMOUNT 55
1 1 REVERSESENSOR 27/ ¥4 {7 A 35000 s
2 5 REARBUMPER CLIP 600 4~ 3000 SN
S 420.00
LABOUR & MISCELLANEOUS: AMOUNT 55
1 To remove/replace damaged parts with all necessary components/ o) 0@3 800.00

attachments apply hot-works where necessary repair/resharpe dented panel
in accordance to factory spectification, replace new parts align into position

refit all necessary components / attachments

To spray paint replaced/repaired body panels inclusive of preparatory

works and painting materials

Koo 1,000.00

To install all reverse sensor and check function _-E'Z_ 5 100.00
S 1.900.,00
GRAND TOTAL - $ 3,508.45
' . ML ] g
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 Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim®iii.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 1:35 PM
To: vfix auto; ‘sur@lkkauto.com’; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc Matalie Lee
Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SKN3266B (Accident involving SKN32668 AND
SHC3144M on 24/11/2017)
Attachments: 24112017115216.pdf
Dear Sir/ Mdm,
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SKNI266E and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Natalie.
*Kindly upload this survey request email to menimen. @
Thank You.
witt amnﬂ "J
Best Regards, hbﬂ Aire a{? 1?151 ey
Gabriel Wee

Mator Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | #05 108 Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: vfix auto [mailto:vfixauto @gmail.com]

Sent: 24 November, 2017 12:14 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll «<motorclaim@iil.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SKN3266B (Accident involving SKN3266B AND SHC3144M on 24/11/2017)
Dear Gabriel Wee

We appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Thank you.

Best regards
loanne

Viix Auto Services Pte Ltd
B0 Kakl Buklt Ave 6 Ark@KE Singapore 417892 | £ vfivauto@gmail.com | T: «65 64552557 | F: +65 64452368

On Fri, Nov 24, 2017 at 12:01 PM, Motor Claim - ITI <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,



We*acknaw!edge receipt of your email.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee
Motor Claims Dept.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
#05 10B Building | Singapore D49711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: vfix auto [mailto:yfixauto@gmail.com]
Sent: 24 November, 2017 11:54 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SKN32668 (Accident involving SKN32668 AND SHD6711T on 24/11/2017)

Dear Sir / Mdm

Please find attached NOA for your kind perusal.

Thank you.



Best regards

" Joanne

s Aurtio Services Pie Ltd

0 Kaki Bukit Ave § Ark@ KB Singapore 417832 | £ vikauto@gmail.com | T +65 64552957 | F: +65 64452368

Kindly note that by submitting this claim 1o us. you are deemed 1o have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore, This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

[f you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted. lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data. sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



05 DEC 2017

Our Ref. No.: VFIX-TP20170374

MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INS PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET

#04-00 & #05-00 10B BLDG
SINGAPORE 049711

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam

PROPERTY CLAIM ONLY

f o
Viix Auto Service Ple Lid
A0 Kokl Bukil Ave &
Afk& KB Singopore 4] 7892
Emaill viiwouto@gmail.com
Tel: 44489248 Fax: 44452348

Co. Reg. No. : 201402944H
GST Reg. No. : 201402944H

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN3266B AND SHC314aM ON 24 NOV 2017 ALONG AIRPORT

BOULEVARD

We refer to the above-mentioned accident.

We are writing on behalf of M/S MH LIMO the registered owner of motor vehicle number

SKN3266B which was involved in the above accident.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by the negligence and management of your
insured’s vehicle number SHC3144M. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged
and our client has been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair :86  1,819.00
2. Lossofuse | 2daysx5120) 5% 240,00
3. LTA search 1585 5.35
TOTAL AMOUNTS 155 2,064.35

We enclosed a list of the supporting documents: -
[a) Original Final Repair Bill

(b) LTA Search Fees

(c) GIA/Police Report Lodged By Our Client

(d) Letter of Autharity

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and your favorahble reply is greatly

appreciated.

Any settlement reached is strictly without prejudice to and shall not affect any other claims arising

from this accident. Settlement is solely for the items claimed only.

Yours faithfully,
VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD

fi ?_\HM'

Kelvin Poh




To: INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

64 CECIL STREET

#04-00 & #05-00 10B BUILDING

SINGAPORE 049711

Dear 5ir / Madam,

Claimant

ACCIDENT INVOLVING Skp) 22LCR

AND SMC 2184 M oN ::H-]u‘“# AT

MrPoRT  EounsJpRn

IfWe, Wi .Lum'.g

, am/zre the registered owner of

motor car no. Skl _LLE

Fleaze pe informed that | have assigned aill compensation monies due w medus in the aliove

accidentto VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD.

If\We heraby authorized you to release all monies pertaining to the above mentioned accident
to VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD and forward the settlemeant cheque to VEIX AUTO SERVICE PTE
LTD whom I/we have suthorized to collect the sald compensation monies.

Thanl you,

Signature of Claimant &

Company Stamp if applicable
no.: SATISH S wJ

Date: {f,yr{;;}

¢' ,

Slgnature uJ‘u'\ﬁtness

ICno: S afara T

Date: 5"7! :7 //il ?
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

india Ref; MCT1711083Y
Claimant Ref - SKN 12668

Well, ____VFIX AUTO SERVICE PTELTD.

wilh [ha appomied EmdlmlmnddmullmimﬁuLu
of Surveyor] with respect 1o Ine amounl claimed ler S5 90950

—

uselsecial), 5§ 835 (search fee), vehicle no. SKN 32688 thal was

{"ihe workshop' ] hersty confim that wall have resched an agresment

LK ALITO CONSLLTANTS PTE LTD {name

{repair cosi), S§_10000 {loss of

dmﬁmmlinmmmwmm

(location] involving vehicle no. SHC 3144M (nsured

on _ 24A1EEIT__ (date)al ___ ASPORT BOULEVARD

vehicle] Ths is pursuant to the inspecion conducied on __ IN20MT

Wall corfirm that wa/l smfam authorized by the owner
claimant®) of vahicla m.mmm-mmmummh
Wmmnnhis'hnrhmdlhlmmlrmlw1ﬂumﬁl Wail

party claimant”

[dale) &l “Ine workahop”

- MH LMD [“the third pary
the sbove paragraph and wall hove full uthority to sstlie

mmmlnmmrurnm-;glmwwm

Wail further confirm thit well will indemrify Indls intemational Insurance Pie Lid for all damages, loss andlor expense Lhal
thoy will or have aiready nourmed in the evert that “the third party ciaimant” sfler the phove sand sgreomenl lodges &

mmmmmmmmmmmmw

pertaining o cost ol repairs andior rental and/or loss

of usa pursuani 10 the damags lo SHM 12658 Iuﬂ-w:hnuusnmulnfmanﬁdnnl.

Well carfirm that the agmement reached abova |S in full and final setilement of all claims of “the third party claimanl”
pursuant o the accdont and that further this setflement s reached on a withoul Mmmmmhndwv

basis.

This agreement i subject lo the applicaton of Singapore law and the Singapors Courts hava exciusive juisdicion over any

dispute arsing oul of Ihe same.

Wae/l authorize youlo paytheiotal amount of 55 1,014,

Dated nis T day of ... ERLL, — 1=
CLAIMANT:
Signed by “the
— Joanme weng
NEIC STALAA

Address bl Lax Bukiv Ave b
b s V) AL

Nationality IVLALA) 1A R
Prdnaav .

8BS 1o WFIX AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD

WITHESS:

Signature: e
Signed by appoinied Surveyor

Marme. LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD

NRIC: 19060TIN8R. S -

Address; 51 LRI AVE 1, PAYA UBIINDUISTRIAL PARK

Hationality: e ——

Ocoupation’ [ —



vfix

Viix Auto Service Ple Lid

80 Kokl Buklt Ave 4

ArkBEE Singopore 41 TA92
Email; viixaulo@grmoilcom
lel 444BV248 Fox: 44452348

Co Reg . No: 2014029844
GET Rag Mo: 201 4029644

FINAL REPAIR BILL

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INS PTE LTD DATE : 05/12/2017
64 CECIL STREET VEHICLE NO : SKN32668
#04-00 & #05-00 10B BUILDING MAKE/MODEL : TOYOTA ALPHARD
SINGAPORE 04971 | ACC DATE . 24/11/2017
CLAIM NO . VFIX-TP20170374
POLICY NO
AMOUNT 55
LUMP SUM REPAIR COST
Repair Amount 1,700.00
7% GST 119.00
Total = = 1,819.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS : ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED &
NINETEEN ONLY

Kelvin Poh



{ Teatasd :!R

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No.  M4-0006522-2

14 QUESTA X

Print Date/Tims 24 Nov 2017 /1121 2B
Racaipt DaiaTimes 24 Nov 2017 1 11:2147
Tax InvoiceReceipt

Recaipl No, ITNET-00000-171124-000705
Previous Raceipl No

SIN item Description/
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST

Result of Insurance Enguiry - SHC3144M

No.

As at 24 Nov 2017/06:35.00

Insurance Co: INDIA INTL INS FTE LTD

Insurance Enguiry - SHC2144M
Enquiry Fes
20171124112025736053

Amount GST Amount

GST (89) (s%) (S8)

5.00 035 535
Sub-Total 5.00 0.35 535
Total Befors Rounding 5.00 0.35 535
Rounding Difference 000
Total Amount Payable 515
Paid By
xeomoEnefiio mmﬁﬂlﬂ“ 535
Total 515
Cash Change ooo
Tendared Amoum 535
Excess Refundable Amount .00

THANE YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered vold and late fee

may apply.



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

-..CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlemant

(CLATH SUBFOLDER TRALKING

Case  [Notfied | Est Submuted  |Ad) Assgned  |Ad) Rpt [Ad) Submitted | Ins Autied [Stotus
| 24 Now 2017 | Panding for Survey
27 Mov 2017

ik 00100 541, 700.00 55%1,700.00 Report
e canangy | |t btmers || _ven o | _Conce e |

Haln Reference

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS _ |[Created by adjuster]

Insured | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, (o Reg No . 1993036718

Main
Claimant: | "WH LIMO.  Co. Reg. No.: S3177502W

|2ar1172017 06:00 - 159
Date of Loss: | /g5 Months and 28 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]

Policy/Cover |
Note No.: MCoOMO015%

Palicy No. ) .
SHCI144M {Clrimant): 17-MX004331-R0O3

S S o | Excess:
Viix Auto Services Pte Ltd (HQ) 60 Kaki Bukit Ave & Ark@KB, 417897 Kaki Bukit - Tel! +65 64552957

India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ., [Handied by NATALIE LEE - 63476100 ext 243)

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 8221 6111
|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tl 6256-3561 _ [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] . |Final Rpt due 05/12/2017)

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view An | Compose Cane Mai ||

'« 115G (12/12/2017): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1014.85) - SKN3266B - Claim Handier: NATALIE LEE
l» 115G (08/12/2017): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SKN3I2668 - Claim Handler: NATALIE LEE
« 111_SG (06/12/2017) Alart - Adj Mandate Maintalned - SKN3I2668 - Claim Handier: NATALIE LEE

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Search Tasks |  Cremte Mew Task | comotete ||

Due Date Priority Typs  Task Group Subject  Handler Assignad By Completed On Craated On Dona?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 27/4/2018
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Claim Documents

*SKN3266B (MCT17110831)

[SHC3144M]
™
MH LIMO
Nov 24 2017 6:00AM

[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Viix Auto Services Pte Lid

Page | of 2

Viaw [View in Browser 2]

e 'LELLE:I’ M |
Mo [Finalired On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Peint
1 0812/1709:33 | Video - Accident | @ | Loagmea |
Photos/ Images B i! perpage  [v] I |
[No_ Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 11/12/1717:29  Chassis Number a ﬂ Load G | B |
2 |11/12/1717:39 | Odometer Reading | @ | osdw | &
3 (1117 17:29 | Gemeral View D | e | &
4 111317 17:29 | General View 0 | caws | B
5 [1112/17 17:29 General View ) | Lead WG
6 111217 17:29 | Ganeral View © | adrs | 2
7111317 17129 | General View ©  tairws | A
& _|11112/1717:29 | Ganers) View D | s | A
(9 |13/12/97 17:29 General View D | leadiwc | A
!i_g_:;lu_:_?_}'r_:z_g_ General View © | toadws | B2
11 1217 17:29 | Genersl View | oo | A
12 (111317 17:29 | General View D | Losd ro
13 L1217 17:29 | General View O | leadic | (A
14 [11/12/1717:29 | General View D | esws | 4
15 [11/12/3717:29 | General View - O | sdws &
16 |11/12/17 17:29 | Genersl View 0 | laawe B
17 117 17:2% | General View B  wars | M
18 111217 17:29 | General View O weawrc | A
} _— H e
(19 11/12/17 17:29 | General View 0 | lowdies | 4
20 11/12/17 17:22 | Relnspection Photo O | loadws | A
—— LN Wi oo L BB
21 11/12/1717:29  Reinspection Photo © | oo | A |
122 (111217 17:29 | Reinspection Photo | lLeaarc | A
Documentation - |1 per page v|_
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) | Thumbnall| Print
I 241017 17:50  ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO III DD 24.11.2017 | Loag POF
7 [28/11/17 10140 | TP GIA REPORT | | Load POF
3 |IWLIIT 10040 (TP ESTIMATE- MARKED | | Load POF
4 [1112/1717:27 | LOD AND ATA FORM Ll — 0 | LoadpoF
5 [11/12/17 17:27 | FINAL REPAIR BILL | Loaa poF
6 |11/12/1717:27 | LTA SEARCH S 0 | lcadeor |
7 [27/04/18 10113 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM - Load PDF .
B 27/04/18 10113 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER 0 | vLosaror |
9 [27/04/1810:13  |LOD N o 0 | oo roF
[No_|Finaired On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
I 27/11/1708:47 | Singapore Accident Statament 0 | lcauror |
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Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST s I Save I Prit ]l
iTI'II'I‘l are no document checklists configured. [

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To: || Handling Insurer
ks RESATRL BW DR Wi ¢Du BROW I ST R
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd o regne 1sssor1ser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.comassignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/I1117022458/UEA30Q2

Data: 27/04/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pie Lid ~ Policy No: MCOMDD15
Clalmant Vehicle sknazsss Insured Vehicle No:  SHC3144M
Date of Loss: 24/112017 Nature of Claim; TR Claim No: MCT17110831
IPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF I
Reg No SKN3266B
Make & Model; TOYOTA VELLFIRE, 2.4 Z G-Edition (&) Engine No: 2A7G366886
Reg. Date; 30/05/2014 (Man. Year 2014) Chassis No: ANHZ20B8326381
Colour: White Odometer: 148251 km
Engine Capacity 2362 co
Markel ValueNew Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
N OF I A |
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/50 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 235/50 R18
Front Left Side; Toyo 6 mm Rear Left Side: Toyo 6 mm
Front Right Side: Toyo B8 mm Rear Right Side: Toye & mm

The sbove vaives represent (e remaning fyre froacs depih

COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1.510.95 144417 66.78 4.42
Miscellaneous ltams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaour 1.800.00 730.00 1,170.00 61,58
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5§) 3,410.95 217447 1,236.78 36.26
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1.700.00
(58) 3.410.95 1.700.00 1.710.85 50.16
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 238.77 119.00 119.77  50.18
Nett Amount (S§) 3,649.72 1,819.00 1,830.72 50.16
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x 55100.00/day) (5%) 200.00
(5%) 2.019.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S$) 1,009.50
+ Doc/Search Fee (S55) 5356
Nett Liability {55) 1.014.85
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment. 241172017
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Date Inspected: 271172017  Inspected At: Viix Auto Services Ple Lid (HQ)
B0 Kaki Bukil Ave & Ark@KB
Singapore 417892

Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager; Asher Sng Rong Y

NOTE This report representa aur findings af e ime and place of inspection stted hemin. Such inspechion has been camed out fo the best of our
knowlsgge and abilly bul any other labilty undar any ofher circurmaiances (a hereby sxpressly exciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

|Plrt Source: MRM-SG
|Parts: MA-MPV
|Labour: Repairer's

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SKN32668)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 08 Dec 2017)
TOYOTA VELLFIRE 2.4 Z G-Edition (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
{Price-denominated Standard List)

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 “‘REAR BUMPER Dented 1,338.50FL *1,338.50FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Bent 72 60FL *7T260FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER Cracked 102.00FL *102.00FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR Not Necessary TO.50FL *-FL
5 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 380.00FL *371.46 FL
6 5 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 30.00FS *30.00FS
F=Franchise part. S=Spchetl |=Listi=mDisc
Sub Total (S§)  2,004.60 1,015.56
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S§) 493 85 47139
Total Parts (S§) 1,510.95 1,444.17
Report was unsubmitied during fhis print-out |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellancous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairar's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE/REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS WITH ALL New BOD.OO 280.00
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS APPLY HOT-
WORKS WHERE NECESSARY REPAIR /RESHARPE DENTED
PANEL IN ACCODANCE TO FACTORY
SPECTIFICATION ,REPLACE NEW PARTS ALIGN INTO
POSITION REFIT ALL NECESSARY
COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS
2 TO SPRAY PAINT REPLACED /REPAIRED BODY PANELS New 1,000.00 400.00
INCLUSIVE OF PREPARATORY WORKS AND PAINTING
MATERIALS
3 TO INSTALL ALL REVERSE SENSOR AND CHECK FUNCTION  New 100.00 50.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1.900.00 730.00
Report was unsubmiitted during this print-out |
< END OF ESTIMATES =
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