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e Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199607198R

S1UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : ((45) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: STMO04KM

Our ref: CCH/AXA17022436/Kpa3 Date: 14.12.2017
The Motor Claims Department

M/s AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SJIM S4B

We refer 1o the above matter.,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 13.12.2017

at the premises of M/s Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Lid - Sin Ming and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : S% 2,362.48
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% B98.80
"Check" Items Amount : 5% 345.88
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : S§% -

Tl
Descripuion of Damage: e [CPre——ve=m
The vehicle sustained damages at the m__ -
Front Portion B

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser
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Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Lid

17, Sin Wi 0205
—— T
in Ming_\"ll e
BFG Pw Ta Foox - (R5) G455 6102
LS - E#a Webile wawsa duliocsre S g
mﬂq Moo 2007 100NN
AXA INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Estimate - 406
8 SHENTON WAY 22701 AXA TOWER Bin: E17/2
SINGAPORE 058811 Date - 221172017
Viehicle Num._ = SIM504B .
g MakeModel : HONDA JAZZ-2008
Altention : Molor Clakm Department Chassis/Eng# - JHMGEBS5085205T841L 13211005784
Cantact - 1B00BB04TA1 Fax No_ | BEEO 4740 Accident Date zug:im?
,{ 4,?r Clalm No. : TP IMS
/?'WI‘MHJ Ralerence BFG
P &L y‘h’-fﬂl{ Policy No. - 507639007201
S/N Quantity  Particular <, 4!9', /5‘-1,.- - Unit Price  Amount 5%
5%,
LIST ITEMS °
1. 1PC FRONT BUMPER €A sp3sp —
2 1PC FRONT GRILLE ey 13750 —
i 1PC FRONT GRILLE EMBLEM *;g‘ 2060 =
4 1PC FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE GARNISH naso X
5 1PC FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Y 15750 ~—
6 1PC FRONT BONNET AT s x
List TolalSE - 1393.10
20.00% Discount S$ ; 27862
1,114 48
e SPECIAL NETT ITEMS - e
FRONT NUMBER PLATE 2000
2 1pC FRONT NUMBER PLATE GARNISH 33.00} Fy
3. 10PCS  FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 3150 Ao 3500 —
Special Nedt Total 55 GE 00
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEATING AND REALIGNMENT ON FRONT SUPPORT PANEL }cr-t’
AND FRONT AFFECTED AREAS 600,00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT DAMAGED AREAS 500 00 Perer
10 RUSTPROOF ON DAMAGED PARTS A~ 5000
Labour Tolal 58 ; 1.150.00
E&LOE Total S§ - 2,362.48
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Sin Mm%Autncare BFG Pte Ltd

176, Sin Min

Singapore 575721

Fax

sin Hln&\\?
Autn:are BEG P -
R E d i 8 & &

Teel - (63) G455 D00
IB3) 6455 6102
Website: www.alocare com.sg

rive 20105
Sin Ming Aurnr_m- Complex

CST Reg. Moo 2002100334

AXA INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD imate : E17
B8 SHENTON WAY #27-01 AXA TOWER Estimate :E17/2400
SINGAPORE 068811 Date : 22/11/2017
Vehicle Num. : SIM5048
o Make/Model : HONDA JAZZ-2008
Atenion:: Molor Clsim Deparmant Chassis/Eng# - JHMGEGB509S205784/L13Z11005784
Contact : 1B00BB04741 Fax No. - 6880 4740 Accident Date : 21/11/2017
w _,/f 7 Claim No. ; TP CLAIMS
[% AM o Reference : BFG
‘4 Z 7 _47 Policy No. : 5076380072-01
SN Quantity  Particular hnee, A ﬁ;,- /2. % - Unit Price  Amount S§
*~ ‘?E':?_r
LIST ITEMS : ’
1. 1PC FRONT BUMPER A sp350 —
2. 1PC FRONT GRILLE 13750 °
3. 1PC FRONT GRILLE EMBLEM 2860 °
4 1PC FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE GARNISH 11250 7
5. 1PC FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 157.50 -
6 1PC FRONT BONNET /T 43350 X
List TotalSs : 1,393.10
20,00% Discount S§ - 278,62
1,114.48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS -
1. 1PC FRONT NUMBER PLATE 30.00 f¢
2. 1PC FRONT NUMBER PLATE GARNISH 33.00
3. 10PCS  FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 350 Ae 3500 —
Special Nett Total S§ - 96.00
MEGUR # 2
TO PANEL BEATING AND REALIGNMENT ON FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Gl
AND FRONT AFFECTED AREAS 600.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT DAMAGED AREAS 500,00 €
TO RUSTPROOF ON DAMAGED PARTS An 5000 ¥
Labour Total S8 : 1,150.00
E.&OE. Total S$ 2,362.48
EESSSEEEEE
for Sin Mwig Autocare BFG Pte Ltd I \'




Hsiao an_tﬂ !LI{KAutu!

From: MNur Ain [ SMAC ) <enguiry@autocare.comsg>

Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 5:11 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc angela@autocare.com.sg; Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIMS04B & GBD7120X D.OA 21112017 *** LKK REF:
CCA/AXALTD22436/pa3

Attachments: FINAL BILL tif; LOA tif; LOD.tif RENTAL AGREEMENT tif; SIM5048_21112017 PDF pdf;
LTA SEARCH pdf

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tang

Please find artached for the documents

LOD

Final bill

Rental Agreement
SAS Report

LTA Search

Letter of Authority

Thank you & Regards

e

il
T LI

MNur Ain
Admin Assistant

Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Pre Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05

Singapore 575721

Sin Ming Autocare

Tel: +65 64550600 | Fax: +65 64556192
E-mail: enquiry@autocare.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 9 December, 2017 2:49 PM

To: Nur Ain { SMAC ) <enquiry@autocare.com.sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: angela@autocare.com.sg; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms>;
assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.O.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Without Prejudice
Hi,

We refer to the above matter,



Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement] and shall proceed with direct settflement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mall is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client's vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence an the issues
of llabllity/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

DBest Regards,
Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht @ kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S(40809212)

From: Nur Ain ( SMAC ) [mailto:enquiry@autocare.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 8 December, 2017 12:18 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @Ikkauto.com>

Cc: angela@autocare.com.sg; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.coms;

assignments <assignments@lkkauto,com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Importance: High

Hi Mei Kwan / Hsiao Tong,

| refer to my email dated 5™ December 2017
We have yet to hear from you
Kindly do update us on the liability status.

Thank you & Regards

111111111

Nur Ain
Admin Assistant

Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05
Singapore 575721



Sin Ming Autocare
Tel: +65 64550600 | Fax: +65 64556192

E-mall: enguiry@autocare.com.sg

From: Nur Ain | SMAC } [mailto:engui autocare.com.s

Sent: Tuesday, 5 December, 2017 2:29 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'angela@autocare.com.sg’ <angela@autocare.com.sg>; 'Zaini (LKK Auto)’ <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; ‘Admin A’

<gdmin-a@lkkauto.com>; ‘assignments’ <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SJM504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Hi Mei Kwan / Hsiao Tong,

Any updates with regards to the attached private settlement letter which | have forwarded to you before?
May | check if the liability is cleared?

Thank you & Regards

Nur Ain
Admin Assistant

Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Prte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05

Singapore 575721

Sin Ming Autocare

Tel: +65 64550600 | Fax: +65 64556192

E-mail: enguiry@autocare.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mallto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 1 December, 2017 11:01 AM

To: Nur Ain [ SMAC ) <enguiry@autocare.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.coms
Ce: angela@autocare com.sg; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>:

assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS S)M504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF- CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Hi Nui Ain,

Please refer to enclosed.

Thank you.

Best Repgards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(g080:31)

From: Nur Ain { SMAC ) [mailto:enquiry@autocare com.s
Sent: Friday, 1 December, 2017 10:37 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan(@|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: angela@autocare com.sg; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>;
3




assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Importance: High

Hi mel kwan,
Any updates on the request below?

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Kindly advice on the liability clearance,

Thank you & Regards

MNur Ain
Admin Assistant

Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05

Singapore 575721

Sin Ming Autocare

Tel: +65 64550600 | Fax: +65 64556192

E-mall: enguiry@autocare.com.sg

From: Nur Ain ( SMAC ) [mailto:enquiry@autocare com sg]

Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 3:19 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'angela@autocare.com.sg' <angela@autocare.com.sg>; "Zaini (LKK Auto)' <Zaini@lkkauto com>: 'Admin A'
<admin-a@Ikkauto com>; 'assignments’ <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SJM5048 & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Hi Mei Kwan
Can we have your insured statement?

Thank you & Regards

vvvvvvvvv

Nur Ain
Admin Assistant

Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05

Singapore 575721

Sin Ming Autocare

Tel: +65 64550600 | Fax: +65 64556192
E-mail; enguiry@autocare.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mallto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com)
Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 3:09 PM



To: Nur Ain { SMAC ) <enguiry@autocare.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com>
Cc: angela@autocare.com.sg; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>,

assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21,11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Dear Ain,

Thank you for your email.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197,
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@ kkauto.com | fux: 67414108
Blk 51. Pava Uhf Indostrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408aa1)

From: Nur Ain [ SMAC ) [mailto:enquiry@aulocare.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 10:50 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.coms

Ce: angela@autocare com.sg

Subject: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017
Importance: High

Hi mei kwan

As spoken over the phone, your insured Is claiming against my insured.

After the accident, your insured wanted to do private settlement and thus sign an agreement but did not want to
commit thereafter as he felt the repair cost is high

Please see attached for the copy of their agreement.

Thank you & Regards

';.T“f*".":w}:’
Nur Ain
Admin Assistant

Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05

Singapore 575721

Sin Ming Autocare

Tel: +65 64550600 | Fax: +65 64556192
E-mail: enguiry@autocare.com.sg




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 4:22 PM

To: ‘Angela Tan (SMAC)'; ‘Nur Ain { SMAC )’

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIMS5048 & GBD7120X D.OA 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AXAL17022436/pa3

Without Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to the above matter.

wWe propose settlement at a global sum of $1,530.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liabllity on our part and/or that of our policyholder andfor the autharised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Wishes yon a Merry Clieiaimas & flappy New Year Z00ES

Hest Regards,

Hsino Tong. Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phune: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51. Puva Ubi Industrinl Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Angela Tan (SMAC) [mailto:angela@autocare.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 10:53 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.comz; ‘Nur Ain [ SMAC )’ <enquiry@autocare.com.sg>
Ce: Zaini [LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.0.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CCa/AXA17022436/pa3

Near Hsiao Tong,
Please refer attached file of Rental receipt.
Thank vou

* Wishes you a Happy New Year 2018°

With Regards,

Angela Tan

Customer Service Executive
Can g

SLasawms

Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Lud
176 SIN MING DRIVE, #02-05 SINGAPORE 575721
Email: angela@autocare.com.sg
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Hsiao Tog sLKKhutu!

From: Angela Tan (SMAC) <angela@autocare.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 4:39 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta), 'Nur Ain ( SMAC )’

Ce: Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.OA 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AXALT022436/pa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We confirmed and acceptance $1,530.00 (Global sum)
Thank you.

With Regards,
Angela Tan
Customer Service Executive

.........

Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pre Ltd

176 SIN MING DRIVE, #02-05 SINGAPORE 575721
Email: angela@autocare.com.sg

Tel : 6455 0600 1 Fax : 6455 6192

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mallto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 4:29 PM

To: Angela Tan (SMAC) <angela@autocare.com.sg>; ‘Nur Ain [ SMAC )’ <enquiry@autocare.com.sg>
Cc: Zainl [LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS SIM504B & GBD7120X D.O.A 21.11.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17022436/pa3

Withoul Prejudice
Hi,
We refer fo the above matter.

we propose settlement at a global sum of $1,530.00({all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

"Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admissian of llability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed In any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

IS n it Merey Chrrsomiay & nrf;f;"'al“l Yirue Y

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: fra2-9197 | emul: chewht@kkaito.com | fix: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Puvn Ubn Industrial Park, Ut Avenuae 1, v02-25 | S(408033)



Sin hmng)Aulncare BFG Pte Ltd

174, Sin Ming Thrive 50005
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Min Simgpapone 57571
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Chur Bef: BIFGSIMA04B AXATRAIN
21 Decetnber 2017

AXA INSURANCE (5INGAPORE) PTELTD
§ SHENTON WAY #2741

AXA TOWER

SINGAPORE 068807

: Motor Clinims

Dear Sirs’ Mdm

ACC INVLG SIMSMB & GBD7120X AT MSCP OPP BLK 233 TOA PAYOH
LORSON2LIL2017

We are H'u. ru.p.'l.ll ers Uf‘:‘]liLIL' nis. § -_HME md umi:mun-.l that :,nu were lhn:- inﬁur:r uI'

the m.udi.m Wins q..mls.ed 13:. the ncgllgrncr: nfllu. vehicle :nﬂumd by you, As such, we sire
looking to you for reimbursement caleulited as follows:

1) Repar Costs §551.230.50
2) Laes of Rental for 3 days at $120.00 per duy S8 360.00
3) LTA scurch 58 535

TOTAL: 551,595.85

T'o substuntiate our eliwam, we enelosed the Tollowing;

1) Final Repair bill

2) Rental Agreement
1) SAS Repont

4) LTA Search Receipi
3) Lener of Authoriy

We lpok lorwand 1o vour [svorable reply in due course,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without
prejmli-:e to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ ¢lnimant.

'Yuﬂu}huhtulh

> / /
A Smhw-le

Claims Section
Frail  serened sulogae gl sg

kncl



ALIN
| [ 74 7 -
Sl 3 A o Pra Lig

S1UHD AVE 1, 200-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL & (D651 62563301 FAN : 1005) p2504315

04 DECEMBER 2017

JESSIE CATERING PTE. LTD.
BLK 3015 BEDOK NORTH ST 3
#04-09

SINGAPORE 486350

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/AXALT022436/pad

YOUR REF : P1731818 (GBD 7120X)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 7120X & SJM 504B ALONG/AT 229 TOA PAYOH MSCP
ON 217112017

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform vou that we are the loss adjuster appointed
bv vour motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Sin Ming AutoCare BFG Pte Lid. acting on behalf of the owner of
SIM 5048 against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the opinion that liability is not in our
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim
against vour policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the
rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek
to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please
reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us
and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to

chewht@ lkkauto.com within 10 davs from the date of this letter_if not provided at our reporting
centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

*  Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status
(if any)

Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (1f any)

Video footage of accident (if anv)

Statement and/or police report from independent witnessies) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you
are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

® 8 & & 8 ®



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of

the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without
AXA’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because
of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s). AXA shall keep you
informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter{(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6742 3197 or email us at
chewht@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when vou contact us that we can assist vou more effectively.

Yours sincerely

%mum

ew Hsiao Tong

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

Ce AXA Insurance Pre Lid
(Moator Claims Dept)



Your Ref: E}VI 0 F"""L

Date: 12 12 Jﬂ'l’-}

Mator Claims Department
A¥YA Insurance (Sngagore ) Pe Lid
7 Shtnton way ¢ 37- 0|

nx& Towir

Singapore 0Le N

LETTER OF AUTHORITY

UWe, TAY ¥idun thowng NRIC: SQ0049¢t4§ ] -
hereby authorize(s) 8in Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd to provide further

instructions on my behalf relating to the said claims and as such, all future
correspondence should be addressed to 176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05, Sin

Ming Autocare Complex, Singapore 575721.

| hereby authorized the cheque payment to be issued in favour of M/s Sin
Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd.

Owner's Signature : » é;

Natme Ty Eign (hon§

Nric S YLl J

Date 113 f201F

Witness By > AUTCCARE 225 FIT LTD
Namc ’m r!lﬂ Mlnp Dirive "I].':rzp
Nric Ehﬁngi 81572

Date Fax ' (6 15455 g192

,“ L GORL S



redefining . insurance

CLAIM REF : STMODDAKM
INSURED : JESSIE CATERING PTE. LTD.

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l, TAY KIAN CHONG, NRIC NO. 58009638) hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars ONE
THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED THIRTY ONLY (551,530.00) paid to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as

full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for personal injuries and
damages to property that we/l may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured
or the driver of motor vehicle no. GBD 7120X as a result of an accidant along MULTI STOREY CARPARK

OFP BLK 233 TOA PAYOH LOR 8 on 21/11/2017 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/
passenger/rider/plllion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. 5IM 5048,

We/| hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/for driver of insured vehicle shall not be liable
for any further claim|s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have against the
said Insurer, owner and/or driver af vehicle no. GBD 7120X in connection directly or indirectly with
the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlemeant.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admissian of liability whatsoewver on
the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. GBD 7120X.

Dated this >4 dayof _Vetemher 2043
Claimant's Signature : AL ’
NRIC no./ Company Stamp i SkouhL 587
Occupation/ Business
Address . A9 Puagnol feld wale #11-3a £ (1% 1)
AWsMEfLg

2

Telephone No.

Witness's Name - : gFG ME LD
v in Ming Orive_#02-0%
T Wit

@;u? ! I_ ;:«En?mmg bean ;.zn;ﬂtm

Witness's Signature Fkiet
L] it ): 6455 0600

« A ﬂ:‘(‘fflumsifm
L Aebuils wette SyloCiTe

Witness's NRIC No LG




o, Sin Min \"1

Sin Mmg Aulocare BFG Pte Ltd

Pl San o

Mive #0005

ain Ming Actocane Comples

Singapete 575711

el IR ERASS (N
Fax _ (B5) 4SS 51492

Wiskmilr: www aniocare. com. g

GAT R Moe MLOJ L0001
AXA INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD .
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01 AXA TOWER Tax Invoice : TP17/519
SINGAPORE 068811 Date . 211122017
Viahlcle Num. . SIM5048
A Make/Model : HONDA JAZZ-2008
Mentions : Maotar Cialm Dapsetment Chassis/Eng# - JIMGEGB509S2057841 13211005784
Contact : 18008804741 Fax MNo. : 6880 4740 Accident Dale : 2111/2017
Claim No. : TP CLAIMS
Refarence | BFG
Policy No. : 5078380072-01
SN Quantity Parficular Unit Price  Ampunt S8
LIST ITEMS
1 LLUMP SUM REPAIR | Parts & Labour inclusive ) 1,150.00
List TotalS$ m
E&O0E Total S8 1,150.00
GST @ 7% 5% . B0.50

_pl—

for Sin Mffig Aytocare BFG Pte Lid

Amount Due 58 1.230.50



RENT,
ops “ BLK 10, SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE

2 000 #0110, SINGAPORE 575645

TEL : 64534177 FAX: 64583724

PrE LTO Co. Reg. No. 200822359C

26.12.17
Tay Kian Chong
25, Punggol Field Walk,
#13.24
Singapore 828751

INV NO. 20171038

INVOICE
AMOUNT

Being charges for car rental (SGJ 73972)
from 12.12.17 - 15.12.17 for 3days @ $120.00 $ 360.00
Total ) 360.00

E@BEN‘?AL 2000 PTE LTD



. éﬁﬁ'ﬂmﬁ
2000

RENTAL AGREEMENT

NO: 0805

Date: f}%’%’ -

Oiir Releronce ﬁ f@

Reg Veh. No, fé:? 7"3?—7?

W Mt Lanier O™ 00 e

oo NI ITF

Tmmlf',-?. 30

Pucti po)13/ |3 Tmeln |7 pe= -
il T [KMIn oy Q63 Em
PETRON. LEVEL

i 7{]/ Ko Chong
Heenkien )8, Aol Feld walk,
#13-94,0 953 7< )

e
In

[

344 ¥

r;]m
w | F |

Eilu

"

{

Rates do not inciude Tetrol

Tel Mo, (Residenn) (Dfice) II-IHQ 5' S.q %H e refind will be given for petrol feft in vehicle
NIRC 1 Pussport No. f 00943 ﬁm ronality Wp’ﬂ 7 3 CHARGES /J 3 5% [&n
e Dyt @ 5%
Diriving Licence Mo i PPass Dhue S/fﬁ/&f 0 JU -
- J —l Weeksin) & 5%
Dite of Birth o / ) Age 32
’4? Fi 7 Mimitlinds) 6 5%
Dinver's Name s
I ig a bGUE - E— Insurance / '
Prvivers Adidrens |
Additionsl Reats! Psyable 4 |
= X —
. Surcharpe of Petml
Tel No. (Resident) (Ofhee) (HP) ! ! .
Tl
NIRC / Pasypert No Nationality I 3 6‘ 0
- = Lezs Depoait (Cash/Cheque No (]
Duvitg Licenis No. Paes Date |
Balance Payable / Refundible [
Dhtbe ol Biith Age
Refimd Recetved (CashCheque Mo )
IMPORTANT NOTES - Restrcied to Singapors use only. [Tirer is — -
- Refund Acknowledpemer By Cmh -
linkke 1o puy for the first bk}ﬁﬂ?_[)_ excess under Wsiirpge E . —I LT By Eheaue
Policy in mny accident plus loss of eamings while daimased velic)s Received $ By Hae X__
i onder repan. Vithicle rem during office hour only. No eivice —
on Publlc Holday and Sunday. Diiver niisl be abiove 77 yeurs and Clowguiian 3y
= Yeur dving experiencs Remarks

1/ We have read and hereby agres 1o the terms and conditions on both
sidesy 0f tein rental sereement

I Hiter's Signamme

CAR MENTAL 2000 PTE LTI Co Ry Mo 2022000 - @ik 1 Sin Ming |l Esmir #7101+ 00 Secoe © Singapooe STI06S. Tel G453 3177 Fak 1 6459 3734



Land Transpor x*.nrrmt Iy

Lend Transpon Adutharnty
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registralion No. | M4-D00B526-2

Primt Data/Time :

Aecoipt DataTimies

Tax InvolesReceipt
Receip! No. : ITNET-00000-171121-001823
Previous Rocmpt No
S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Resul of Insurance Enguiry - GBDT120%

As at 21 Nov 2017/15:40:00

Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBOT120X
Enguiry Fes
201711211 71953804654
Sub-Total
Total Belore Rounding
RAounding Diference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
woonoaonooEB46

Teal
Cash Change
Tenderod Amourt
Excess Refundabie Amoun

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

21 Noy 2017 / 1T21:4T
27 Now 2017 1 17:20:51

Amount GEsT Amount
Beflore Amount After GST

GST (SS) (s$)
500 Das
5.00 0.35
5.00 0.35
Cradit Card: Visa
MastarCard

(88)

5.35

515
535
0.00
5.35

5.5
535
0.00
£.35
0.00

FﬂmuhltWhihMmmmdmpﬂynmwwmm
on.

provider / financial
may apply.

Otherwise, the transaction and receip! is considered vold and Inte fee



! "[l Auto

Y Consultanis
Bdm Bma = Pte Lid Company Registration No. 188607 198R

SLUBLAVE 1 #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62503561 FAX : (065) A2364315

To : M/s AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Date: 24/01/2018
THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
) GBD 7120X (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No : STMOD4KM
Vehicle No.
SJM 504B (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC4/ASM1 7022436/Kpa3qg2
Date of Accident 211172017
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost 3 1.230.50 |(WIGST)
Loss of Use '8 days
Rental (If any) - 300.00 3 days
Others: - 5.36
-8
:$
1,535.85
Final Settlement Sum |: § 1,530.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |SIN MING AUTOCARE BFG PTE LTD '8 1.530.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



