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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SLG1457E (C0460516)

 [SLP9510J]
 TP

 LCRF PTE LTD
 Nov 22 2017 5:00PM

 [LIEW HOO YIN]
 Ding Auto Pte Ltd
  

 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 17/04/2018 10:16 AM.
To   AXA_SG; AXA_JasTan
CC   Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Subject   <SEEK MANDATE> Fw: Re: New TP Assignment - C0460516/P1945654
 
Dear Jas,
 
PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL AS BELOW:
 
COR(w/gst): $1,819.00
LOU           :$    240.00 ($60 x 4 Days)
LOI            :$    148.48 ($37.12 x 4 Days)
    Subtotal :$2,207.48
     @50%   :$1,103.74
GIA            :$       2.00
TOTAL        :$1,105.74
REMARKS    : BOLA NIL (50% - Both changed lane)
 
We had spoken to the Insured Driver and was informed of the TP claim and liability and agreed to settle the
matter. Aware NCD issues. 
 
Thank you.
 
Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Consultants Pte LTd
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: AXA_SG; AXA_FlossieAng
CC: admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; ashersng@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 15/12/2017 03:59 PM
Subject: Re: New TP Assignment - C0460516/P1945654
 
Dear Flossie,

  
We refer to the above matter.

  
Please be informed that a copy of TP CCTV Footage was forwarded to you via accellion  for your reference.

  
Based on the footage, both vehicles were changing towards the same when the accident happened.

  
As such, liability likely is at 50/50.

  
Thank you.

  
Vic Alpeh

 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 Tel: 6841 2096

 
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
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CC: AXA_SG
Sent On: 24/11/2017 11:36 AM
Subject: New TP Assignment - C0460516/P1945654
 
Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,

  
Please survey the vehicle and proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

  
Workshop Name: Ding Auto Pte Ltd

 Policy Number: P1945654
 Vehicle Number: SLG1457E

 Date of Accident:22/11/2017
 Estimated Claim Amount:

 Excess: 0.00
 Claim Handler Name: Flossie Ang


