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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 LUbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX" 6256 4313
Reg. Mo: 193607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908

Ref - CCB/CTI17022425/Ayb3

Date : 24-11-2017

LI

Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GX 5639R Veh. Inspected SFJ gogsu
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) . 0.00
Assign From Assign Dat2 24/11/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres-
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
S General Information
Accident Date  22/11/2017 Inspection Date 23/11/2017
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKSP
1 KAK] BUKIT AVE 6
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Sent: Monday, 27 November, 2017 4:31 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: HE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GX5638R (01 . CAl - SMM17D06774C02/9) and
SFJB998U (TP : LKK REF -CCB/CTI17022425/Ayb3) on 22.11.2017

Attachments: MSM117154519-GX5639R . pdf

Dear Shu Pei

Attached our insured accident report for your attention,
Best Regards

Joel Goh
Claims Executive (Motor Division)
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 075309

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6184

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
icel.gah@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www,sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer * This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Ple.
Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {Singapore} Pte. Ltd. Any
unauthorized disciosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the
maessage, please natify the sender immediately.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 November, 2017 3:50 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.crtaiping.com>; loel Goh <joel goh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay
<jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@Ilkkauto.com:=; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GX5639R (01 : CAl - TBA) and SFJ8998U (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI17022425/Ayb3) on 22.11.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SF] 8998U at M/s Hua Meng 5Spray Painting
Workshop.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
e TP GIA report



Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advi-e is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jas and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928,

Thank you.

Rest Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.cam | fax: 6741-4108

el L

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, HO2-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




Certificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 183)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION] RULES, 1960

ROAD TRAMSPORT ACT, 1987 [MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS) RUILES, 1959 (MALAYSIA]

Certificate Number: 5052418533 Cover : driva qri&SSIt
1. Index mark and Registration Number of Vehicle : SFI8998U
Chassls Number © WDB21104127B434683
2. Name of Policyholder ¢ O C SILKSCREEN ENTERPRISES PTE LTD
3. Effective Date of Insurance 06 Jul 2017
4, Ewpiry Date of Insurance o 10 Aug 2018
5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drivelt

{a} The Policyholder,
[b) Any other person who is driving on the Policyholder's ordar ar with hisfher permission.
Provided that the person driving is parmitted In accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations to drive
the Motar Vehicle or has been so permitted and is not disqualified by order of a Court of Law or by reason of any
enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Mator Vehicle.
6. Limitations as to Usel
{a)} Use for social domestic and pleasure purposes and in connection with the Policyholder's business or profession.

This Palicy does not cover
[a} Use for hire or reward.
(b} Use for racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed-testing.
{c) Use for the carriage of goods (other than samples) in connection with any trade or business.
{d) Use for any purpose in connection with the Motor Trade.
# Limitatians rendered inoperative by Section & of the Motor Vehicle (Third Party Risks and Compensation)
Act (Chapter 189) and Saction 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 {Malaysia), are not to be included under these

headings.
EXCESS (SECTION 1) : 55600
EXCESS (SECTION 2) . MA
WINDSCREEN EXCESS : 55100
ADDITIONAL EXCESS : N/A
UNMAMED DRIVER EXCESS : PLEASE REFER OVERLEAF
REPAIR AT OWNER'S PREFERRED WORKSHOP : NO
INSURE WITH COE | YES
NCD PROTECTION : ¥ES
TRANSPORT ALLOWANCE 1 NO
EXCESS WAIVER : NO
PRIMARY DRIVER : M/A
NAMED DRIVER (1) : NjA
NAMED DRIVER {2) . s NJA
HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY ' ; UNITED OVERSEAS BANK LIMITED
SUM INSURED : MARKET VALUE OF INSURED VEHICLE AT TIME OF LOSS

Ifwe hereby Certify that the Policy to which this Certificate relates is Issued in accordance with the provisions of the Motor
Vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 {Malaysia)

Agency . AUTO INSURANCE AGENCY {00000613840)
Date of Issue . 04Jul 2017 15:26 hrs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

e O

Authorised Officer Chief Executive

Countarsigned By:
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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896

ESTIMATE s
0 C SILKSCREEN ENTERPRISES PTE LTD Date :10.01.2018
3006 UBI ROAD 1 Hpne Vehicle no :SFJ 8998 U
#04-398 Be o Make/Model :MERCEDES E200
5 408700 Accident date :22.11.2017
No Description Qty Amount (55)
List Items
1 Rear windscreen moulding 1496 -~
2 Rear bumper ,1]@3." L
3 Rear bumper side holder @ $15.00 f 30
4 Rear bumper side moulding @ 5143.00 * 286
5 Rear bumper centre moulding 2035
6 Rear bumper reverse sensor @ $195.80 *~7 M7 7832 4
7 Rear bumper clips (1set) 60 A€
8 Rear LH fender v 2409 ©
9 Rear LH door o+ 20535
10 Rear LH door moulding 7 45.1/5’"*
11 Rear LH door protector -
12 Rear LH door inner lock 7425

-
HAad

Rear LH door inner weather strip /

Rear LH door glass outer moulding '
Rear LH door top hinge

Rear LH door lower hinge

(A
e LR T

17 Rear LH door stopper - 101.2

18 Front LH door moulding _ 127.6

19 Front LH door protector [«f A NEAA (S#%55

20 LH rocker panel garnish £~ AW, 726 7
" AN o e

21 LH rear sport rim

T T T T e o e = T R I S R ]

LWl o wr v W W W3 A 8 40 4D W W W W A0 S W0 A0 A0 W e n
-=
=Y
o
un

22 LH rear tyre Ko o) 1210
23 LH rear lower arm A . 572 *
24 LH rear knuckle arm : 1875.5
25 LH rear knuckle arm bearing - 1 308
Total 17888
Labour Cost
1 Remove & reinstall reverse sensor S 150
2 Remvoe & reinstall rea&#su&p&mq 2010 S 200
’-3 Remove & reinstall door glass - ) | ' $ 200
|4 Remove Jreplace & repair consistent tclo the accident 5 1500
5 F'.espnf:rgr paiAting 5 1500 -
|6 ;ru‘ff kote S 1507 -
! : o Total S 3800
' ' Grand Total S




-Jas Iihine (LKKAuto)

i ———a = #
From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 9:42 AM
To: WAYKOINT@SINGNET.COM.SG'
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 5639R & SFJ 8998U ALONG/AT UBI ROAD 1 TURN INTO UBI

AVE 3 ON 22/11/2017

Our Ref: CC6/CTI17022425/Ayb3

17 JANUARY 2018

WAYKO INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 5639R & SF) 8998U ALONG/AT UBI ROAD 1 TURN INTO UBI AVE 3 ON 22/11/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you andfor your authorized driver may not
be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 27/01/2018, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on
the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: FPoh Kin (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Wednesday, £5 July 2018 3:21 PM

To: 'Hwang Shiang Yi'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SNM17D06774C02/9; Ourref: CC6/CTI17022425/A1b3
Importance: High

Your ref : SNM17D06774C02/9
Our ref: CC6/CTI17022425/Afb3

Dear Shiang Yi,
We refer to your mandate approval dated 9" July 2018.

Kindly be informed that we have settled the matter as below:

COST OF REPAIR $ 5,800.00
Loss of USE ( $160.00 x 4days) S  640.00
LTA search fee S 5.35
Total $ 6,445.35

Above information is for your file record.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2152 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F ISES  ~~
A.inin

" Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hwang Shiang Yi [mailto:shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 11:06 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Your ref : SNM17D06774C02/9; Our ref : CC6/CTI17022425/Afb3

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKEAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 2:24 PM

To: 'Hua Meng'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: DV: Our Ref: CCB/CTIT7022425/Afb3; Your Ref:  5FJ 8938U
Attachments: DV SF) 8998U.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Qur Ref: CC6/CTI17022425/Afh3
Your Ref; SFJ 8998U
Dear !

ROAD TIATFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 5639R AND SFJ 8998U ON 22.11.2017

We refer to the above matter and our tele-conversation on even date.

We hereby confirmed settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair 5S 5,800.00
2. Lo=s of Rental ($160.00 x 4days) SS  640.00
3. LTA search fee 5SS 5.35
§$_6,445.35

Plear ! 1 the DV enclased and retorn with a copy of Authorization to Act for payment processing.

We need original copy DVY.

Your p--mpt reply will be very much appreciate.
“Kindly mate that this negotintion between parties nn this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intert o0 At resaluing the matter amicably withaot -arties reserting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsocwer, should be deemed J inlerred from Lhis negotiation of terms/settlement.

int i vid-nee being ¢ covered or subscquently produced by either party that will materially
affect) niluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Rerards,
Pol , Chong (Mre) | Case Handler
LE tor Consultants Pte Lid

Ph | email: pohlinaThkkan | fax:6741-4108



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Sent: Manday, 9 July 2018 2:13 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKEAuto)

Subject: Re: offer: Our Ref: CCB/CTI17022425/Afb3; Your Ref:  SFJ 8998U
Dear PohKin

As we “orond €140 NNper day for LOR .
Kindly let us have your DV soonest,

Thanks & Regards
lune

From: Poh Kin (LKKAute) <pohkin@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Monday, July 9, 2018 1:56:51 PM

To: Hua Meng

Ce: Hsin 7 (1Al Admin A

Subject: ulicr; Uur Kel: CC6/CTIL7022425/ATb3; Your Ref: SF) 8998U

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCB/CTII7022425/Afh3
Your Ref: SF1 89980
Dear Jur

ROAD T/ TTIC ACTIDENT INVOLVING GX 5632R AND SF) 8998U ON 22.11.2017

We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand dated 3 April 2018.

On awv  “out neeiudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have instruction to offer settlement as below:

1. Cos! of Repai 5% 5,800.00

2. Los- of Rental [5140.00 x 4days) 55 560.00

3. LTA srarch fen 55 5.35

] S$ 6,365.35

Kindly | =
Kindly Irt us have vouir reply a5 sonn as nossibla,
Your pr tren'y will be wery much apprecials



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

—_—— e — s e s e e Bt
From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUtS)
Sent: Monday, 2@ July 2018 1:57 PM
To: ‘Hua Meng’
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: offer: Qur Ref, CCB/CTINT022425/Afb3;  Your Ref:  SFJ) BAOBLU
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

QOur Ref: CCH/CTI17022425/Afb3
Your Ref: SFJ B998U
Dear June,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 5639R AND SFJ 8998U ON 22.11.2017

We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand dated 3™ April 2018.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have instruction to offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair S5 5,800.00
2. Loss of Rental ($140.00 x 4days) SS  560.00
3. LTA search fee SS 5.35

S$ 6,365.35

Kindly confirm acceptance.
Kindly let us have your reply as soon as possible.
Your prompt reply will be very much appreciate.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Beast Repards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkinglkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Hwang Shiang Yi <shiangyi hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 11:06 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAute); Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref: SNM17D06774C02/9; Our ref: CCE/CTIT7022425/A103

Dear Poh Kim,
Please take note Joel no longer services with CTP and your email sent to EQ insurance.

Please proceed offer as follow:

COR : $5,200.00
LOR {5120.00 -5180.00) x 4 Days
LTA : 55.35

Thanks & Regards,

Hwang Shiang Yi
Motor Division
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Cirect (65) 6389 6541
Fax (B5)6224 7175 /62247478
Website :www.sg.cntaiping.com
Email  claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
shiangyi hwang@sq.cntaiping.com

" :
o R "ARY
Fa Simgapere puce | 938

Disclaimer

This messo s confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid except
where prov | for in awritten agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
wse or disse wation, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender inte - rely,

From: Pc| “in [LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Frid. ;. o July, 2018 11:10 AM

To: Claims cpt of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

1



Poh Kin (LI(KAut.ﬂ i ——

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 1110 AM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc; ‘joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg’; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Your ref : SNM17D06774C02/9; Our ref:  CCB/CTI17022425/Afb3
Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK RESURVEY

PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP_LOD_SFJ 8998U) pdf
Importance: High
Your ref : SNM17D06774C02/9
Our ref :  CC6/CTI17022425/Afb3
Dear Joel,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 5639R (O1) & SFJ 8998U (TP) ON 22/11/2017

We refer to the above matter.

Insured driver collided to third party vehicle while changing lane. Bola 15, Liability is down against our
insured driver.

send letter to Ol via e-mail to notify third party claim and NCD issue on 17" January 2018.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop" at $6,405.35(all-
in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair $21,688.00 $ 5,800.00
2. Loss of Rental (4days x 5200.00) | S 800.00 S  600.00 (4 days x $150.00)
3. LTA search fee 5 5.35 5 5.35
Total | $22,493.35 6,405.35

**05 days recommendation for repair.
Attached here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
For your approval please.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciate.

Below e-mail link contain TP video footage for your file record.
1



Ihttﬂﬁ:ﬁwww.dmp[JDR,(;Dn"I.I"SfinﬂiWSUiﬁSﬂwwleﬂl? 1122 114956 007B.MOV?dI=0

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref : CCB/CTI17022425/Afb3n
2 PRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079908 D “$7:ueled ” mwm"mwmm
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GX 5635R Veh. Inspected SF. aosaU
Policy No. VF1FCOJAF31500569 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM1TDOGT74C02/9 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 23112017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E200 c.C 17968
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. WDE2110412B434683 Colour BLACK
Odometer 86789 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[265/35 R18 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |265/35 R18 GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |265/35 R18 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |265/35 R18 GOODYEAR & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/11/2017 Inspection Date 23112017
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WEKSP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE B
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

5 Working Days

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




BN 7 dl Vg LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
-L(Jil:i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo..t of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFJ 89980
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 1.496.00 =
1|REAR BUMPER TORN 1,783.00 1,450.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @%15.00 WIS NECESSARY 30.00 15.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE MOULDING @$143 00 NECESSARY 286.00 286.00
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE MOULDING NECESSARY 203 50 203.50
4|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @3155.80 WOT NECESSARY TB3.20 =
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 60.00 30.00
1|REAR LH FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 2,409.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LH DOOR DENTED 2,051.50 1,870.00
1|REAR LH DOOR MOULDING } cuT 401 50 347.00
1|REAR LH DOOR PROTECTOR } cuT = =
1|REAR LH DOOR INNER LOCK NOT NECESSARY 74250 »
1|REAR LH DOOR INNER WEATHER STRIP NECESSARY 434 50 258.00
1|REAR LH DOOR GLASS QUTER MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 148.50
1|REAR LH DOOR TOP HINGE NOT NECESSARY 143.00 3
1|REAR LH DOOR LOWER HINGE NOT NECESSARY 143.00 h
1|REAR LH DOOR STOPPER NOT NECESSARY 101.20 :
1|FRONT LH DOOR MOULDING cuT 127.60 58.00
1|FRONT LH DOOR PROTECTOR cuT 577.50 328.00
1|LH ROCKER PAMNEL GARNISH TO REPAIR SEE 726.00 +
LABOUR
1|LH REAR TYRE NOT NECESSARY 1.210.00 =
1|LH REAR LOWER ARM NOT NECESSARY 572.00
1|LH REAR KNUCKLE ARM NOT NECESSARY 1,875.50 =
1|LH REAR KNUCKLE ARM BEARING NOT NECESSARY 308.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT : -484.55
16.623.00 4 360.95
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|LH REAR SPORT RIM (SN) cuT 1,265.00 850.00
1,265.00 BS0.00

Report Ref No. CCB/CTIN7022425/Afb3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No, 19-8607188-R Page No. 2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =S mmp?‘;}} 5

LABOUR

REMOWVE & REINSTALL REVERSE SENSOR 150.00 50.00

REMOVE & REINSTALL REAR LH SUSPENSION NOT NECESSARY 200.00

REMOWE & REINSTALL DOOR FITTINGS. 200.00 B0.00

REMOVE REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE 1,600.00 T00.00

ACCIDENT INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR LH

FENDER AND LH ROCKER PANEL GARNISH .

RESPRAY PAINTING 1,500.00 1,200.00

TUFF KOTE 150.00 40.00

3 B00.00 2,070.00

GRAND TOTAL 21,688.00 7,280.95

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,800.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCB/CTI17022425/Afb3n2

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client mamed on the front page of this Report.
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