Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Manday, 9 April, 2018 2:14 PM

To: Vie (LEKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE= RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YNBT742H (O : EQI
- DM17HO02609) AND SLN819P (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI17022395/hb3) on
20.11.2017

Attachments: LKK INSPECTION REPORT.PDF; LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.PDF; LKK INSPECTION

PHOTOS PDF: LKK REINSPECTION PHOTOS.PDF; TP LOD.PDF

Dear Vic,

Please proceed to direct settle on a without prejudice basis with Performance Motors as proposed in your email
dated 09.04.2018.

Regards,
Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 RN
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 656223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 lﬂ
WWW.eqinsurance,com.sg

="

Privileged,/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tf

From: Joel Goh

Sent: Monday, April 9, 2018 2:00 PM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: FW: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN6742H (Ol : EQI - DM17H002609) AND
SLNE15P (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI17022395/hb3) on 20.11.2017

Dear Francis
Kindly assist
Best Regards,

Joel Goh

Executive | Claims



eﬁnsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 656223 4190
W eqinsurance.com.sg <
&AWdtlmme ﬁ

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tt

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, April 9, 2018 1:58 FM

To: Joel Goh; Janet Tan

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN6742H (OI : EQI - DM17HO02609) AND
SLMNB819P (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI17022395/hb3) on 20.11.2017

YOUR REF - DM17HO02609
LKK REF - CC3/EQI17022395/T1hb3

Dear loslflanet,

ACCIDENT INVOL VING VEHICLES YN 6742H (O1) AND SLN 819P (TP) ON 20/11/2017
We refer further to our below email.

It was reported that our Insured vehicle had rear-ended to the TP vehicle,

We had spoken to the Insured Driver Mr Sathiamoorthi where he confirmed accident details and was informed of
the TP claim, liability and agreed to settle and is aware of NCD issues on 28/11/2017.

In view of the above, our Insured is liable to the damages sustained by the TP vehicles.

Ssummary to offer to repairer PERFORMANCE MOTORS LIMITED is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) 5 22,597.16 S 12,964.38
Loss of Use (560 x 8 days) 5 480.00 5 480.00
GIA Search Fee S 2.00 S 2.00
TOTAL 5 22,279.83 $ 13,446.38

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 8 days
TOTAL 8 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval, please.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

7474

A

SR RER o Save the Earthe Frint only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January, 2018 11:47 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad; Janet Tan

Cc: Asher Sng [LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN6742H (01 : EQI - DM17HO02609) AND SLN81SP (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI17022395/hb3) on 20.11.2017

Dear Lynn,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are still pending for COR finalization from TP repairer.
We will follow up on the matter.

Thank you,

Best Repards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

' .'{ g

- T

Z.2%s s Saue the Eartht Prnt only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January, 2018 11:00 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad; Janet Tan

Cc: Vic (LKKAuta): Asher 5ng (LKKAuto); Admin A



whken pimil.oom. sy

Pgrform_ance Motors Limited

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block

MMND Complex

Singapore 069110

Attention: Motor Claims

“Without Prejudice”

28 March 2018 -

o

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLN819P & ‘!"NE’?42H ON 20.11 ;201 7
Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter,

The accident was caused solely by the negligence on the part of your insured. As a result of
the said accident, our client has suffered losses which are set out hereunder as follows:-

Costofrepair ;| 5% 12964.38

lossofuse : S$  480.00 (S$ 60.00 x 8 days)
GlAsearchfee : S% 2.00
Total . S% 13446.38

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
1. Copy of Accident Report

2. Copy of Final Repair bill & GIA search slip

3. Copy of Certificate of Insurance

4, Copy of Identification Card & Driving License

5. Copy of Letter of Authorisation

Please note that you or your insured should send us an acknowledgement of receipt of this
letter within fourteen (14) days from the date of this letter, failing which our client will have no
alternative but to commence legal proceedings against you without any further notice to you or
your insured.

Should you have a counterclaim against our client arising cut of the accident, you are also
required to send a letter giving full particulars of the counterclaim together with all relevant
supporting documents within eight (8) weeks of your receipt of this letter.

For any correspondence, please contact Ms Caroline Tan at 6319-0174 / Fax. 6472-4601 or
email to pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg.

Yours sincerely

/Cw

Teng Wai Khan
Customer Service Manager, Body & Paint



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 28 November, 2017 2:50 PM
To: wynfoods@wynfoods com.sg
Ce Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Your Ref: YN 6742H_ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 6742H AND SLN 819P ON
20/11/2017
Auto
Consultants
Pre Lid
SLUBLAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 625363361 FAX @ (63167414108

Our Ref: CC3/EQI17022395/hb3
28 NOVEMBER 2017

M/s WYN FOODS PTE LTD By Email Only
ATTM: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 6742H AND SLN 819P ON 20/11/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | 5(4080933)

Save the Earth Frint only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

1



L.

rqad'this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SN VIV » YN &Y 5y Do n-2elF

L "’?‘: 8 WL RS, Nonsarotr Q-—%ﬁ,e\‘}“h\k&r A9y

r of Vehicle Registration No, i

hereby authorise Performance Motors Limited to submit, comespond, negotizie and
settle my claim for cost of repair andlor uninsured lossas arising from the above accident.

| further authoriss Performance Motors Limited to sxecute, sign, s=al and daliver all
documents whatsoever in relation ta this matter and to accept and receive any payment dus
to me in raspect of my claim sbova,

| hereby deciare that all acts and documenits done by virue of this Letter of Authorisation
on my behalf shall be good valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsosver as if
the same had been done or exgéclted by mein person,

| further confirm that the accaptance by Performance Meotors Limited of the settiement
smount In respect of such claim shall constitute the full dischargs of my claim in respect of
such loss and damage.

Signed by

Name: rlfb:,(”:Lr‘1 [Cuvv)gr .(rfkfa’ﬂDﬁiE’]' 2 |]J'U”J) 1>
NRIGNo:  S3¢60 ST VuMede 0P

Inthe oresence of

Name: ‘/]( (Date)
NRIC No.:
| IMhiran A/L Thurasamy |
Performancs Molors Limited
303 Alexandra Roa |
Sime Darby Performance Cenire
Singapore 155541




BMM Eesler

Performance Motors Limited

k mamber of
Co. Reg. Ho.

the Sime Darby Oroup

280

1574016590 G5T Req. Ho MI-

DOE00BL-X

Kamgong Arang Rosd

115, Alexandra Road

3103, mlexandra Eoad = ™ ; Sime Darby Businese Centre
ESime Darby Performance Centre East Ooast Centre gingapore 155544
Singapore 155931 Singapore 438180 Tel, §3190528 AfterSales]
Tal. 631 Salaf & Admin Tel 631308688 (Aft=rSales §3190533/%30 |Motorrad|
83 (hftersalas) FaX. 63448773 Fax, 4796601 |afeerSales
Fax. 4947970 G4T9REZ4 (Motorrad
SERVICE TAX INVOICE
- )
Repair Order No. Bl 1225229 Page No. 1 of 2
Invoice Number 1845713 / WSB
Date IN 28/11/2017 AT EE BaAEE 20/03/2018
Cuat. Sve. Advieor: Inthiran A/L Thurasamy FPayment Terms 30 Days From Invoice
Invoice By Toh Jing Xuan
L .

e —————— —
- CUSTOMER INFORMATION -

Mr Praveena EKumar Reddy Vutukur
15 Bedok Reservoir View
#13-04

Singapore 478933

- INVOICE TO

45912

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Reoad, #17-00 Tower Block

MND Complex
Singapore 069110

e ———

REGHN.

NO .

SLNB19F

CHASSIS NO.
ve2e018

REGH.

DATE

25/08/2017

MODEL
216D CAT

—————

MILEAGE

2050

.

LABOUR 1
To replace rear bumper and attachments, tail gate and
attachments including make good the tail end panel and
knock out dented area cause by the accident,

To respray rear bumper, tail gate and tail end panel,

To remove and install boot compartment carpet and garnish
to facilitate repairs.

To replace rear windscreen glass including conduct water
leak tests

Ta transfer lock mechanism from old fo new boaotlid
including conduct checks on new bootlid central locking
system for proper function

To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the

rear section for proper function.

To carry out body cavity preservation,

To tow accident vehicle to PML workshop.

To remove old PDC assembly, replace damaged parts and
reconnect to new bumper including conduct checks for
proper function.

Ta vacuum car interior to remove shattered glass debns,
Sundries.

INS CLAIMS : ACCIDENT REPAIR. DIRECT SETTLEMENT.
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 20.11.2017. 3RD PARTY CAR : YNG742H.
YOUR REF NO : NIL.

VEHICLE WAS SURVEYED BY MR TAUFIKH FROM LKK AUTO ON
23.11.2017 AT 12:50PM. AUTHORISED REPAIR BY MS VIC ALPEH
FROM LKK AUTO ON 28.11.2017 VIA EMAIL.

PROPOSE LOSS OF USE = $60x8. THE AMOUNT IS SUBJECTED
TO INSURANCE COMPANY COMFIRMATION.

GlA SEARCH FEE = $2.00.

Total Labour 'l
Retal
¥ LIRS F ."._:-" 1.5 TE PSS —_— .\_"::1' Frice
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PDC) 1 966.25
CROMMET 2 0.75

a
=i
=
=

=

2,55
2,399.00
230.00
649.00

451.00

150.00

100.00
195.00
150.00

224.00
150.00
0.00

0.00

0.00
7.248.00

NETT
966.25
1.50 |




wes Daaler Performance Motors Limited

A member of the Simé DAFEY Group
Co. Reg. Mo. 197401559W 5T Reg. Ho HZ-D0Z00BL-X

SEn B a - A 31%; A sandra Road
103, Alexandra Road =&4d, Hampong Arang Foad Sime E;Eb( Business Dentre
Sime parby Performance Centye Tagt Loast CEnLTe Singapore 2
Singapore 159941 i ==l E11

Tel. €318 Ales & Admin £
- :;..1:_3 |AfrerSalenl Fax g::;r4:4
SERVICE TAX INVOICE
Repair Order No. : Bl 12252249 Page No. : 2 of 2
_ ) Invoice Number : 1945713 / WSB
Date IN : 28/11/2017 Invoice Date : 20/03/2018
fust. Bve. Advisor: Inthiran A/L Thurasamy Payment Terms : 30 Days From Invoice
Invoice By : Toh Jing Xuan
— — —_—
~ BADGE (BMW) 1 6950 69.50 |
(DGISL) WISCREEN SEALANT (COLD 1 HOUR) 1 131.55 131.55
TRUNK LID 1 1,174.85 1.174.95
REAR WINDOW ESG 1 632.25 632.25
RH PANEL TAIL LID (EVERESTGRAU) 1 30.45 30.45
(DG) CLEANER R1 (100ML) 1 2385 23 85
(DG/SL) GLASS PRIMER 30ML (VP208) 2 27.85 55.70
(DG/SL) WISCREEN SEALANT (COLD 1 HOURY) 1 131.55 131.55
REAR BUMPER CARRIER 1 423.80 423.80
RR BUMFER RH INNER SIDE GUIDE 1 58.55 58.55
BOOT LID/TAILGATE PUSH BOTTON ICAM 1 46.05 46.05
RER RH LIGHT IN THE TRUNK LID 1 23985 239.85
LOWER TAIL LID TRIM PANEL 1 298.35 288.35
RR LH LIGHT IN THE TRUNK LID 1 239.85 239.85
LH TRUNK LID PANEL TRIM (EVERESTGRA 1 31.70 370
BLIND RIVET NUT M6 3 2.60 7.80
BUMP STOP 8 325 26.00
FRT W/SCREEN KLET BAND 8 2.80 22 40
EXFPANDING NUT 4 1.00 4.00
aM S/F PREMIUM REAR WINDSCREEN 1 252 .34 252 34
Total PBarts : 4,868.24
’ — /
Labour Charges : 7,098.00 Total Labour & Parts Charges : 5% 12,116.24
Parts Charges - 4,868.24 Lese Insurance EXcess : 5% 0.00
Lubricant /Misc 150.00 Invoice Total Amount Exclude GST : S% 12,116.24
GST & 7% . 5% 848.14
Invoice Total Amount Include GET : §§ 12,964.38
Computer generated invoice. No signature is required.  |amount Payable Include GST s$

All amounts are in Singapore Dollars.

Work was carried out subject to the Company's Terms and Conditions of Service.

No complaints will be entertained unless reported within seven (7) days of the date of this invoice.
For credit purchases, interest @1% per month will be debited on overdue amounts.




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Cperating Hours: Maonday to Friday S9am to Spm
G3T Registration No; M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Qur Ref Na: GR-17-175433
Date of Request: 231112017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Performance Motars Limited
303 Alexandra Road

Sime Darby Performance Centre
Singapore 159941

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 23172017

Enguiry By THEMIS ALLIANCE

TP ‘Yehicle No. YHNET42H

Accident Date 20112017

Enquiry Result

| TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
[YNET42H EQ Insurance Company Ltd 12/11/2017-11/11/2018 6223 5433 i
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapere and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under na liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports ar their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

httne://sinoanore merimen com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 23/11/2017



Invoice

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANC E Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours; Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration Mo: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

2

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref Mo: GR-17-175433
Date of Reguest: 23112017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Performance Motors Limited
303 Alexandra Road
Sime Darby Performance Centre
Singapore 159941
Dear SirMadam,
Enguiry Date 231207
Enguiry By THEMIS ALLIANCE
TP Vehicle No. YMGT42H
Accident Date 2001207
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%) N
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
lEST Amount 013
| Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use;
Date;
[%] GIRO [] Cash [] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_...

23/112017



