Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 2:18 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim - EQ Ref: YM6999P / Our Ref: SFR1263K (Date of Accident:

20.11.2017) *** LKK REF: CC4/EQI17022386/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Lynn,

We refer to your email dated on 5 February 2018.

We have confirmed that there is no survey done on SFR1263K (TP vehicle).

As such, we will close the file on our end with no survey bill to your good office.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2018 8:29 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim - EQ Ref: YM6999P / Our Ref: SFR1263K (Date of Accident: 20.11.2017) *** LKK REF:
CC4/EQI17022386/ka3

Dear Lynn,

We refer to your below email and the contents were duly noted.

By copy to Zaini.

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad@egqinsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 5 February, 2018 4:40 PM




To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Third Party Claim - EQ Ref: YM6999P / Our Ref: SFR1263K (Date of Accident: 20.11.2017)

Dear Mei Kwan

Kindly forward us your invoice.
We have settled SFR1263K Subrogation claim

Thank You.

Regards,
Lynn Ahmad
Executive | Claims

ed]nsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9881 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 881 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWww.eginsurance.com.sg

‘.~ A Member of Citystate ?WW"E QO'L Q l:I_i'E\‘rhl'lj

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Bazlin Ahmad

Sent: Monday, December 18, 2017 8:50 AM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim - EQ Ref: YM6999P / Our Ref: SFR1263K (Date of Accident: 20.11.2017)

Dear Mei Kwan

Our insured has reported.
Please find attached.

Thank You.
Regards,

Lynn Ahmad
Executive | Claims

eéinsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9881 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 881 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

‘I‘ A Member of Citystate you've got a friend

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.



