Vic (LKKAuto)

——————————— e ——

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 March, 2019 3:10 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto);, Admin A

Cc Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: <SEEK MAMNDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA7565 (CI -
SNM17D06716C02/6) and SKD5218E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI17022352/Khb3 ) on
2011.2017

Attachments: 20190329145456 pdf

LKK REF - CC6/CTI117022352/Khb3
CTI REF - SNM17D06716C02/6 (SKATS6S)
Section Il Excess Applicable: 551,500.00

Dear Vic

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

P4

You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $8,450.50 ./

Aside to Irene, please assist to follow up on the Section |l Excess recovery.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel (65) 6389 6183
Fax (65) 6224 7478
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com
Disclaimer
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If vou are not the intended recipient af the message,
please notify the sender immediately,

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 March, 2019 10:57 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA756S (Ol - SNM17D06716C02/6) and
SKD5218E (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI17022352/Khb3 ) on 20.11.2017

Importance: High

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to our below email.

For your approval and/or further instructions please.
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Dear Sir/ Madam

KD ECAXE BsD SEA L
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES SEDSIIRE SEAF5L
ALONG OP™MBA< A (R WITDen®2 PNVE ' on oo - 5ok

KD SAISE

I/ We, the owner of Vehicle No. which was involved in the above

accident.

My / Our vehicle sustained damages as a result of the above said accident and 1 / we are now

claiming against you for the followings:-

. =
1. Costs of repair f food.CU
2. Loss-of-Use/Rental fees §ayA - & | bop oV
3. Pelice/GlA report/ LTAfees - B  =°U0
4.  Surveyor report fees -
5. Others - iuey Heoe Ay Lanoyg

Total: 4 % 00

Please advise whether you are now prepare to settle my claims as outlined above.

1/ We hereby authorise my / our repairers, M/s Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. and/or their representatives
to negotiate/compromise settlement of my / our above claim on my / our behalf. If there is a settlement
I / we further authorise you to pay whatever settlement sum to my / our repairers being the outstanding
repair bill and incidentals due to them.

Your kind attention and prompt settlement is much appreciated.
Yours faithtully,

y
[/
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51 UBLAVE 1. #01.25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Our Ref: CC6/CTI17022352/Khb3
14 DECEMBER 2017

TW PREMIUM AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
210 TURF CLUB ROAD

LOT A8 THE GRANDSTAND CARMALL
SINGAPORE 287995

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA 7568 AND SKD 5218E ON 20/11/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Vic/Alpeh
DID: 68412096
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

C.C. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY
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BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, 1/ We,
=T Aac¢
NRICNO, _ S SO H

Hereby irrevocably appoint Messrs Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. at Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate,

The owner of Vehicle No.

Sector C, #01-76, Singapore 575642, and/or their representative to process the Third Party claim on my/our
behalf and to do all and/or any of the followings:-
1. To submit, negotiate/compromise and to resolve settlements of my/our above mentioned claim,
2. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to
be made by way of Cheque in favor of Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd.
3. For any of the purpose aforesaid, to execute, sign and deliver all documents whatsoever as they deem

necessary for the purpose of settling my/our said claim.

1/ We hereby declare that all the processing and documents done by virtue of this letter of authority on my/our
behalf by my/our repairers or any person authorized by them shall be as good valid and effectual to all intends

and purposes whatsoever as if the same had been done or executed by mefus in person.

[ / We further confirm that the acceptance by Messrs Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd. of the settlement amount

constitute the full discharge of my/our claim(s) in respect of the above accident.

| i =}Gt }‘

Signed on the ___ (day) (month) (vear)

Acknowledged by Owner
(company stamp if applicable)
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MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy Mo = DMHECEN1T15751700 Elaim Ho :SNM1ITDOGVIECO2/ 6 (SRATSES)
Claimant ¢ SYED FADZLEIGH BIN SHAFARI
Amount : 558,450,540

SINGAPCRE DOLLARS EIGHT THOUSAND FOURE HUNDRED FIFTY AND
CENTS: FIFTY QHNHLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentionped amount to be paid to mef/us in full &
final ‘settlement of all claims; costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle No. : 'SEKD 521BE

Insured Vehicle HNo. o BRA TS5
Date of Loss 2001172017
Place of Accident : GAMBAS AVENUE EXIT WOODLANDS AVENUE 12

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE, LTID., I/We agree absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : TW PREMIUM AUTCMOBILE PTE LTD
Driver HName : SAFRARUDIN BIN MUSTAFAR

from all claims, present or future in zespect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of 1iability con the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGARCRE) BTE. LTD.

{1} General Damages 55
(2} Cost of Repair/Excess 55 7,008.,.50
{3} Loss of Use/Rental/ 55 1,440.00
{4y GIA/Pulice FReports/

Investigation Resulta/Search Fees 55 Z2.00
(5} Medical Feports/Expenses S5
(6} ‘Survey Fees/P.T. Fees S5
(T) Cost including Dishursement 5%

TOTEL & = % & % @& % % & @ % & 56 %% @ sk g,450.50
SHAP|

Claimant Mame : S‘iéb hbl&t{‘lﬂ &r& HﬂNEIC Moo 2 S %f&#f?ﬂ.

t} % T
" The contenis of this document apply to vehicle
damages only. All personal injuries and damages

arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit
and application of this document."

e / e 274




ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE. LTD.

Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, Singapore 575642.
Tel: 6453 8686 (3 Lines) Fax: 6459 6550
Company Reg. No.: 201113667N
GST Reg. No.: 201113667N

No. : 15452
Vehicle Insured : SEA7TR6S
Accident Date : 20=-Nov=2017 Date : 11=-Dec-2017

OQur Ref : 217178 (CHINA) / CHAN PAGE : 1

SYED FADZLEIGH BIN SHAFARI
BLE 803 WOODLANDS STREET 281
#06-57

Singapore 730803

FINAL REPAIR COST FOR TOYOTA HARRIER 2.4 SKD521BE

To supply spare parts

To rewire damaged parts and refocus
headlamp beam.

To remove & refix rear windscreen
glass and conduct water leak test.

To remove roof lining, front and
rear seats, trim board and carpet

To apply undersealing

To remove and renew rear exhaust
silencer box & centre exhaust pipe

To putty and spray replaced parts

To remove, cut-out damaged parts,
panel beating, welding, align,
refix and to renew above parts

6,550.00
Add 72 GST : 458.50
Total : 5¢ 7,008.50

Singapore Dollars Seven Thousand and Eight and
Cents Fifty Only



CUSTOMER

BLK I, SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE, SECTOR C, #01-125, SINGAPORE 575636, TEL: 6453 !-IT.’-_

/, SYED FADZLEIGH BIN SHAFARI

%

C/O ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTELTD

BLK 7 SIN MING IND. ESTATE
SECTOR C, #01-T6

SINGAPORE 575642,
ATTN: MR, ALAN KHONG

RENTAL FEES FOR :-

INVOICE NO:

27412

&

.

DATE

YOURREF : --

TERM

$129.11.2017

CASH

~

7

unit pr $

amount

vha no.

vr reference

no. of day/s

sin

vehicle no.

16723

SKD 5218E

8

S 200.00

% 1.600.00

1

SGGE686Z

L]
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S 1,600.00

PLEASE LET US HAVE YOUR CHEQUE MADE IN FAVOR

OF HUI SHOON CAR RENTAL

YOUR EARLY REMITTANCE IS MUCH APPRECIATED.

HUI SHOON CAR RENTAL



HUI SHOON CAR RENTAL

BLE 1, SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE, SECTOR C, #01-

SINGAPORE 5750636 TEL: 6433 1473
REGN. NO,: 53013461)

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

T R - < V2 o SO
! Make & Modak: '701\{&-14__ Q;Ef{ {Li&ihﬁar‘-ui’

" "

out pae | —¢ FI = }'L'fl}

wer SYLD POz Bin SAATeRN
NRIC / Pasepor No: _ a0 bl 344 pate of ginn ™ S| &
Address: SLLL' 9‘% Luhhp[,ﬂﬂm jT &PI.

125

VRA NO:

| 16723 |

Group:

";:IUT. Time [;'_f}_ . "’f?/

Aeplace Veh Mo

Migags Out;

Driver Age 23 10 25 years old with 2 years driving expenence
Driver Age 85 to 70 years old with 2 years driving experience

D SIHY €

Lol-FF g 3z E"ﬁi} | out pate | OUT : Time |
Driving Licence Mo Pass Data 1.1[.?_' Jeot %
Contaci Number A 386 ¥owr ) CMARGES , yia

Drily (g/ ES‘:‘}OO{,mrdaf fbm f f
DHIIil:rE-'I:jE'; ::L::r':r:'lnlﬂrl::-ns Weskly as par week I
appointsd Oryer_ SMED NWS T PP Py g = o //
H &E par hour
NRIC  Passport No _-3_3’11 ﬁ Date ol Birth: _ w i /"’
. Ot a@s
Addraga: B"-’_‘" a-ﬁ ‘5 Mhmt‘_} L = o / =
ﬂ.ﬁi‘u Ty 5 {_}’hh})
0" . D - = |
Ditiving Licanca Mo: _L 231331 Pass Date \a ‘I| R e B b
Contact Numbar: ‘13!"[. N-af, —— SUB-TOTAL § [é {_’}C} C}O
New Insurance Policy Terms & Conditions as at 08-12-2010 | PETROLLEVEL | % —
: o ! =

1. NOT PERMITTED TO DRIVE - Not Covered |————— e /f"

Driver Age 22 years old and below - (_... = 7 i
Driver above Age 70 years old : —Léﬁﬂfﬁj_
Driver less than 2 years Driving Experience TOTAL CHARGES § .

2. ADDITIONAL EXCESS - S53000.00

IMPORTANT!
Z'-'-" FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY

Exuess Linbiity %(L’ L:]

Malaysla Excess (With Prior Consent)

AT] HUongd)

@

Hirer's Signature

ot
/

|
ma— { -
Addition Driver's Signature b f
I

| havee rmad and agree 1o the tarms and condiion on both sdes of fhs agreement. |f | have presended & charge/cradit card for payme

nt, | :;.grnglnar Bl amgunts payable Lndar this sgraarmant

&0 for parking end taffe infringamants may b billed to that aceount and my signatune abass will b congiderad 10 have been made on tha charga'cradil card voucher, Al inlormakan | Rave

grven HUl SHOON CAR RENTAL in conpaclion wilh thisagresment is trie
* IMPORTANT

DRIVE THE VEHICLE, OTHERWISE RDDITIOMAL S33000.00 EXCESE IS APPLICABLE

QNS ABOVE 26 TO BE BELOW BS YEARS OLD WITH MORE THAN 3 YEARS DRIVING EXPERIENCE AUTHORISED, LICENSED AND SIGNING THIS AGREEMET MAY:

2 ALL PARMING AND TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE HIRER. AND ADMINISTRATIVE CHARGE WILL BE LEVIED ON ANY TRAFFIC. VIDLATIONS

REDIRECTED

3 THE HIRER SHALL BE LIABLE FOR EXCESS CHARGES FOR ANY LATE RETURN AT THE RATE S50WN PER HOUR ©A PER BaY, INDLUSIVE OF COW AND/OR PAl WHERE

APPLICABLE

4 VEHICLE IS STRICTLY FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY, AND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGARPORE WITHOUT PRIOR CONSENT OF THE COMPANY HUI SHOON CAR AENTAL
5. |N CASE OF ACCIDENT, THE HIREH SHALL REPOAT TO-RENTAL OFFICE IMMEDIATELY. IF THERE 15 BODILY INJURIES, A POLICE REPOAT MUST BE MADE WITHIN 24 HOURS

RETUAN OF VEHICLE. THE HIRES / DANVER 1S REQUIRED TO SIGN IN THE COLUMN "SIGNATURE OF HIRER  DRIVER" FAILING WHICH THE DAY AND TIME INSERTED BELOW
SHALL BE DEEMED TO BE THE DAY AND TIME THE VEHICLE 15 AETURANED TO HUI SHOON CAR AENTAL AND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPTED AS CONCLUSIVE EVIDENGE
OF THE SAME AND SHALL NOT BE CHALLENCED OR QUESTIONED ON ANY ACCOUNT WHATSOEVER

DATE IN TIRE I MILEAGE CHECKED BY %

ot |

<1/ 4,0_@ Pak2lh iy

=

SIGATURE OF HIRER | DRIVER

f



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I"SURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-174488
Date of Reguest: 211112017 Your Ref Na: Online Purchase

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
Elk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate

#01-76

Singapore 575642

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 211172017

Enguiry By CHAN YEW SIAH

TP Vehicle No. SKATS6S

Accident Date 201112017

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKATEES China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 27/02/2017-30/01/2018 6389 6111
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Asscciation of Singapore and we take no respensibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp ... 11-Dec-17



'Invoice

GENERAL

Cur Ref Na: GR-17-174488
Date of Reguest: 211112017

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-76

INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Singapore 575642

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 21112017

Engquiry By CHAN YEW SIAH

TP Vehicle No. SKATSES

Accident Date 201112017

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Tharnk You,

This is @ computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[%] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque
hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 11-Dec-17



