Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 3:43 PM

To: ‘Xinya Auto Services'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: TP 1138/11/17_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFV 449C & SJE 773H ON
16/11/2017

Attachments: RV AIG SJE773H 16112017 .pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,
We refer to your email below.
We confirmed global sum settlement at $2,300.00 (all in).

Attach DV for your necessary actions.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 2:27 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: TP 1138/11/17_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFV 449C & SJE 773H ON 16/11/2017

Hi, Zaini
Please close at $2300.00

Thank you
regards

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 1:53 PM

To: xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: TP 1138/11/17_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFV 449C & SJE 773H ON 16/11/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Your Ref: TP 1138/11/17
Our Ref: CC4/AIG17022350/T1ka3

Dear May,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFV 449C & SJE 773H ON 16/11/2017
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$$ 2,270.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: 19 December 2017 17:18:09 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: 'Xinya Auto Services'

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: sje773h estimate

Hi May,
COR I/s $2000, 5 days.
Please forward the after repair photos, thank you.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 November 2017 2:12 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Subject: RE: sje773h estimate

Afternoon, Taufikh
Can give $2000.00 I/s

Thank you

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2017 2:03 PM




To: 'Xinya Auto Services' <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: sje773h estimate

Hi May,
Attached revised estimate.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 28 November 2017 5:11 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Subject: sje773h estimate

Hi, Taufikh
Estimate as attach
Thank you

Regards
may
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