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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*YP1703T (C0459916)

 [SLT6500L]
 TP

 SL GREASE CONTROL PTE LTD
 Nov 16 2017 4:00PM

 [CHEN LILY]
 Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

  
 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 22/02/2018 11:03 AM.
To   AXA_SG; cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg
CC   Zaini@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com

Subject   <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLT6500L (OI : AXA - C0459916) and YP1703T (TP : LKK
REF - CC4/AXA17022314/Gka3) on 16.11.2017

 
Your Ref: C0459916
Our Ref: CC4/AXA17022314/Gka3
 
Dear Cynthia,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
The accident occurred when our insured was moving out from parking lot and collided onto TP vehicle. As
such, liability is down against our insured driver.
 
We did clarify with insured driver the nature of the accident and she's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
 
We seek your approval to offer to third party repairer, KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP is as follows: -
 
 Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  5,316.90 $  4,173.00
2. Loss of Use (2days x $200.00) $     400.00 $     200.00 (2 days x$100.00)
3. LTA / GIA Search Fee $         5.35          $         5.35

Total $  5,722.25 $  4,378.35
 
**Recommended 4 repair days.
 
For your approval in Merimen please.
 
Best Regards,
Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; Zaini@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 30/11/2017 01:57 PM
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLT6500L (OI : AXA - C0459916) and YP1703T (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17022314/Gka3) on 16.11.2017
 
Dear Cynthia,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
As per instruction, we will proceed direct settlement for this case.
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,


