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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Boyogan, Joane <Joane.Boyogan@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 2:11 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Your ref: 9117305839SG *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17022242/Upa3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SLK 2740J(OI-LCR) & SLT 1274Y(TP) ON 11/11/2017]

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Have reviewed the damage on 3P vehicle and it’s more onto its left hand side (rather than the its rear portion) 
which is not consistent with the 3P’s sketch plan as appended below. Do we have any scene photos from third party 
showing it was head to rear? If none, then please maintain your offer of $400/- (all-in). 
 

 
 
Thank you 
 
 
Regards, 
 
Joane Boyogan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120 

Tel +65 64191898 
joane.boyogan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 

 
 
AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. 
Click here to find out more 
 
 
Follow us: 

    

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
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The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the 
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and 
any copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any 
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, May 17, 2019 12:31 PM 
To: Boyogan, Joane 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your ref: 9117305839SG *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17022242/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 
2740J(OI-LCR) & SLT 1274Y(TP) ON 11/11/2017] 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Your ref: 9117305839SG 
Our Ref: CC6/LCR17022242/Upa3 
 
Dear Sirs,  
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2740J(OI-LCR) & SLT 1274Y(TP) ON 11/11/2017 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party driver reported that he was driving along Claymore Hill. Traffic was slow moving. Suddenly OID 
who was traveling behind his car came and hit the rear of third party vehicle. 
 
OID reported that he was turning left from Draycott Dr into Claymore Hill. Suddenly third party swerved into 
his lane and third party rear left side grazed onto OID right front bumper.  
 
Both parties had given a conflict of version and there was no concrete evidence (video footage/ scene 
photos) to support either version. We have offered up to a global sum of $400.00(~60% basis) towards third 
party. However third party insisted for $600.00(all-in) as their client adamant that he is not liable. 
 
The summary of claim is as follows : - 
 

  Our offer Third Party Proposal 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 428.00 

G/S $600.00 

2. Loss of Rental (2days x $79.95) $  159.90 

3. Loss of Income** (2days x $50.00) $  100.00 

 $  687.90 

@60% $  412.74 
4. LTA/ GIA search fee $      5.35  

Total $  418.09 

Global Sum $  400.00 

 
**Third party driver is a Grab Driver. 
 
In view of the above, we seek your instruction in order for us to proceed further. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


