Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 2:22 PM

To: '‘Ng Wai Yin'; 'Jasmine Tan'; claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: AAD1709-199_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 9530Y AND SH 7304K ON
18/09/2017

Attachments: RV Il SHB9530Y 18092017.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

YOURREF |TP VEH NO. DOA PP/ LS COR DAYS Counter Propose RENTAL

AADIT09-199 (SHBE 95320Y 18/9/2017 P/P 5 660.00 2 2 3 77.39

Your Ref: AAD1709-199
Our Ref: CC3/11117022191/Kka3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 9530Y AND SH 7304K ON 18/09/2017
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we confirmed on the global sum settlement at S$ 470.00 (all in)

Kindly refer to the attached DV above and forward your DV in ORIGINAL HARDCOPY via post for our necessary
action.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 29 January 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TRANS-CAB BULK SETTLEMENT ON 25/01/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jasmine,




We refer to our previous bulk settlement on 25.01.2018.

As requested, enclosed copy of our insured’s CCTV footage above for your reference.

Thank you.
YOUR REF TP VEH NO. DOA PP /LS COR DAYS Counter Propose RENTAL
AADI709-199 |SHE 9330Y 18/9/2017 P/P 5 660.00 2 2 5 ¥7.39

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 26 January 2018 10:45 AM
To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TRANS-CAB BULK SETTLEMENT ON 25/01/2018

Hi All,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed a list of cases settled during the bulk settlement for your easy reference.

Hi Wai Yin,

In order to expedite the claim process, please kindly forward the rest of the LOD to us for our necessary action.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)




