
Reierence No , CVtlVhL t ,lr,+r.ltI=im No.
From (person) :

Daie/Time :
mgtq

TYPE; M.cai' / M. cycre / Bus / Van / Lorry/ Taxi / prime Mover / Tiuck / Trairer oi.V'ehicle No : gsH q3gt;' _ D.o.A/As A.t xlelr+

Ir\TL.J I

--

Regisiration Daie:
^^--uuc txpiry Date:

LTA. Total Rebate Amount:

Prioriiy 
f.i.iGRFJtA.L / URGENT

''JgIgllro-S
.ta lel >ol8

ll'l OPS:Yes / No DOA:

KCT:

MV: g

NEW CAR pRtCE:$

MV:$ )ck-jlKeuore by-: MqfCqg
FS:$ Date

q\/.c(coE



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particu lars
Owner lD Type :

Owner lD
*1

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported

lntended De-registration Date

Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour

Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassis No.

Maximum Power Output

Open Market Value

Original Registration Date

First Registration Date

Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

!ntended PARF Rebate Details
:

PARF Elieibility .

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount

Singapore NRIC

5510D

5JH9389J

Yes

20 Nov 2017

TOYOTA

CAMRY 2.4 AUTO ABS AIRBAG

Black

2oo8

2AZEt741.t8

MR0538K400702g53r

123.0kW (164bhp)

$27,261.00

28 Aug 2008

28 Aug 2008

3

$27,261.00

Yes

27 Aue2OtB

$13,530.00

DoA; ,qlttq
r r\sK)
!'/

COE Expiry Date

COE Category

COE Period(Years)

QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount

Totat RebateAmount

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Nov 2017

27 Aue2OtS*---
B - Car (1601cc & above)

10

$13,890.00

$1,067.00

$t4,6g7.O0

Tar
70'.

OK



From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Monica,

Veron Chen (LKl(Auto)
Tuesday, 21 November,2017 10:32 AM
'Monica Chung'; SUR
RE: Market value of SJH9389J

The market value for SJH 9389J is S20K-S22K (EST) as at Aug 20t7.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-43L5

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue \,#OZ-25 | 5(408933)

From: Monica Chung [mailto: fUonica-Chung@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Monday, 2O November, 2017 10:35 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market value of SJH9389J

Dear both,

Ptease tet us have the market vatue of this vehicte, accident on 29l08/17 soon.

Thanks.

Regards,

Monica Chung
Assistant Executive, Ctaims Services (Motor)
Direct tine +65 65942552 | Direct fax +65 62257402 | monica chunq@sq.msis'asia.com
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