Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 10:20 AM

To: '‘BHAS - Janice Koh'; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh; BHAS - Kelvin Lim; BHAS - Bernard Kee

Cc: Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLJ 8531L,0Our Ref: CC4/11117022137/Kwa3,Accident involving Vehicle
SLJ 8531L & SH 9564M on 11/11/2017

Attachments: SH 9564M.mp4; Sketch Plan .pdf

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLJ 8531L
Our Ref: CC4/11117022137/Kwa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SLJ 8531L & SH 9564M on 11/11/2017
We refer to the above matter

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Your client
exiting from slip road should give way to our Insured which was travelling straight.

We attached herewith our insured’s accident report and accident video for your perusal.
Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim.

As such, we will close the matter at our end.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: BHAS - Janice Koh [mailto:janice.koh@bhauto.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 28 November, 2017 5:59 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Kelvin
Lim <kelvin.lim@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Bernard Kee <bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>
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Cc: Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLJ 8531L,0ur Ref: CC4/11117022137/Kwa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLJ 8531L & SH 9564M
on 11/11/2017

Dear Vivian,
Can | request for your insured video to be send over to us?

Thanks
Warmest Regards,

Janice Koh

(W) 6559 8944 ext 108 (F) 6269 2404

(HP) 9159 3399

(Add) BIK 1 Sin Ming Industrail Estate Sector ¢ #01-111-113-115-117 Singapore 575636
janice@bhauto.com.sg http://www.bhauto.com.sg

A BH AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2017 05:38 PM

To: BHAS - Janice Koh <janice.koh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS -
Kelvin Lim <kelvin.lim@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Bernard Kee <bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>

Cc: Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: SLJ 8531L,0ur Ref: CC4/11117022137/Kwa3,Accident involving Vehicle SLJ 8531L & SH 9564M on
11/11/2017

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLJ 8531L
Our Ref: CC4/11117022137/Kwa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SLJ 8531L & SH 9564M on 11/11/2017
We refer to the above matter

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate
either's parties version. Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) to support your claim

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 8625

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



