Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Steven Tan <rvsallied@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 10:37 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: PC704Y_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 1398P AND PC 704Y ON
14/11/2017

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Zaini,

Kindly let us have the DV. Thanks.

Regards
Steven

On Mon, Mar 26, 2018 at 10:33 AM, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: TP/PC704Y/00022
Our Ref: CC4/ASM17022121/Spa3

Dear Steven,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 1398P & PC 704Y ON 14/11/2017
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$ 8,500.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



