Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 December, 2017 4:13 PM

To: 'Elaine Cheong'

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB8686C & SJK9047E ON 12.11.2017
INS/IC/LAW/0609/2017 DIRECT SETTLEMENT (CLAIM REF: DM17H002532-EC)

Attachments: LKK Survey Photos.pdf; Survey Report_Total Loss.pdf; PARF_COE REBATE.pdf; SKB

8686C vs SJK 9047E - TP VIDEO.MP4

Your ref : DM17HO02532-EC
Ourref : CC4/EQI17022104/T1pa3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK9047E(OI) & SKB8686C(TP) ON 12/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured driver beat red light and collided with third party who has the right
of way. Liability is down against our insured driver.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
We seek your approval to offer to third party claimant "Seow Poh Cheong" at $42,000.00.

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed | Amount Revised

1. Total Loss Value $ 49,293.34 $ 42,000.00
Total | $ 49,293.34 $42,000.00

**Please be informed that third party claimant will get Lawyer to assist fo claim Loss Of Rental fogether with
injury claim.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 11:43 AM

To: 'Elaine Cheong' <elaine.cheong@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB8686C & SJK9047E ON 12.11.2017 INS/IC/LAW/0609/2017 DIRECT
SETTLEMENT (CLAIM REF: DM17H002532-EC)

Your ref: DM17H002532-EC
LKK ref: CC4/EQI17022104/T1pa3

WITHOUT PRE]JUDICE
Dear Elaine,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a third party direct settlement case.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKB 8686C
Date of survey: 20/11/2017
We have not authorized repairs.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132.
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 November, 2017 10:12 AM

To: 'Elaine Cheong' <elaine.cheong@eginsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB8686C & SJK9047E ON 12.11.2017 INS/IC/LAW/0609/2017 DIRECT
SETTLEMENT (CLAIM REF: DM17H002532-EC)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elaine Cheong [mailto:elaine.cheong@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 20 November, 2017 9:34 AM

To: 'assignments'

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB8686C & SJK9047E ON 12.11.2017 INS/IC/LAW/0609/2017 DIRECT
SETTLEMENT (CLAIM REF: DM17H002532-EC)

Importance: High

Our ref : SJK9047E

TP ref : SKB8686C

Policy No. : DMPPHQ17-005386
Dear All,

Please refer to the email below.
Kindly proceed to survey the third party vehicle.
We enclosed the following documents for your perusal:

® Insured, SJK9047E — GIA report
® PRSrequest, SKB8686C — GIA report

Please acknowledge receipt. Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong

eq

EQ Insurance Company Limited
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Lawrence [mailto:lawrenceteo@tanchong.com]

Sent: Thursday, November 16, 2017 10:16 AM

To: Elaine Cheong

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB8686C & SIJK9047E ON 12.11.2017 INS/IC/LAW/0609/2017 DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

Importance: High

Dear Office In Charge,

Our customer, MR SEOW POH CHEONG the owner of SKB8686C is insured with AlG Insurance at the material time
of the accident. The 3rd party SUK9047E is insured with you at the material time of the accident.
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Our customer holds your insured driver liable for the accident and would like to claim against your insured driver. On
behalf of our customer, we hereby enquire whether you would like to have a Direct Settlement with our customer.

Our customer's claiming for Cost Of Repair and Loss Of Rental @$150/Day.GIA Report / Estimate attached for your
action.

Owner will get Lawyer to assist to claim Loss Of Rental wef 12.11.2017 base on DOA. Kindly send down surveyor
and Liability let me know asap.

Best Regards,
Lawrence Teo

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd

913 Bukit Timah Road

Singapore 589622

Tel: +65-64667711 :: DID: +65-67038914 :: Fax: +65-64697472
Email: lawrenceteo@tanchong.com

Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.nissan.com.sg




