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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL B256 3581 FAX 62564315

Reg. No 1GG607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0807198-R

‘Affiliated to Fadaration Internationale Des Exper's En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref © CCB/CTI17022068/M1zb3
SPR i%f&ﬁ%mgmmpom 079909 Dete: -20:11:2017 Il"“”l“l“lw
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJJ 57004 Veh. Inspected CB 6757P
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 2011172017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Cordition
NMake & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 10/11/2017 Inspection Date 171172017
Survey held at CHEONG CHEONG MOTOR SERVICE PL
BLK 5032 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-293
SINGAPORE 568535
Sa. Remarks i
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TQO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




r

CHEONG CHEONG MOTOR SERVICE PTE LTD
BLK 5032 ANG MO KIO IND. PARK 2 #01-293 SINGAPORE 568535
TEL - 64814152  FAX . 6481 4157
e-mail . c2Zmsvc@singnet com.sg

Our Ref = 0579/1172017 Page = 1
Date : 17112017

MiS - CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
3 ANSON ROAD #15-00
SPRING LEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 075909

ACCIDENT REPAIR ON : CBETS57T P - SUNLONG
POLICY NO :
DATE OF ACCIDENT D1oMrz0T

APPENDED BELOW ARE THE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR & PARTS TO BE REPLACED : -

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS 13 S$
1 FRONT RIGHT HEADLIGHT ~"586.00 SV
2 REAR BUMPER - 1.24000 T-
1,826.00
LABOUR CHARGES :
3 KNOCKING PUSH OUT FRONT ACCIDENT PARTS .
STRIP / REFIT ABOVE ACCESSORIES 300,00
4 SPRAY PAINT ON FRONT ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS 25D _sso00

N W mf\ﬂ

Page 1



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 2:44 PM

To: Shu Pel (LKKAuto); Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Ceo: Alfred Toh; Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settiement - Accident Involving SJJ5700J (O : SNM17D06527/C02/0) and
CB6757P (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI17022068/M12zb3) on 10.11.2017

Attachments: SNM17D06527C02 20171122-TO INSD-APPT LKK AS SETTLEMENT AGENT pdf:

MNA117148363-01-5JJ5700J.pd!

Importance: High

Dear Shu Pel &/or Zayyer,
Please refer to the attachments.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jowyn Tay

Deputy Claims Executive

Motor Division

Ciaims Department

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleafl Tower

Singapare 079909

Co. Reg, No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6174

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Emall: claimsdept@sg cntaiping com
lowyn tay@sg cntaiping com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

T It ey ey e e e e R T T L R e LR S L L LR L Ll hl bl b FEEAEEEE

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whale or partial, Is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

T T I mmmmmmmM Iy e e e e S R R R R R R R R SR S R L LRl bl bbbl

(ER RN R R R R S )

From: Shu Pai [LKKALto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 20 November, 2017 5:45 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Joel Goh <joel. goh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay
<jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.comz>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) cvivianlau@lkkauto.com>;
Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving 5157001 (O1 : CAl - TBA) and CB&757P (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI17022068/M1zb3) on 10.11.2017



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jowyn,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle CB 6757P at M/s Cheong Cheong Motor Service
Pre Lrd.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for cur necessary action.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

- TP's GIA report

- Estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Is Zayyer and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pai| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

Phone! BIEE-0055 | email; shupei@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubd industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 8032-25 | 5{408233)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:/fwww.svmanteccloud.com
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Our Referance: SNM17D06527/C02/0
Date : 22 NOVEMBER 2017 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

JAREL ABD AZ|Z

BLK 25 25 TAMPINES STREET 34
#07-21 THE EDEN AT TAMPINES
SINGAPORE 529234

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ5700J) AND CB6757F ON 10 NOVEMBER 2017
ALONG BEDOK NORTH ROAD

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, CBBT5TP | is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to ¢ dminister the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation according?y.

Yours truly,

Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is raquired.)

CC - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Aftn ZAYYER

Ref CCB/CTITT022068/M 1203
Contact No - 68412409

via Emall zayyer@ikkauio com

CC  Agent - (AND444A) - META AGENCY PTE LTD

FO1LKKDS-2013









Jt_aI Irene {].KKAutu!

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 4:19 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: REMINDER: FOLLOW-UP : SNM17D06527/C02/0 (51 5700) ON 10.11.2017 /
CHEQNG CHEONG CB 6757P)

Attachments: FROM OI SJJ 57001.10.11.2017.CTL.MOV; INSPECTION PHOTOS.PDF

Dear oy Irene
Please proceed to negotiate the third party property damage claim at best possible terms.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

Diselaimer :

This message is confidential: its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, vither in whole or partial, is prohibited [f you are not the intended recipient of the message.
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailtoJoylrene @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 11:40 AM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: REMINDER: FOLLOW-UP : SNM17D06527C02/0 ( SJJ 5700) ON 10.11.2017 / CHEONG CHEONG CB
6757P)

Your Ref: SNM17D06527C02/0

Dear Alfred,




LETTER OF SATISFACTION

1/ WE B3 s Mt Shevics ~ HEREBY CERTIFY
[HAT THE REPAIR OF MY/OUR VEHICLE NO. <3g9sH7F
HAD BEEN CARRIED OUT  SATISFACTORY. AND | AGREED TO
DISCHARGE  THE  REPAIR  COSTS  ACCOUNT  FROM  CHEONG
CHEONG  MOTOR  SERVICE PTE  LTD FOR IHE  SUM  OF
§§ 4 s54-AL SHALL BE IN FULL SETTLEMENT CLAIM UNDER

THE SAID  POLICY  NO. Srm—

e
DATE - 574301 SIGNATURE

NAME

NRIC 1 A% Lyt




CHEONG CHEONG MOTOR SERVICE PTE LTD

BLK 5032 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2 #01-293 Smgapore 569535
Tel : 6481 4152 Fax 6481 4157
E-mail add : ¢2msve/@singnel.com Sg website : cheongcheong.com
Reg No : 201007833E

Attn - Motor Claim Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. CB6757TF AND SJJ 5700 ALONG
BEDOK NORTH ROAD TOWARDS TAMPINES ON 10/11/2017

We understand that your are the insurer of SJJ 5700J vehicle.
/We wish to inform you that my / our vehicle CB 6757 P have been completed
T

repairs to my /our satisfaction by
PTELTD. 1/We therefore propose to claim from your as follows :

1. Cost of Repairs Ss 950.00
2 Loss of Use/Rent (S$100.00 x 2 Days) S5 200.00
3. LTA Search Fee / GIA Reports S$ 535

$§  1,155.35

—_————

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you




Juz Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene [LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 21 April 2018 3:54 PM

To: ‘jarel 777 @singnet.com.sg’

Ce: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ 5700H AND CB 6757P ON 10/11/2017

LKK: CC6/CTI17022068/M1jb3

JAREL ABDUL JALIL BIN ABDUL AZIZ
Policy Holder

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING S1) 5700H AND CB 6757P ON 10/11/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
joyirene@|kkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter,

The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness{es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to
keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

® 8 ® & & & B

Please note that in case no conclusive evidence is being furnished by either party, we will proceed to negotiate for an
amicable settlement with the Third Party at equal liability.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: jovirene@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

1



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

-_____.__n._——_____

I/'We, ZHENG XING YUN SERVICE (“the third party claimant™) owner of CB&757P
(vehicle no.) hereby authorize CHEONG CHEONG MOTOR SERVICE PTE LTD
(“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or
loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle that was damaged pursuant to the accident which

occurred on 10/11/201% (date) along BEDOK NORTH ROAD (location) involving
vehicle no/s SJJ 5700J (“the accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop™.

I/We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the

driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

DATE = Jﬂc’Alf‘J




Folicy Mo ¢+ DMpeen3030761700 Claim Mo @ ONMLITDOES27/C02/0
Claimant : ZHENG XING YUN SERVICE
Amount i B81,155.35

SINGAPORE DOLLARS ONE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED FIFTY FIVE AND
CENTS THIRTY FIVE OHLY,

I/We agree to accept the above mentionsd amount to be paid to me/us in full &
Einal settlement of all claims, coota & disbursements for injurien / damages
sustained by me/us through an ascident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ho. : CB €7572
Insured Vehicle HNo. : 5)J 57007

Cate of Loss # 10.11.2017
Place of Accident 1 BEDOK NORTH ROAD

IN CONSIDERATICH of the payment mado to mo/us of the aferementlonsd pum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Inaured Name ¢ JAHEL ABDUL JALIL BIN ABDUL AZIE
Drivar Hame ¢+ JAHEL ADDUL JALIL BIN ARDUL AZIZ

from all claime, present or future in respect of all less; Injury or damage
gustained by mo/us arising cut of the said ac=ident.

I acknowledge that this payment iz made without admission of lisbility on the
part of CHINA TATFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.

(1) General Danmagos 58
{2} Cost of Repalr/Excess 8§ 950.00
(3} Loso of Use/Rental/Earning E§ 200.00
{8) CIA/Police Reporta/
Invootigation Results/Search Fees as 5.35
(£) Medical Reporta/Exponseo 85
(E) Burvey Feas/P,T, Fees 5%
(7} Cost including Disbursemant 5%
TOPAL . o o = p srncw 5 e 5 6 & & BE 1,155.35

Claimant Wame : ZHENG XING YUN SERVICE WRIC Ho 1 52917205 D

Slgnature
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Block 5032, Ang Mo Kio

ABAEDY Nk WER
Speciniing in Cars Painting, Welding Panal-

No.: 10886

15 Fa A P2 8]
OTOR SERVICE PTE LTD

ind. Park 2, #01-293 Singapore 568535

Tel: (65) G481 4162 Fax: [B3) G481 4157
Emall; c2mavc@aingnal.com.sg Website: cheongcheong. com

O YT i T a2

NI R T L
Benling. claims insurance & Towing

M E R+ T il
Serviess, Pick-Up Rental
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| and Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006528-2

Print Date/Time : 14 Nov 2017 / 15:49:21
Receipt Date/Time = 14 Nov 2017 / 15:48 21

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receaipt Mo, | ITNET-00000-171114-001463
Previous Receipt No.
SIN Item Description/ Amount GST  Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (58) (5%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SJJ5700J
As at 10 Nov 2017/17:25:00
Insurance Co. CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SJJ5700J
Enquiry Fee 500 0.35 536
20171114154715081457
Sub-Total 5.00 0.35 535
Total Before Rounding 500 0.35 535
Rounding Difference 0.00
Total Amount Payable 535
Paid By
2007 Credit Card, 5 35
Visa/MasterCard '
Total 5.35
Cash Change 0.00
Tendared Amaunt 535
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Autharity are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fes

may apply.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubl indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 43156

Reg Mo 189807168R GST Reg Mo 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Foderation Internationals Des Exparts En Automobils

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAFPORE 079309

Ref CCaCTINT022088/M1jb3g2

Date 18-12-2018

AR

Code: CTI
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJJ 57004 Veh. Inspected CBE75TP
Policy No. DMPCSN3030761700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM1TDOBS27/CO2/0 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 171112017
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model SUNLONG c.c 3800
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. LFZBDADEBBASO0LE0 Colour GREY/GREEN
Odometer 182280 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |21575R17.5 FALKEN 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre [21575R175 FALKEN 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21575R175 FALKEN 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |21575R17.5 FALKEN 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE QIS FRONT PD&T!DN
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/11/2017 |Inspection Date 17112017
Survey held at CHEONG CHEONG MOTOR SERVICE PL
BLK 5032 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-293
SINGAPORE 560535
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Warking Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industnal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL B258 3581 FAX G258 4315

Reg MNo: 19960T188R GST Reg, No 18-9607188-R Page Na.1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. CB 6757P
aty Description of Parts Condiion| | febmetety, | Qurdlusted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT RIGHT HEADLIGHT CRACKED 586.00 886.00
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 1,240.00
LABOUR
1.826.00 586.00
LABOUR
KNOCKING PUSH OUT FRONT ACCIDENT PARTS 300,00 300.00
STRIP /REFIT ABOVE ACCESSORIES
SPRAY PAINT OM FRONT ACCIDENT AFFECTED 480,00 350.00
AREAS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER
780.00 650.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,606.00 1.236.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 950.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC6/CT117022068/M1jb3q2
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DIBCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Repart s masls sabely fof ihe use and benefl of the Client nemed on the front pege =i this Meoort




