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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: " Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 November, 2017 10:27 AM

To: SUR; Birdie Ong Lay Hong

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0459274/GA127086, SGM 6319R
Dear Birdie,

The market value for SGM 6319R is $60K-$63K (EST) as at Nov 2017.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]

Sent: Friday, 17 November, 2017 12:00 PM ‘

To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityéervices.sg; LKK
Valuation <valuation@Ilkkauto.com>; admin@Ilbs-auto.com; kee@asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: birdie.ong@axa.com.sg

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0459274/GA127086

This mail is associated with :
SGM6319R (C0459274)
oD
Nov 2 2017 12:00PM
[NG AH ONG]
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to birdie.ong@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]

Sent by : Birdie Ong Lay Hong (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)
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‘l VRL Application

httrigf//vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDe...

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owﬁer ID Type
Owner ID

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported
Intended De-registration Date
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year
Engine No.

Chassis No,

Maximum Power Output
Open Market Value
Original Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

PAREF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date |
COE Category

COE Period(Years)

PQP Paid

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount

Singapore NRIC

1415H Dow: > lu \F}
(AxA)

SGM6319R

No

16 Nov 2017

NISSAN

SUNNY 1.6EXM

Beige

2006

QG16414916

JN1CFAN16Z0103337

81.0kW (108 bhp)

$11,148.00

25 Oct 2006

25 Oct 2006

1

$7,307.00

Forfeited

$0.00

240ct 2026

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$52,108.00 /

$46,575.00

$46,575.00 6 o é 1

The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Nov 2017

~—

T~ 11/16/2017, 3:38 PM



