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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 3:47 PM
To: Angeline Rajoo; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: VERY URGENT -SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA     ll    TKQP Ref: 

TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD, SJS 7619B
Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; SJS 7619B-LETTER.doc

Dear Angeline, 

 

Enclosed herewith SJE report (soft copy). 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

                   

 

 

From: Angeline Rajoo [mailto:angeline@tkqp.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 11:08 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: VERY URGENT -SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

 
DO ADVISE WHEN WE CAN RECEIVE THE REPORT…PLS REVERT URGENT. 

 

Best Regards 
 
Angeline Rajoo 
Partner 

________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Tan Kok Quan Partnership 

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 

T (65) 6225 9333 

D (65) 6496 9525 

F (65) 6225 0111 

E angeline@tkqp.com.sg 

W www.tkqp.com.sg  

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, please 
delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The 
sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission. 
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From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, December 18, 2017 11:48 AM 

To: Angeline Rajoo <angeline@tkqp.com.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

 
Dear Angeline, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

FYNA. Our Ref: CS1/LAW17021978/T1vb 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Angeline Rajoo [mailto:angeline@tkqp.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 18 December, 2017 11:46 AM 

To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

Importance: High 

 
From: Angeline Rajoo  

Sent: Monday, December 18, 2017 9:27 AM 

To: 'Catherine Chong' <catherinechong90.cc@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

Importance: High 

 
Morning Catherine, 

 

When can I receive the SJE report ? 

Please  revert urgently.  

 

Best Regards 
 
Angeline Rajoo 
Partner 

________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Tan Kok Quan Partnership 

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 

T (65) 6225 9333 

D (65) 6496 9525 

F (65) 6225 0111 

E angeline@tkqp.com.sg 

W www.tkqp.com.sg  
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This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The 
sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission. 
 

From: Angeline Rajoo  

Sent: Tuesday, November 21, 2017 9:10 AM 

To: 'Catherine Chong' <catherinechong90.cc@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

 
Morning Catherine, 

 

When can I receive the report as it was due on 1.11.17 according to our earlier letter. 

 

Best Regards 
 
Angeline Rajoo 
Partner 

________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Tan Kok Quan Partnership 

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 

T (65) 6225 9333 

D (65) 6496 9525 

F (65) 6225 0111 

E angeline@tkqp.com.sg 

W www.tkqp.com.sg  

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, please 
delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The 
sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission. 
 

From: Catherine Chong [mailto:catherinechong90.cc@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, November 17, 2017 12:11 PM 

To: Michelle Liew on behalf of Angeline Rajoo <michelleliew@tkqp.com.sg> 

Cc: Angeline Rajoo <angeline@tkqp.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

 

Dear Michelle,  

 

Received with thanks. 

 

Catherine  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

On 17 Nov 2017, at 10:54 AM, Michelle Liew on behalf of Angeline Rajoo <michelleliew@tkqp.com.sg> 

wrote: 

Hi Catherine 
  
As spoken, please find attached our letter of 10 October 2017 together with the supporting documents for 

your necessary action. 
  
Please let us urgently have the report, as there is Court mention on 21.11.17. 
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Thank you. 
  
Best Regards 
  
Michelle Liew 
Secretary 
For and on behalf of Ms Angeline Rajoo 
_________________________________________________________ 
  
<image001.jpg> 

Tan Kok Quan Partnership 
Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 
1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 
T (65) 6225 9333 
D (65) 6496 9569 
F (65) 6225 0111 
E michelleliew@tkqp.com.sg 
W www.tkqp.com.sg  

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has 
reached you in error, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or 
contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of 
Internet transmission. 
  

From: Michelle Liew on behalf of Angeline Rajoo  

Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2017 7:22 PM 

To: LKK (assignments@lkkauto.com) <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SJE - MC Suit No. 8977/2017 - LKK Ref: TBA ll TKQP Ref: TWK/AR/0966.17/aig/ml/PD 

Importance: High 

  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Ref: TBA 
  
Dear Sirs 
  
MC SUIT NO. 8977 OF 2017 – CLAIMANT: LOH MUN ONN 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 7619B & SKU 7705M ON 06.04.16 AT JUNCTION OF HILLVIEW AVENUE AND 

BUKIT BATOK EAST AVENUE 2 
  
Attached please find our letter dated 10 October 2017 for your urgent attention. 
  
Please let us have the report on an urgent basis. 
  
Best Regards 
  
Michelle Liew 
Secretary 
For and on behalf of Ms Angeline Rajoo 
_________________________________________________________ 
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Tan Kok Quan Partnership 
Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 
1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 
T (65) 6225 9333 
D (65) 6496 9569 
F (65) 6225 0111 
E michelleliew@tkqp.com.sg 
W www.tkqp.com.sg  

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has 
reached you in error, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 
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Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or 
contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of 
Internet transmission. 

<ltr 0966.17.pdf> 

<Repair bill + RI rpt 0966.17.pdf> 

<Survey report 0966.17.pdf> 


