12/7/2017 Mail - Naz@lkkauto.com

AlG Policy No: 2100489527-00000 ; SJL 332K D.O.A. 16/11/17 (OD
case)

Naz (LKKAuto)

Tue 21/11/2017 10:04 AM

Sent Items
To:Sim, Priscilla-LK (Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com) <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>;

Cc:Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;

Dear Priscilla,

| have received the assignment and will proceed with the investigation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Naz| Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 November 2017 6:32 PM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK (Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com); Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SIL332K - Mid-night accident collided onto stationary vehicle

Dear Priscilla
Contents of your email is noted.
Dear Naz

Please proceed to meet insured driver and obtain his recorded statement as per below email request
and also find out when he lost his driving licence.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK [mailto:Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 20 November 2017 3:18 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJL332K - Mid-night accident collided onto stationary vehicle

Hi Bryan
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Kindly conduct investigation whether drink driving involved and driving licence lost date.
Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Chang, Lois-KL

Sent: Monday, November 20, 2017 2:29 PM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY; Chong, Annie-PY

Subject: SIL332K - Mid-night accident collided onto stationary vehicle

Dear Priscilla,

Kindly advise the above OD claim any investigation require before we authorize repair.
Note: we have not authorize repair.

Regards,

Lois Chang
AIG

Motor Surveyor
Claims|AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 3000 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

lois-kl.chang@aig.com | www.AIG.com.sg

https://outlook.office.com/owa/?realm=Ilkkauto.com&exsvurl=1&ll-cc=18441&modurl=0&path=/mail/search 2/2



