Vic (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 April, 2018 5:06 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SLT 4468K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHF 616Y AND SLT

4468K ON 14/11/2017 LKK REF CC4/AXA17021902/Ahb3

Your Ref: CC4/AXA17021902/Ahb3 (SHF616Y)
Our Ref: SLT4468K

Dear Vic,

We refer to below email, we would like to counter propose below:

Repair cost $5457.00 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

LOU S 800.00 (8 days x $100) - Request including of 2 PRI & 1 Sunday; Request $100 per
day is due to NEW CAR.

LTA Search S 5.35 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

Total $6262.35

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Mon, Apr 16, 2018 at 4:19 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Su Wong,

We refer to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer a global sum of $6,100.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV then forward to us a copy together with the Final Repair
Invoice for payment processing.
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The above amount is to be made payable to MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 March, 2018 1:47 PM

To: 'MG Solution'

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLT 4468K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHF 616Y AND SLT 4468K ON 14/11/2017 LKK
REF CC4/AXA17021902/Ahb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Su Wong,



We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are in the midst of seeking mandate approval to our principal.

We will follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

N Save the Larth- Print only whetr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 2 March, 2018 1:43 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SLT 4468K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHF 616Y AND SLT 4468K ON 14/11/2017

Your Ref: CC4/AXA17021902/Ahb3 (SHF616Y)
Our Ref: SLT4468K

Dear Vic,



We refer to below, can we have a status of the claim?

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Dec 29, 2017 at 12:30 PM, MG Solution <mg3solution @ gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: CC4/AXA17021902/Ahb3 (SHF 616Y)
Our Ref: SLT 4468K

Dear Vic,

Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by POST.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.
Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

Su Wong
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre



#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Thu, Nov 23, 2017 at 11:38 AM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Heng,

Received with thanks.

We will look into the matter and will get back to you for an update.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: MG Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:mg3solution @ gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 23 November, 2017 8:47 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLT 4468K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHF 616Y AND SLT
4468K ON 14/11/2017




Morning Vic,

Please refer below drop box link for yourself explain.

https://www.dropbox.com/s/bhsdvldhSkkcek9/SLT4468K.MP4?d1=0

Thanks,

Best Regards,

Heng Yoke Hong(Ms)

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4(South Wing)

#02-03B Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel : 6744 4165

Fax : 6744 4604

Co. Reg. No. 201427944N

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2017 5:10 PM

To: MG Solution

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SLT 4468K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHF 616Y AND SLT 4468K ON 14/11/2017

Your Ref: SLT 4468K “WITHOUT
PREJUDICE”



Our Ref: CC4/AXA17021902/Ahb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHF 616Y AND SLT 4468K ON 14/11/2017

We refer to the above matter.

Our Insured Driver reported that he was not aware or no collision between both vehicles. Enclosed
herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with
our OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for
legal assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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