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' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
edil B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

e Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref :  CS/EGI17021735/T1gb

I
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 14-11-2017
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GEF 2442P Veh. Inspected GBD 8025A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBF2442P/SE/p| ~ |Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEE PEI LI Assign Date 1411112017
2 - Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3.l Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. i g e S : .- Description of Damages
5o : General Information : ?_
Accident Date  04/11/2017 Inspection Date

Survey held at BLK K PANDAN LOOP IND EST #01-12
Repairer GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD

Remarks

A) THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B) THE REPAIR ESTIMATE WAS NOT PRESENTED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION,
THE REPAIRER WAS TOLD TO PREPARE THE ESTIMATE.

C) ENCLOSED PLEASE FIND DAMAGED VEHICLE PHOTOGRAPHS.




51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UB1 INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: GBF2442P/SE/pl Date: 21-10-2017

Our Ref: CS/EGI17021735/T1gb

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBD 9025A

We thank you for the instruction on 13-11-2017

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 20-11-2017____ at the premises of M/s __ GOLDBELL LEASING
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S$ 2.558.08

Revised Estimate Amount : S$ 1,281.71

“Check” Items Amount : 5% 331.94

Market Value _ : 88 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 88 -

Nett Value . 8% -

Description of Damage: nearside

The vehicle sustained damages at the —

front o/s portion. = @ front
offsice

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
03 days of repair.

Yours faithfully

Mohamed Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



Survey Department Check List (Case Handler)

Re;erence No.: CS *ai‘-l 01'735/T|3b
Policy Type: OD /{P// TP RES / TL/ EVA

Admin

Case Handler

Typist

}: Case handler to make sure al! Information created by the assignment team are ACCURATE.

{1) Office Assign Form

C

OZ 600000000020

surveyor ( Taufikkh

Reference No.
Customer Code

Assign From

Assign Date

Veh No {inspected)

Veh No (insured)

D.0.A

Policy No

Claim No

insurance Authorisation (CA /REV/REP)
Report Type

Weekend Charges
Survey held at/Repairer
Excess

(1) Assignment Form

C

Z2 000 2 02 22200203220

=z

Vehicle No

Regn Manth/Year
Vehicle Type

Make & Model

Engine Capacity. (C.C)
Colour

Odometer. {Sp.Reading)

) Chassis No

General Condition
Steering

Brake

Modification {Modi)
Tyre 5ize

Tyre Make

Tyre Balance

‘Date of Inspection

Survey held
Des.of Damages +

(2) System - {Views/Merimen)

C

Damaged Vehicle Photographs Uploaded

(3) Workshop Estimate/Assignment Form

(2 K e BN o B o B

C

C

ALL Parts condition
Market Value for OD cases

Estimate Repair Cost for PRI (RSI, TMI, MSIG)

Days of repair

Finalised Amount

_Re-inspection Cases 1o Finalize within 5 Days
{4) System - {Views/Merimen)

Resurvey photo Upleaded

Check By: | Rtm | l(o[l

200¥ |

Case Handler Date

*C: Critical *N: Non-Critical

Y-Date

N-Date

Y-Date

N-Date

NENAAEA AR

\AAN VNN N

}: Case handler to make sure the surveryor completed all required information.

21/05/2014



Norrita {(LKKAuto)

From: Norrita (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 3:41 PM

To: ‘andyooilk@goldbell.com.sg’

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re : Confirmed Finalised Amount for Veh - GBD 9025A
Dear Andy

Confirmed Finalised Lump sum repair at $1,000.00 before GST with 3 working days.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Rita AB |

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 email: sur@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)



MNorrita (LKKAuto) ,

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) ,

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 3:01PM Tauﬁld/))

To: SUR

Subject: FW: PLEASE CONFIRMED FINALISED AMOUNT -GBD9025A

Attachments: GBDY025A-FINALISED.pdf; CIMG3418.JPG; CIMG3419.) PG: CIMG3420.JPG;

CIMG3421.JPG; CIMG3422.JPG; CIMG3423.JPG

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Andy Ooi Lee Keong [mailto:AndyOoiLK@goldbell.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 2:53 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto} <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: PLEASE CONFIRMED FINALISED AMOUNT -GBD9025A

Hi Taufikh,
Lump sum repair at $1000.00 b4 GST with 3 working days .

Thank & regards
Andy Ooi Lee Keong | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

G 0 LDB ELL Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

oot ENGINEERING pID: +65 6458 9596 | Tel: +65 6458 9596 | Fax: +65 6458 7172 |
Industrial Vehicles. Mobile; +65 8816 2798 | Web: hitp://www.goldbell.com.sg
20,000 Served. And Counting. Address: Goldbel!l Engineering Pte Ltd {Pandan)
Blk K, Pandan Loop Ind. Estate, #01-12 Singapore 128230

sales | Leasing | Financing | Insurance | Fuelcard | Advanced Fleet Management System



Ai Phing (LKXAuto)

From: Ai Phing (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 November, 2017 12:31 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: GBF2442P / TP : GBD9025A/LKK / DOA : 04.11.2017
Attachments: GBD 9025A. pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advise of GBD 9025A.

Best Regards,

Al Phing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 Novernber, 2017 10:10 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBF2442p / TP : GBD9025A/LKK / DOA : 04.11.2017

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not In workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkaunto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Survey Report {(ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) {mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Monday, 13 November, 2017 6:06 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com
Subject: Ol : GBF2442P / TP : GBD9025A/LKK / DOA : 04.11.2017

Dear Catherine,



r

Nivitha (LKK Auto)

. R
From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 November, 2017 6:06 PM
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com
Subject: OlL: GBF2442P /TP : GBD9025A/LKK / DOA : 04.11.2017
Attachments: GBD9025A - ESTIMATE n SAS.pdf; GBD9025A - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD (PANDAN).

ADDRESS : BLKKPANDAN LOOP INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-12
SINGAPORE 128230

PERSON TO CONTACT . ANDY QOI @ 6458 9596 / 8816 2798
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please note that our insured/insured driver has yet to e-file their SAS
Jor this accident and advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-
survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the
loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard
#034-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038385

DID- 65 6328 9154

Fax 656829 9247

Wabsite: www.ergo.cem.sg



Have you tried our new travel insurance product yet?
TravelProtect comes with comprehensive benefits at some of the most
affordable prices available in the market,

{ ERCO
M TravelProtect

Bl st Satery Re W BUY NOW

TrovePrgtect 7 sradri tion by ERGD eraxarn ¢ Foy (9




Cate: 13.11.2017
Our Reference: GBF 2442P/55/p|
Your Reference: GBD 9025A

Tor GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS] Acknowledgement

Vehicle For inspection: GBD 9025A
Insured's Vehicle: GEBF 2442P
Date Of Accident: 04.11.2017
We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on: 13.11.2017

ERGO

Sent via Fax

ar

Email

AndyQoiLK@goldbell.com.sg

in compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

* Ll Auto Cencutiqats plelfd

AIS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Ple Ltd LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
I1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service PS Priority Services

JPK 1P Knights Pte Ltd VAC Vicorn Ltd

v Qur Insured's driver has not reperted the accident to us todate.

vV |others: QFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Your request for inspection does not have your client’s GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

Your request for inspection daes not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly farward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest far direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

Prepared by: Q—&\ Pei Li 68299194 claims@ergo.com.sg
N
Signature: FAX : 68299247
Assessor use only: Workshop use only:
Assessor attended workshop on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time: Time
Inspactor:
Remarks: D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Our Inspection is on a without admission to llobiiity basis.



MFA217147489 / Falcon-Air Aulo Services Pte Lid - Pandan
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 07/11/2017 16:11

Your NCD will be affecied due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 07/11/2017 16:48

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by ihe Policyholder and/ar the Authorised Driver,

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wifful misrepresentation or witholding of mate|

repudiate policy ability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Farm by insurance companies is not an admission of pelicy liabitity on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

rial facts may allow insurance companies to

&. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of
Singapare(GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avaitable

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No

Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer
Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
far repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Palicy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

ACCIDENT STATEMEN]
07/11/2017 16:11

04/11/2017 08:30
CLEMENTI WEST AVE 2 BLK 722 CAR PARK
SINGAPCRE

DETAILS OF OWNVEHICLE T "
GBDY025A
PC LEASING
52986061M
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-94288126

NISSAN
URVAN-2.5 D {M)

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEMICLE

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

5092819527

LAM PAK YEAN
F7173476P

05/08/1972

OUTDOOR

17/05/2003

14 YEARS AND 5 MONTHS
MALE

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 11



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee cf the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicie Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle invalved in this accident?
Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Inciuding Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

i Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLANS

Attachment(s}

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audic recorded?

YES

COLLIDED INTO PARKED VEHICLE
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO
YES

NO

NO

YES
NO
NG

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicte Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)
Details of Witness

Name

Phone Number

Email Address

GBF2442P

Page 2 of 11



Sketeh Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Poticyholder and/or the Authorised Driver

3. Information provided must be as truthfyl and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation o7 withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy fiability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companias is nat an admission of policy liabitity on the part of the insurance
COmpanies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Managemaent Centre esta blished by the General Insurance
Associatian of Singapore [GIA} for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the iodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and 16 copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8, Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assouation of Singapore {"GIA") may/are permitted 1¢ collect, use,
disclose and/or pracess my personal data/personal information set out in this {form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Parsonal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurer(s} wha have insured
vehicles) invoived in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”}, the Insu rers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority {such as the police], for the purpose(s)
of :

(i} processing, handling and/or dealing with my ciaims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(i) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions ar responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv) administering my daims (inciuding the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices 1o me,
which could involve discicsure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopas/mail packages); and/or

(v} complying with applicable law in agministering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b} allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) inveived in this accident and the tnsurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
1o collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal information for one or more of the abave Purposes; and

(¢} my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or

agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, {or one or more of the above Purposes.

(d) my Personzl Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(&) the infarmation so collected under (8] above may be shared / disciosed:

(i) to aliinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controliing or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably reguired for the purposes stated, or

.
{ii} for complying with requirements under any regglations, laws or court orders.

PC LEASING

g
meEnE saT v ERResVeTRER L R
Policyhalder's Signature Driver's Signature Repor
Cate & Time: (!f driver is not the paiicyholder) Name
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 3 of 11



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

Y erg;{' §lene (_g"gf-@.u//' Liwdh
SF 2
pLic 721 Car fack

fr% Z;}

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Ay it /’fi}m’ﬁf’ med o BeL T2D  HDPE lar s /<

/?{& C%M(ﬁf/’ e St ,.f} :2 |

Af e pplckesty Mg paa, & wehicle  pp Gpr 2% P

Lk on  fo HE Fueg AE J—/raf/ﬂ( Swle  of g v Sl
7 v -~

N : P - 4 ;
tihfe Ay fnr&kﬁ?\?/q‘ o Leff Ldra ga vt of oy
7 7 ’ v

vetile
DECLARATION
I/\ﬁgﬂ\eclag&&mgng particulars are true in every r
G EEhy, Y
P ) o)
= Q_‘/—\ i
- =z i} W
kj \pmo )51_
T LT TP NS o
= v — . 5
Palicyholder’s Signature Drm Thre Reporting Centre PeMna:ure
Date & Time: {If driver is not the policyholder] Name:
Date & Time WRIC/EIN N
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GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD

LT : GOLDBELL = 10 Tuas Avenue 18 Singapore 638894

Tel: +65 6861 0007 Fax: +65 6861 3676 (Saies)

GPLPBEL}; ENGINEERING Fax: +65 6863 0425 (Service) +65 6862 1347 (Parts)
Industrial Vehicles. Website: www.goldbell.com.sg
Co. Reg. No.: 1980039636

20,000 Served. And Counting.
VEHICLE NO. : GBDS025A

DATE : 10/11/2017 MODEL NO. : NISSAN MICROBUS 3.0 4DR
CHASSIS NO. : JN1TG4E25Z20790491
TO : ERGO INSURANCE ENGINE NO. : ZD30279041K

ATTN : REG. DATE : 20/4/2011
OFFICE / MOBILE :
EMAIL ADDRESS : REF. NO. : GBE/SVC/SALES-

D.O.A.: 4/11/2017

FROM : GOLDBELL PANDAN POLICY NO. : 5092619527

ATTN : ANDY QOI CLAIMTYPE : TP CLAIM - ERGO INSURANCE
OFFICE } MOBILE : 88162798

WORKSHOP : BLK K PANDAN LOOP IND EST

FAX NO. :
#01-12 SINGAPORE 128230
SIN  PARTNO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY  LIST PRICE
1 FRONT BUMPER C/R P 1 $ 65460~
2 FRONT BUMPER SIDE LAMP RH ' 1 $ 90.70 ~
3 FRONT CORNER PANEL RH <X 1 s 535.50 X
4 HEADLAMPRH 7 A 1 $ 474.20 X
SUB-TOTAL $  1,754.40
PART LESS-30% $ 526.32
BALANCE $ 122808

LKK Auto Consuitants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

* To resurvey before/after Spray painfing

*Tp display damaged pari(s) during resurvey

. Pa-rts prces are subect to confrmation

. Thnfd Pafty survey is on a “Withoyt Prejudice” basig
« No iflegal modification(s) is alloweg

* Supplementary emis

; : I MUSt Be resy
15 Subject to fing' < ‘esurveyed ang

Approvai from Insyrance Company
A.dmowledged by Repairer

Signature:

Date;




GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD

G O L D B E L L 10 Tuas Avenue 18 Singapore 638894

Tel: +65 6861 0007 Fax: +65 6861 3676 (Sales)
- coset ENGINEERING Fax: +B5 6853 0425 (Service) +65 6862 1347 (Parts)

.. . Website: www.goldbell.com.s
Industrial Vehicles. g J

20,000 Served. And Counting. Co. Reg. No. 198003963G

SPECIAL-NETT ITEMS

1 FRONT DOOR COMPANY ADDRESS STICKER RH  ALC 1 3 30.00 ~

PARTS TOTAL : $ 1,258.08
LABOUR CHARGES § =2
1 TO REMOVE & REFIT DAMAGED PARTS, CUT, WELD, PANEL BEAT, 1 $ 550.00
STRAIGHTEN & REALIGN, ETC.
20 -

2 TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING FAULT 1 ] 100.00
3 TO PUTTY,CLEAN, SPRAY PAINT & POLISH, ETC AFFECTED AREAS 1 % 650.00
457&/
LABOUR TOTAL : $ 1,300.00

GRAND TOTAL : $ 2 558.08 >0

PREPARED BY : ANDY OQI

DATE / TIME : ?ol\1l|\,® [ 595

SURVEYOR : T - O)
- ) 4 AN
MOBILE NO. : Ay S5 I \ o3
OFFICE FAX NO. :
EMAIL ADDRESS Suyv (2 {Iandy o /Jrq..ébw\@ (b gants: com
EXCESS AMOUNT : =
]
REPAIR TYPE :  PART-BY-PART / LUMPSUM
AUTHORISATION : AUTHORISED / NOT AUTHQRISED
RE-SURVEY :  BEFORE PAINT / AFTER PAINT
NO. OF DAYS : S
REMARKS |

-

’ - ’_ ] "T
DISAFE | QA 29

STHC R

&




GOLDBELL

ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles,
20,000 Served. And Counting.

SPECIAL-NETT ITEMS

-

GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LFEY

10 Tuas Avenue 18 Singapore 638804

Tel: +85 6861 0007 Fax: +65 6B61 3676 (Sales) .
Fax: +65 6863 0425 (Service) +65 6862 1347 (Parts)
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg
Co. Reg. No.: 198003963G

1 FRONT DOOR COMPANY ADDRESS STICKER RH 1 $ 30.00
S/.a -39
PARTS TOTAL : $  1,256.08
LABOUR CHARGES 2o
1 TO REMOVE & REFIT DAMAGED PARTS, CUT, WELD, PANEL BEAT, 1 $ 550.00
STRAIGHTEN & REALIGN, ETC.
SO
2 TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING FAULT 1 $  100.00
3 TO PUTTY.CLEAN, SPRAY PAINT & POLISH, ETC,AFFECTED AREAS 1 $ 650.00
460
LABOUR TOTAL : $  1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL : §  2,556.08
L-$3¢

PREPARED BY

DATE f TIME :
SURVEYOR :
MOBILE NO. :
OFFICE FAX NOQ. :
EMAIL ADDRESS :

EXCESS AMOUNT
REPAIR TYPE
AUTHORISATION
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GOLDBELL

ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles.
20,000 Served. And Counting.

>

GOLDRELL ENGINEERING PTE L.‘FEIB

10 Fuas Avenue 18 Singapore 638894 - ‘
Tel: +65 6861 0007 Fax: +G5 6861 3676 (Sales)
Fax: +65 6863 0425 (Service) +65 6862 1347 (Parts}
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg

Co. Reg. No.: 198003863G

»

VEHICLE NC. : GBD9025A

DATE : 10/11/2017 MODEL NO. : NISSAN MICROBUS 3.0 4DR
CHASSIS NO. :  JN1TG4E2520790491
TO : ERGO INSURANCE ENGINE NO. :  ZD30279041K
ATTN : REG. DATE : 20/4/2011
OFFICE / MOBILE :
EMAIL ADDRESS : REF.NO.: GBE/SVC/SALES-
D.OA.: 4/11/2017
FROM : GOLDBELL PANDAN POLICY NO. : 5002619527
ATTN : ANDY OOI CLAIM TYPE : TP CLAIM - ERGO INSURANCE
OFFICE / MOBILE : 88162798
FAX NO. : WORKSHOP : BLK K PANDAN LOOP IND EST
#01-12 SINGAPORE 128230
PART NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY  LIST PRICE

SIN
1
2
3
4

FRONT BUMPER 4¥R -~

FRONT BUMPER SIDE LAMP RH "™ e

FRONT CORNER PANEL RH R
HEADLAMP RH 7

1 $ 654.60
1 $ 90.70
1 $ 535.50
1 3 47420
SUB-TOTAL 3 1,754 .40
PART LESS-30% $ 526.32
BALANCE : ¥ 1,228.08
Tug-3v-30%
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Fy L7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mdin IS B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

n Automoblle . -

: Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exp !
ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref :  CS/EGI17021735/T inbe2

fov 1 SIATES ToNER AR
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 17-01-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBF 2442pP Veh. Inspected GBD 9025A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBF2442P/SE/pl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEEPEILI Assign Date 13/11/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition.~ - . = .00 inoni
Make & Mode!  NISSAN URVAN ot i 2053
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. JN1TG4E25Z0790491 Colour WHITE
Odometer 238877 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3, . .. Conditions of Tyres - ,
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195R15 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
4. _ -~Description of Damages < /.
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, ‘ a - “General Information - - gy
Accident Date  04/11/2017 Inspection Date 20/11/2017
Survey held at BLK K PANDAN LOGP IND EST #01-12
Repairer GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
5a. . e Y100 Remarks: = .
A) THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B) THE REPAIR ESTIMATE WAS NOT PRESENTED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION.
THE REPAIRER WAS TOLD TO PREPARE THE ESTIMATE.
C) ENCLOSED PLEASE FIND DAMAGED VEHICLE PHOTOGRAPHS.
5b. 24 Estimate Day§ ofRepair Caksin B

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 8025A

: Description of Parts a;g =],
Qty P % kshop ($))|
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER CRACKED 654.60 654.60
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE LAMP RH MISSING 90.70 80.70
1|FRONT CORNER PANEL RH TO REPAIR SEE 535.50 -
LABOQUR
1|HEADLAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 474.20 -
LESS 30% DISCOUNT ‘ -526.50 -223.59
1,228.50 521.71
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT DOOR COMPANY ADDRESS STICKER RH (SN)  |[NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
30.00 30.00
LABQUR
TC REMOVE & REFIT DAMAGED PARTS, CUT, WELD, 550.00 300.00
PANEL BEAT, STRAIGHTEN & REALIGN, ETC. INCLUSIVE
OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT CORNER PANEL RH.
TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING FAULT. - 100.00 30.00
TO PUTTY, CLEAN, SPRAY PAINT & POLISH, ETC, 650.00 400.00
AFFECTED AREAS.
1,300.00 730.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,558.50 1,281.71
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION . , : '
Report Ref No. CS/EGI17021735/T 1nbe2
| ‘2‘
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAL, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser




