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ASSIGNMENT

From

SR

| TP RES | OD RES/EY

Estimated Cost

Yah Mo

SkSTUIB v 24 Mar 29[S
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' V'l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
g 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
g TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref ;. CS/EGIT021602/Gtb
NIRRT
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 13-11-2017
SINGAPORE 038885
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBF 5116L Veh. Inspected SKS 7T11B
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBF5116L/SE/sa Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SITI Assign Date 1311/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/10/2017 Inspection Date 13112017

Survey held at

TRANS EUROKARS PTELTD

NO 5 UBI CLOSE
SINGAPORE 408605

Sa.

Remarks




51 UBLAVE L, #1-25 PAYA UBLINIMUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 48933 TEL : (065) 62363361 FAX ; (065) 62564315

Your Ref: GBF5116L/5E/sa Date: 15/11/2017
Our Ref: CSIEGHTO21602/Gth

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKS T11B.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle

on _ 14/ at the premises of M/s ___Trans Eurokars and have the following

to report;-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 11,551.16

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 7.848.74

“Check™ Items Amount - 5% 563.22

Market Value - 5% -

I.TA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value . S% -

Description of Damage: ——

The vehicle sustained damages = e

At front portion. [ ' § -
—ree——ae——

Repair days: 5 Days offakde

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor



Catherine Chunﬂ (LKK Auto) — = ) —

From: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman <siti.ranman@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 November, 2017 11:32 AM

To: Catherine Chang (LKK Aute) (admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Subject: Ol: GBF 5116L | TP: SKS 7118 | LKK | DOA: 31.10.2017 - PRS | OUR REF:
GBF5116L/5E/sa

Attachments: PRS FORM.pdf; YOUR REF: GBF5116L / OUR REF: 5K5711B THIRD PARTY CLAIM

(REQUESTING FOR S... (553 KB)

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to be the
“single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and to try finalise with the repairer on the repairs.
(Note: Our insured has yet to lodge the accident report to us).

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form and return to us together on your update of the survey status.
Attached are the necessary documents for your further actions.
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

NOTE: Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports / Survey
Reports.

hank you

From: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg '[maiIt-:::jessifmncis@eumkars.cnm.sg]

Sent: Monday, 6 November, 2017 2:16 FM

To: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman; eric.pau@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg; kevin.lee@eurokars.com.sg; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.); admin-
d@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: GBF 5116L | TP: S5K5711B | DOA: 31.10.2017 - OUR REF:GBF5116L/SE/sa

Hi Sitti,

We choose LEK Auto for this case.

kindly arrange the necessary.

Thanks & regards.



Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claim Executive
TRAMNS EUROKARS PTELTD

5 Ubi Close
Singapore 408605
DID: +6563957874

From: Siti A Thikah AB Rahman [mailto:siti.rahman@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 November 2017 5:09 PM

To: Eric Pau <eric.pau@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis <jess.fra ncisi@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Vion Lim <vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg>; Siew Guek Catherine Chua

<catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg>; Kevin Lee <kevin.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte.
Ltd.) <Survey Reportfergo.com.sg=
Subject: Ol: GBF 5116L | TP: SK5 7118 | DOA: 31.10.2017 - OUR REF:GBFS116L/SE/sa

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

wWe refer to your email below.
Attached our template for your input.

Kindly let us have your reply.
Thank you

\Warmest regards

Siti A'thikah

Claims Department
ERGO Insurance Pie Lo
5 Temasek Boulay

ERGO s dne of the maior insurance graups in Germany and Eurcpe. Worldwide, ERGO 15 represented in more than Jbcountries

and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGQO is part of Munich Re (Group), ane of the w s leading risk o

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The informatian contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you ara not ihe intended recipient of this email communication, pleasa notify the sender by
replying 1o the emall and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this massage.

|Any views expressed in this email communicaticn are those of the Individual sender. ERGO Insurance Ple. Ltd, does nol represent, warrant of guaraniee
[that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGO Insurance Pte, Lid. assers copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. Mo part may be reproduced by any process or for any
purpese withaul prior written parmission

From: eric.pau@eurokars.com,sg [mailto:eric. pau@eurokars,com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 November, 2017 12:01 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: ronald.yap@eurckars.com.sg; vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg; catherinechua@eurokars.com.sa;
kevin.lee@eurokars. com.sd

Subject: YOUR REF: GBF5116L / OUR REF: SKS711B THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY AND A
DIRECT SETTLEMENT)




YOUR REF: GBF5116L / OUR REF: SKS711B THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY
AND A DIRECT SETTLEMENT)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Kindly arrange the survey of our client’s vehicle.
Attached is the ESTIMATE, SAS REPORT, SKETCH PLAN for your perusal.

Liaise with Jess for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,

Eric Pau
Insurance Claims Officer

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605

D: (85) 6395 8685 H: (65) 9618 5991
E: eric.pau@eurokars.com.sq

This email, including any attachment, is infended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information
that is confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received il in error, please notify us immediately by reply
amail and then delete this message from your system. Please do not copy if or use it for any purpose, or disclose its confents or
any aftachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: mazdacanon@mazda.com.sg [mailto:mazdacanon@mazda.com sg)
Sent: Friday, November 3, 2017 12:10 PM

To: Eric Pau <eric.pau@eurokars.com.sg=»

Subject: Attached Image




Drate:
Our Refarence:

Your Reference:

Ta:

03.11.2017

GBF5116L/5E/s8

SK57118B

EUROKARS GROUP OF COMPANIES

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement
Vehicle For Inspection: SK5 7118

Insured's Vehicle:

Date Of Accident:

We acknowledge

GBF 5116L

31.10.2017

receipt of your request for PRS on:

02.11.2017

ERGO

Sent via Fax

or

Emall
EriC. pau@eurokars. Com.58

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Am endment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked ®.

*  LKKAUTO

AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pue Lid LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pte Lid
A5 Infiniti Appraisal 5ervice LKK LKE Auto Consultants Pre Ltd
JPK JP Enights Pte Ltd PS Priority Services

VAL Vicom Lid

YV |our Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Your reguest for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
Your request for inspection does not have your client’s GIA report, kindly farward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upen receipt of estimate.

vV |owers:  We are therefore not in a position to discuss on liability at this juncture.
Prepared by: /rj\- I"ljl Ij_é Siti G6B29 9170 claims@ergo.com.s
signature: i i FAX : 6829 9247
fssessor use only: Workshop usg anly:
Ass nded works iH
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time; Time
Inspoctor:

Remarks:

D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessar presence far the abeve job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Our Inspection is on a without admission to liability basis.




VRL Application

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner D Type

Chwner 1D

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported
Intended De-registration Date
Wehicle Make

Vehicle Maodel

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year
Engine Mo.

Chassis Mo.

Maximum Power Output
Open Market Value
Original Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

COE Category

COE Period(Years)
QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount
Total Rebate Amount

Singapore NRIC
&385G

SK5711B

No

15 Nov 2017

MAZDA

MAZDAZ 4-DOOR SEDAN 1.5L SPAEAT
Grey

2015

P520267606
JMEBMAZABGD303570
88.0 kwW (118 bhp)
$17,507.00

24 Mar 2015

24 Mar 2015

9]

$7.507.00

Yes
23 Mar 2025
$5,630.00

23 Mar 2025

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$64,700.00

$47,585.00

$53,215.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Nov 2017

hitps:iivrl.lta.gov.sgiltalvrlfaction/enguireRebateByPublicBeforeDereginput? FUNCTION _ID=F0304008TT

1"



TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

{ i" J) NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605 (%) ELROKARS GRC
mazpa QUOTATION
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. MAME : Mr Erik Low Kim Lee WIP : 42082
3 Tamasal Boybevard ADDRESS : Bk 212 Jurong East Street 21 EXCESS :
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five #70-289 DATE: F+-Nov-17
Singapore 032935 Singapore 600212
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL: 96356716
FAX :
VEH NO : SKS711B DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : JESS 6385 7874
CHASSIS NO : JMEBMAZABGO303570 | MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : MAZDA3 1.5L DATE REG.: | 24-Mar-15  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description
NO ary REVISED PRICES
y |rronTBumeer L~ CoA 1 MBHR3-50-0318B8 s 1,031.70
2 |[RETAINER(RHS), FRONT BUMPER " 4€7( 1 MBHN1-50-0T1F $ 18.70
3 |BRACKET(RHS), FRONTBUMPER & (. 1 MBHN1-50-152 $ % 1510
2 [FrRONT REINFORCEMENT X Jiren 1 MB45A-50-070A $ ' 444,50
5 |GROMMET, FRONT BUMPER .~ 2 MGHPS-50-0Z5 5 5.40
& |CLIP, FRONT BUMPER e Akt 12 MC274-50-133 $ 4200
7 |easTENER, FRONTBUMPER ~~ | 2 MBA5A-56-146A 5 5.60.
8 |GRLLETOP .~ [ 1 MBHN1-50-033 27 $  33500-
9 |RIVET,GRILLETOP .~ i 6 MS515-51-833 s 22807
10 [RIVET,GRILETOP 7 |77 4 MTK21-50-355 § 3480
11 |BRACKETTOP, GRILLE 4 NIV 1 MBHN1-50-7170 S 102.40
12 |cHrROME(RHS), FRONT BUMPER .~ (A 4 MBHN1-50-71A $ 17670
13 [GRILLE:BLACK (GLOSS) 77  ¥Wh 1 MBJE1-50-7128 $ 58160
14 |MaAsCOTFRONT 77 'SA 1 MC235-51-731A $ 4 4420
15 |BRACKET(RHS), GRILLE X NIV 1 MBHN1-50-153 S 15.10
16 |PIN LOCATOR, GRILLE 7 / 2 MEDA5-50-1K54A s 5.48 |~
17 |GROMMET, GRILLE < H A 2 MKD45-50-E51 $ 5.40
18 |RIVET, GRILLE | 2 MEAD1-50-037 3 15.20
19 |FASTENER, GRILLE 7 8 MGD7A-50-EA1 s 2400
20 |BONNET _~ f 1 MBHY0-52-31XA $ 1,067.307
51 |WEATHERSTRIP, BONNET o« [Lf] * 1 MBHNI-56-770A 5 63.50.
22 [HesoLameres ~ 6 . 1 MBHTE-51-031A s 2,245.007
23 |cup HEADLAMP X [ A 2 MFB01-50-133C 3 7.60
24 [RIVET, HEADLAMP i 1 MEB0S2-51-833 5 3.30
TOTAL PARTS $  6,312.40
LESS 10% $ 63124
TOTAL PARTS COST $ 568116
Labour Description
SKS7118B Page 1 of 2



TO REELACE FRONT BUMPER, FRONT REINFORCEMENT, GRILLE TOP AMD BONNET
MZ-BR-FRONT4 |oepair ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT. $ 126000 |5 2,520.00
MZ-SP-SERTO4 |TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, FRONT REINFORCEMENT, GRILLE TOP AND BONNET $ 1,500.00|3% 2.400.00
MZ-BR-CAVITY |TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION, s 150.00 | & 250.00
MI-BR-ELECTR |T0) CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING 5 150.00 | 5 250.00
MI-BR-REPROG [TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS $ 18000 | 5 350.00
MZ-BR-SUNDRI [SUNDRIES. v 5 20,00 | & 100.00
TOTAL LABOUR $ 3,260.00 | $ 5,870.00
TOTAL PARTS § 458874 |5 5,68L16
TOTAL § 7,848.74 |5 11,5516
LESS EXCESS 5 = 1% y
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS $ 7.848.74
GST 7% $ 549418 -
GRAND TOTAL $ 8,398.15 | % -

REMARKS: SK57118
5 REPAIR DAYS (exclude preparation of estimate, walt for survey/authorization/spare parts, sat/Sun/PH|

SKST11B Page 2of 2



N

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

e e

NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605
maxDa FINALISED COST OF REPAIR
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. MAME : Mir Erik Low Kim Lee WIP : 42082
5 Temasek Boulevard ADDRESS : Bkl 212 Jurong East Street 21 EXCESS :
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five #20-289 DATE: 3-MNov-17
Singapore 038985 Singapore 600212
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL : 96356716
FAX :
VEH NO : SK57118B DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : IESS 6395 TET4
CHASSIS NO : JMEBM42A8G0203570  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : MAZDAS 1.5L DATEREG.: | 24-Mar-15 |POLICY NO.:
NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description
NO ary REVISED PRICES
1 |FRONT BUMPER 1 |MBHRA3-50-031BB8 S 1,03L.70| 5 1,031.70
7 |RETAINER{RHS), FRONT BUMPER 1 | MBHN1-50-0T1F 5 1870 |5 18.70
3 |BRACKET{RHS), FRONT BUMPER 1 |MBHN1-50-152 5 15.10
4 |FRONT REINFORCEMENT 1 MBASA-50-0704 $ 44450
5 |GROMMET, FRONT BUMPER 2 MGHPS-50-025 5 540 | § 5.40
& |CLIP, FRONT BUMPER 12 | |MC274-50-133 $ 42,00 | ¢ 42,00
7 |FASTENER, FRONT BUMPER 2 MBASA-56-1464 s 5.60 | 5 5.60
& |GRILLE TOP 1 IMBHN1-50-033 27 § 335005 33500
9 |RIVET, GRILLE TOP 6 'M5515-51-833 § 22805 22.80
10 |RIVET, GRILLE TOP 4 | MTK21-50-355 5 34.80 | & 34.80
11 |BRACKET TOP, GRILLE i | |MBHN1-50-717D $ 10240
17 |CHROME(RHS), FRONT BUMPER 1 ! |MBHN1-50-711A $ 17670 |3 17670
13 |GRILLE:BLACK [GLOSS) 1 | IMBJE1-50-T12B S5  SBLED
14 |MASCOT,FRONT i | IMIC235-51-731A 5 44,20
15 |BRACKET(RHS), GRILLE i |MBHM1-50-153 L 15.10
16 |PIN LOCATOR, GRILLE 2 | IMKD45-50-1K5A $ 540§ 5.40
17 |GROMMET, GRILLE 2 | MKD45-50-E51 $ 540 | 5 5.40
18 |RIVET, GRILLE 2 | |MEAQ1-50-037 5 15.20 | & 15.20
15 |FASTENER, GRILLE 8 MGD7A-50-EAL 5 23,00 | 5 24.00
20 |BONMET 1 | MBHY(-52-31XA $ 1,067.30| 5 1,067.30
21 |WEATHERSTRIP, BONNET 1 | |MBHN9-56-770A 5 63.60 | 5 63.60
27 |HEADLAMP RHS i | MBHTE-51-0314 § 2,24500 | 5 2,245.00
23 |CLIP, HEADLAMP 2 |MFBO1-50-133C 5 7.80
24 |RIVET, HEADLAMP 1 IMBOG2-51-833 & 3.30
TOTAL PARTS 5,098.60 | § 6,312.40
LESS 10% 509.86 | 5 631,24
TOTAL PARTS COST 4,588.74 | § 5,681.16
Labour Description

SKST711B Page 1 of 2




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
"""' TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 193607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref . CS/EGI17021602/Gtbn2
NV
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 20-03-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBF 5116L Veh, Inspected SKE 7118
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBF5116L/SE/sa Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From S Assign Date 131117207
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDAZ c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JMEBM42ABGO303570 Colour GREY
Odometer 34260 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60R16 TOYO & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 TOYO 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 TOYO & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 TOYO & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/10/2017 Inspection Date 14/11/2017
Survey held at TRAMNS EUROKARS PTE LTD
NO 5 UBI CLOSE
SINGAPORE 408605
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TQ YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR! 5 Working Days




/4

174 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘-J‘. =‘- ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 1996071%8R GST Reg. No. 19-9607158-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKS 7T11B
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | Stme Y {‘;3]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER cuT 1,031.70 1,031.70
1|RETAINER (RHS).FRONT BUMPER MNECESSARY 1B8.70 18.70
1|BRACKET (RHS),FRONT BUMPER NOT NECESSARY 15.10 =
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 444,50 i
2| GROMMET FRONT BUMPER MECESSARY 5.40 540
12|CLIP FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 42 00 42.00
2|FASTENER.FRONT BUMPER NECESSARY 5.80 580
1|GRILLE TOP cuTt 335.00 335.00
6|RIWVET GRILLE TOP NECESSARY 22.80 22.80
4|RIVET,GRILLE TOP NECESSARY 3480 34 B0
1|BRACKET TOP,GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 102.40 -
1|CHROME (RHS) FRONT BUMPER cuT 176.70 176.70
1|GRILLE BLACK (GLOSS) NOT NECESSARY 581.60 -
1|MASCOT, FRONT NOT NECESSARY 44 20 -
1|BRACKET (RHS),GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 15.10 -
2|PIN LOCATOR, GRILLE NECESSARY 5.40 5.40
2|GROMMET GRILLE NECESSARY 5.40 5.40
2|RIVET, GRILLE NECESSARY 15.20 15.20
8|FASTENER,GRILLE NECESSARY 24.00 24.00
1|BONNET BENT 1,067.30 1,067.30
1|WEATHERSTRIP, BONNET cuT 63.60 63.60
1|HEADLAMP RHS CRACKED 2,245.00 2,245.00
2|CLIP HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 7.60 -
1|RIVET HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 3.30 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -631.24 -509.86
5681.16 458B8.74
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN NECESSARY 100.00 20.00
100.00 20.00
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LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER FRONT 2,520.00 1.260.00

REINFORCEMENT GRILLE TOP AND BONNET REPAIR
ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.

T RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, FRONT 2,400.00 1,500.00
REINFORCEMEMNT, GRILLE TOP AND BOMMET.
TO CARRY-0OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION 250.00 150.00
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER 250.00 150.00
FUNCTIOMING.
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR 350.00 180.00
WORKS

& 770.00 3,240.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,661.16 7.848.74
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 1 | 7,848.74)
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XING GUO QIANG ADRIAM LING WAI PING
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Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser
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