Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 January, 2018 7:56 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; SUR; 'AU LEE TYNG'

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Gerald,

The market value is $85K (Est) as at March 2017.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 15 December, 2017 1:20 PM

To: 'AU LEE TYNG' <ltau@lonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Lee Tyng,

Kindly provides us a copy of LTA rebate.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: Friday, 15 December, 2017 1:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Hi Veron,

Please request from Au Lee Tyng

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 15 December, 2017 12:55 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; AU LEE TYNG; SUR

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Gerald,

Kindly provides us a copy of LTA rebate.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 9:24 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'AU LEE TYNG' <ltau@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for your email.

Dear Veron,



Kindly assist. Our Ref: CS1/LPC17020854/Cvbs2

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 9:19 AM

To: AU LEE TYNG <ltau@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>
Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Lee Tyng,

We shall check with LKK.

Aside to LKK - Dear Catherine
Kindly provide them with the market value.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: AU LEE TYNG

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 9:16 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Gerald,

The survey did not let us the market value of the vehicle.
Thanks and regards,

Au Lee Tyng

CLAIMS DEPTMENT | LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
T:03-2723 7718 F: 03-2034 2654 EMAIL : ltau@lonpac.com

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Wednesday, 13 December, 2017 2:20 PM

To: AU LEE TYNG

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P
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Dear Lee Tyng,

Attached copy of survey report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: AU LEE TYNG

Sent: Friday, 20 October, 2017 10:31 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Gerald,

Will courier the adjuster report colour photos to your goodIsef.
Thanks and regards,

Au Lee Tyng

CLAIMS DEPTMENT | LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
T:03-2723 7718 F: 03-2034 2654 EMAIL : [tau@lonpac.com

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Friday, 20 October, 2017 10:29 AM

To: AU LEE TYNG

Subject: FW: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Lee Tyng,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Friday, 20 October, 2017 9:29 AM

To: AU LEE TYNG

Cc: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'

Subject: RE: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Lee Tyng,



For our surveyor to render their opinion on the repair costs,
we require the colour photos as well.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: AU LEE TYNG

Sent: Friday, 20 October, 2017 9:17 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: SECOND OPINION FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5148 P

Dear Gerald,

Refer to the above.

Please assist assigned adjuster’s for second opinion and revert to us as soon as possible.
Pls take note we will courier the adjuster report to your goodself for second opinion.
Thanks and regards,

Au Lee Tyng

CLAIMS DEPTMENT | LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
T:03-2723 7718 F: 03-2034 2654 EMAIL : [tau@lonpac.com




