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I B V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
L : "" : 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
A TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCHT020691/5gb
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 sl ” ””“H”H"H”H mm
Code: FCI2
14 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 0B83H Veh. Inspected SKE 8323J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D17010011MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  CWS (SITHARA) Assign Date 30/10/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  24/10/2017 Inspection Date
Survey held at EUROKARS HABITAT PTELTD
NO.12 SUNGE| KADUT AVE
SINGAPORE 729648
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BlIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




First Capital Insurance Limited B

A FAIRFAX Company

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

25-10-2017 Qur Ref No. D17010011MFSH
24-10-2017 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCOB883H Third Party Vehicle. SKE8323J

12 SUNGEI KADUT AVENUE
RICK TEO
63602445/ 0 Fax No. 63602829

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

A Fax No. 684168315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

EUROKARS LEASING
FTE LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

Attention. NIL

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

Miain Office : & Fafles Quey #21-00 Singapare 048580 Tel: 656222 2311 Fax: 658222 3547 Websia: www.lirel-insurance com.sg
Claims Departments & Motor Underwriting Department : 36 Robinson Road #1601 City House Singapore DBBATT Tel 65-6507 3848 Fax: B5-6507 3848




1073042017

Claim Workflow Systam

Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/229475) _-— PRI Documents (4] l Close ¥
PRI Header Details
Claimant
Claim No 01701001 1MFSH Policy No D-15072702MFSH S.No & 1 & EUROKAR.
Name
o f‘T"DP‘DKARS EEABING FITE f:':fl";n 12 SUNGEI KADUT AVENUE
e D | e e st e o, | Mobile: 0, Phone: 63602445 , Faxi 63602899
bl it ersen - g Emailld: RICKTEO@EUROKARS.COM.SG
TEQ) Details
| Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS | Instructions -
WITHO P DICE: WE ADMI T QUANTUM
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor VT EREM TR R
Insured Insured ey
CITYCAB PTE LTD SHCOBE3H Vehicle SKEB323]

Name Vehicle No No

PRI Surveyor Surveyor

Recieved 26-10-2017 06:52:41 PM Appointed 30-10-2017 02:19:22 PM Accept 30-10-2017 0

Date Date Date

Survey Report Upload

Surveyor I_ Surveyor :E :.'::: T

Inspection — Rapdrt Datd 30-10-2017 Racipt L _g_!}_q_q_;g_fgle_

Date *: S .

Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥ Model | Please Select Model ¥ | Year | Select Year ¥
Chasis No I Engine No I Mileage |
Cubic
ko 1 Capacity |—
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

Save

https:/ificlaims.com:8001/ClaimWS/Surveyor/Details 229475

112



Ai Phing !LKKAuto!

From: Ai Phing (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 November, 2017 5:06 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'

Cc: SITHARA@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17010011MFSHM
Attachments: SKE 8323J.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advise of vehicle SKE 8323,

Best Regards,
Ai Phing | Case Handler
LEKK Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-2561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
# Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 30 October, 2017 2:28 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: SITHARA@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.5G; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17010011MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

'lease be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg]

sent: Monday, 30 October, 2017 2:19 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG; SITHARA@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17010011MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1
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51 UBLAVE 1, #00-15 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065] G253 FAX : ((h5) 62564315

Your Ref: D1701001 1MFSH Date: 02-11-2017

Our Ref: CS/FCI17020691/5gb

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SKE 8323 "

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 01-11-2017 __ at the premises of M/s ___EUROKARS HABITAT and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 14.348.46
Revised Estimate Amount : S§ 7.341.48
“Check™ Items Amount . S8 5.356.98
Market Value (5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value (5% -
Nett Value (5% -
Deseription of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages = e
at the rear portion. f | ! T
Oy
offsige

Yours faithfully

Sebastian Yeang
Automotive Assessor



STUTTGART AUTOD L
NO:12 SUNGEI KADUT AVE (S) 729648 (FAX NO. 63602899)
ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIRS
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD NAME - Mdrm Lim Kiau Mo WIP 28699
30 ROBINSON ROAD ADDRESS : Bk 364 Tampines Street 34
#16-01 CITY HOUSE #09-133 DATE 25102017
SINGAPORE 068877 Singapore 520364
ATTN. MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT _|TEL
EAX 55073849 .
VEH NO SKE#8323J DATE IN - CONTACT PERSON RICK | 53602445
CHASSIS NO WP1ZZZ95ZFLB50350 _ |MILEAGE TYPE OF CLAIM TP AGAINST SHCE83H
MODEL . Macan S DATE REG | 11112014 |POLICY NO
MNATURE QOF Wm
SINO Parts Description (NETT)
aTy PART ND PRICES
1 |Pg5B-807-417-D -G2X/BUMPER ( < 1 PG5B-807-417-G -G2X $ 77470
2 |SPOILER v-—Dfaceed | 1 P95B-807-521-M -1EQ $§ 25130
3 lcover ~ 07 1 P95B-807-834- -1ED $  167.60
4 |DAMPING PARTLH v ™ME< 1 PA5B-805-885- - $ 3180
5 |DAMPING PARTRH ¥ ME¢ 1 PG5B-805-885- - g 31.80
§ |BRACKET 7 N 1 PBRO-807-313-0 - $ 29840
7 |P95B-945-725-E -/REFLECTOR REAR (LEFT) v %k 1 P95B-945-725-L - §  269.60
]
B P95§—253-E1 2-AY-'/REAR MUFFLER & . 9 [ 1 P95B-253-612-0%- $ 183070
9 |REARMUFFLER '~ /I 1 PY5B-253-611-AY- $ 189070
10_|ExHAausTPIPE ' 1 P95B-253-487- Y- § 146620
11 |HEXAGON NUT SRR 4 PN -023-003-16- 3 3.204
12 |{WB15) CLAMPING SLEEVE EXHAUST SYSTEM v »* 4 P958-111-220-10- $ 30560
13 |TAIL PIPE OUTERLH i 1 Pg5B-253-681-D - $ 20280
14 |TAILPIPE 7/ BT 1 PY5B-253-681-C - $ 20260
15 |LENS-HEAD SCREW NEC PS99-073-5%4-01- 3 17.60
16 |HEXAGON-HEAD BOLT ME PN -106-620-01- $ 4.00.
SUB TOTAL $ 7.809.40
LESS 10% ] TEO 94
Total Parts $ 7T.,028.46
Labour Description
1 |TO REMOVE / REPLACE REAR DAMAGED $  2.800.00
BUMPER & OTHER AFFECTED BODY PARTS e
INCLUDING PANEL BEAT / STRAIGTHEN BODY PANELS
& FITTINGS WHICHEVER NECESSARY INCLUDING
ALIGNMENT OF BODY STRUCTURE
IRty
2 |TO 5SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER 3 1°380.00
3 |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEM FOR PROPER MNETT ] 250.00
FUNCTION ABILITY INCLUDING PARKING ASSIST
SENSORS
.-:Iélf"(
4 |TD REMOVE / REPLACE EXHAUST SYSTEM INCLUDE |5 2100000
CHECK FOR LEAKAGE.
5 |TO RE-PROGRAMMED SYSTEM & ERASE FAULT CODES NETT [ 3 G00.00

Page 1of 2



AFTER ACCIDENT REPAIR

§ |FE-SUPPLYLBC NO PLATE $70.00 EA g

NETT 3 70.00

ot

7 |SUNDRIES L $ 10800
TOTAL LABOUR $  7,320.00

TOTAL PARTS § T.028.46

GRAND TOTAL $ 14,348.46

Please note that this is only an estimate  base on our visual inspection. However should there be any additional work be

found necessary in the course of repair and thus additional parts. materials and labar cost will be dasm necessany. you will

be infarm accordingly prior to any action taken. n view of this, expected delays will be indivertible and therefore additional
warking days will be required. As such the l0ss of use and other incidentals will be adjusted accordingly.

Preparad By

Acknowledge By
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LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify

the Repairer of the following:

= To meurvey betore/afies spray painting

» To display demaged pari{s) during resuréey

= Paria prices are subject to confirmation

o Third party survey is on 8 “Withou! Prajudice” basis
= Mo Bagal modification(s) i allowed

& Supplementary (bemis) must b resurveyed and
s subject io fnal approval from Insurance Company

Achromieged by Repaire:
Sighasure:
Dt

) X
L




STUTTGART AUTO
NO:12 SUNGEI KADUT AVE (S) 729648 (FAX NO. 63602898)

FINALIZATION COST OF REPAIRS

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD MAME - Mdm Lim Kiau Moi WIP 28699
30 ROBINSON ROAD ADDRESS: Blk 364 Tampines Street 34
#16-01 CITY HOUSE #09-133 DATE: 25.10.2017
SINGAPORE 068877 Singapore 520364
ATTN MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT __ [TEL:
FAX 65073849
VEH NO . SKER323J DATE IN: CONTACT PERSON : RICK | 63602445
CHASSIS NO WP1ZZZ95ZFLB60350 _ |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM TP AGAINST SHCA83H
MODEL Macan 5 DATE REG.. | 11.11.2014 [POLICY NO.:
RE OF Wi o
SINO Parts Description (NETT)
aTy BART NO REVISED PRICES
P95B-B07-417-D -G2X/BUMPER /= 1 PS5B-B07-417-G -G2X § 77470]|% 77470
2 |SPOILER ot | 1 Pa5B-B07-521-M -1EQ 5 25130 | $ 25130
3 |COVER el 1 PO5B-807-834- -1ED § 16760 |S  167.60
4 |DAMPINGPARTLH — M 1 P95B-805-885- - $§ 3180|% 3180
5 |DAMPING PARTRH 1 P95B-805-866- - 5 31801 % 31.80
6 |BRACKET WA 1 PERO-807-313-D - ] - |$ 20040
7 |P95B-945-725-E /REFLECTOR REAR (LEFT) ./ A 1 P9SB-945-T25-L - § 26960 (% 269.60
8 |P95B-253-612-AY-/REAR MUFFLER —) 1 PO5B-253-612-0Y- § 189070|% 189070
9 |REAR MUFFLER -‘[r" 5!' 1 POSB-253-611-AY- $ 189070 |5 189070
10 |EXHAUST PIPE T 1 P95B-253-487- Y- § 146620(5 1466.20
11 |HEXAGON NUT 2l 4 PN -023-003-16- $ 320|$ 3.20
12 |(WB15) CLAMPING SLEEVE EXHAUST SYSTEM - A1F¢ 4 P958-111-220-10- $ 30560 |% 30560
13 |TAILPIPEOQUTERLH =~ AT 1 P95B-253-681-D - $ 20260 (% 20260
14 |TAIL PIPE 1 P95B-253-681-C - & 202600% 20260
15 |LENS-HEAD SCREW AVEC 4 P999-073-504-01- % 1760 | 17.60
16 |HEXAGON-HEAD BOLT 4 PN -105-520-01- $ 400|5 4.00
SUBTOTAL|$ 751000]% 780940
LESS 10%| & 75100(§  780.894
Total Parts| $ 6.759.00|§ 7,028.46
La hgg! Eascrigiug
1 |TO REMOVE / REPLACE REAR DAMAGED $ 2100.00|% 2800.00
BUMPER & OTHER AFFECTED BODY PARTS
INCLUDING PANEL BEAT / STRAIGTHEN BODY PANELS
& FITTINGS WHICHEVER NECESSARY INCLUDING
ALIGNMENT OF BODY STRUCTURE.
2 |TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER $ 1,200.00|% 1400.00
3 |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEM FOR PROPER NETT § 25000|% 25000
FUNCTION ABILITY INCLUDING PARKING ASSIST
SENSORS,
4 |TO REMOVE / REPLACE EXHAUST SYSTEM INCLUDE $ 140000|% 210000
CHECK FOR LEAKAGE.

Page 1af 2




,\TO RE-PROGRAMMED SYSTEM & ERASE FAULT CODES NETT ] 600.00 |3 60000

AFTER ACCIDENT REPAIR.

TO SUPPLY 1 PC NO PLATE $70.00 EA NETT 5 70.00 1% 70.00

SUNDRIES. -] 50001 % 100.00

TOTAL LABOUR § 567000]% 7,320.00
TOTAL PARTS $ B75900|% T7,028.46
GRAND TOTAL § 12,429.00|% 14,348.46
GSTT7% L] B70.03
TOTAL AFTER GST § 13,299.03
NUMBER i RKING DAY, DE WAITING RVEY AUTH PARTS

SATURDAY,SUNDAY AND PUBLIC HOLIDAY

LOSS OF USE ; $180.00 X 8 DAYS = §1,620.00

LTA SEARCH : $5.35

Fage 2 of 2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 193607128R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R Page Mo..1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKE 8323J
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | &8 rkshup?:}} {:’,
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|P558-807-417-D-G2X/BUMPER CuT 77470 T74.70
1|SPOILER cuTt 251.30 251.30
1|COVER DEMTED 167.60 167 .60
1|DAMPING PART LH MECESSARY 31.80 31.80
1|DAMPING PART RH MECESSARY 31.80 31.80
1|BRACKET MOT NECESSARY 299 40 -
1|PO5B-945-725-E-REFLECTOR REAR (LEFT) CRACKED 26960 269.60
1|Pa5B-253-612-AY-/REAR MUFFLER BENT 1,880.70 1,890.70
1|REAR MUFFLER BENT 1,880.70 1,890.70
1|EXHAUST PIPE BENT 1,466.20 1,4686.20
4HEXAGON NUT NECESSARY 3.20 3.20
4|(WB15) CLAMPING SLEEVE EXHALUST SYSTEM NECESSARY 305,60 305.60
1| TAIL PIPE CUTER LH BENT 202,60 20260
1|TAIL PIPE BENT 20260 202 .60
4|LENS-HEAD SCREW MECESSARY 17.60 17 60
4 HEXAGOMN-HEAD BOLT NECESSARY 4.00 4.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -780.54 -751.00
7,028.46 6,759.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1| SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 50.00
1|NC PLATE (SN) cuTt T0.00 70.00
170.00 120.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE/REPLACE REAR DAMAGED BUMPER & 2,800.00 2,100.00
OTHER AFFECTED BODY PARTS.INCLUDING PANEL
BEAT/STRAIGHTEN BODY FPANELS & FITTINGS
WHICHEVER NECESSARY INCLUDING ALIGNMENT OF
BODY STRUCTURE.
TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER 1,400.00 1,200.00
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEM FOR PROPER 250.00 250.00
FUNCTION ABILITY INCLUDING PARKING ASSIST
SENSORS.

Report Ref No. CS/FCI17020691/Sgbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 19960T198R G3T Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Fage No..2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
ot Workshop §))| __ (5)

TO REMOVE/REPLACE EXHAUST SYSTEM INCLUDE 2,100.00 1,400.00
CHECK FOR LEAKAGE.

TO RE-PROGRAMMED SYSTEM & ERASE FAULT CODES, 600.00 600.00

7.150.00 5,550.00

GRAND TOTAL 14,348.46 12,429.00

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 12,429.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI170206891/Sgbn2

YEANG WAI KEEN ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor BE.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIADILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made soleky for the use and benafit of tha Cllant named on the front page of this Repor.




