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Catherine Chonﬂ_ (LKK Auto) _

From: Catherine Chang (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 12 May, 2018 4:15 PM

To: 'Charandeep Singh'

Cc: ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: PRI Assignment 73036 /CH/WP/Zhong Cheng Enterprise /OD :

SJF2008R /TP : 51J99437 / DOA : 06.10,2017

Dear Sir / Madam,

Please beinformed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts to inform the workshop to
present the vehicle,

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavallability of the owner, therefore we decided to
tempurarily close this case,

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8334 | email: assignments@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blic 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue i, #0225 | S{408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mallto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 6:21 PM

To: 'Charandeep Singh' <charandeep,singh@directasia.com>; assignments@lkkauto;com; 'Hsizo T ong (LKKAutg)'
<chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: "Aaron Wang' <aaron.wang@directasia.com>; 'Derrick Quok' <derrick@directasia.com>; ‘Kenneth Lim'
<kenneth@directasia.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: PRI Assignment 73036 /CH/WP/Zhong Cheng Enterprise /OD : SIF2008R /TP : 5199432 / DOA :
06.10.2017

Oear Charan,
Thank you for your emall,
Please be informed that we still pending appointment for survey with repairer,

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phome: 6741-8434 | omail: assienments@Ikkaute.com | fax: 62s56-4315
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avetipe 1, #02-25 | S(468043)

From: Charandeap Singh
Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 5 14 P

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'
<chewht@lkkauto.coms
Ce: Aaron Wang <aaron.wang@directasia com>; Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim
<kenneth@directasi >; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>




Nivitha (LKK Auto)
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From: Motor Claims <maotorciaims@directasia.com»
Sent: Thursday, 26 October, 2017 210 PM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc Aaron Wang; Dérrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Charandeep Singh
Subject: PRI Assignment 73036 /CH/WP/Zhong Cheng Enterprise /0D : SIF2008R /TP -
S$J19943Z / DOA : 06.10.2017
Attachments: 201710100942 pof

Dear Sir,
Please arrange to survey 5119943Z on the without prejudice basis.

Please conduct direct motor survey at the workshop below pre-repair inspection and update us immediately if the
repair cost is abgve S10K.

Zhong Cheng Enterprise

Blk 6 Woodlands Road 339) Yew Tee Industrial Estate
Singapere 678008

Tel: 9338 2859

Thank you.

Regards,
Claims Department

From: Cheonghoh Law [mailto:mail@cheonghoh.sg]

Sent: Thursday, October 26, 2017 11:29 AM

To: Motor Claims emotorclaims@diractasia.con>

Ce: Aaron Wang <aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia «com>; Kenneth Lim
<kenneth@directasia.com>; Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.cori>

Subject: [EXT] Re: FAX - PRS - 51199437 - DOA 6/10/2017: Dur ref: LCH.lg/WEBZC-708049.17

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter and to your email of 10 October 2017.

Our client hereby nominate LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd named in paragraph 2 of your serial no
3 of your said email to conduct the pre-repair survey of the damages to our client's vehicle arising
out of the above mentioned accident.

Please contact Ms Sini 9338 2859 from Zhong Cheng Enterprise, Blk 6 Woodlands Road 399
Yew Tee Industrial Estate, Singapore 678008 for the said inspection of SJJ 9943 Z.

Kindly proceed to do the needful.

Thanks & regards

Catherine

CHEONGHOH LAW CORPORATION
Blk 33 Chin Swee Road #03-05



Singapore 160053 -
T: 6337 8700 | F: 6337 3700 | E: mail{@cheonghoh.sg

On 11 Oet 2017, at 11:12 AM, Cheong Hoh Lee <mail@cheonghoh.se> wrote:
Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to your list of surveyors dated 10 October 2017.

Kindly hold on for this matter as your insured has vet to make accident report.

We will revert 1o you upon receipt a copy of your insured’s aceident réport.

Thank you,

Regards,

Melody

Cheonghoh Law Corporation
Bik 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05
Singapore 1680053

Tal: 6337 B700

Fax: 8337 3700

On Oct 10, 2017, at 11:46 AM, Motor Claims <mg aims@idirectasiz com>
wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: S1J9943Z
Our Ref: 73036/CH

To: Cheonghoh Law Corporation
Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05
Singapore 160053

Teél; 63378700
Fax: 63373700

Dear Sir,
We refer 1o your Notice of Aceident dated :06,10.2017

We intend toconduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your
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customer’s vehicle jointly with your elient/your motor workshop.
We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert:

STA Inspection Pte Lid

LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

DirectAsia Insurance internal motor surveyors
RT Appraisal Pte L1d

VICOM

S A s L b e

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the
appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint
expert.

Best regards
Claims Department

--—-Original Message-—-
From: Gloria Kwok
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 11:02 AM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@directasia.com>

Cc Aaron Wang <garon.wangi@directasia.com>; Demck Quuk
ia.com>; Kenneth Lim <ket

Subjoct‘ RE: FAX - PRS - 81199437 - DOA 6!1{2'!2017

Hi TF,
Cimed with law firm, Ol veh # is SIF2008R. TP is 81199437
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Gloria

——Original Message--—-

From: Motor Claims

Sent: Tuesday, 10 October, 2017 10:50 AM

To: Gloria Kwok

Ce: Aaron Wang; Derrick Quok: Kenneth Lim

Subject: FW: FAX - PRS - S1198437 - DOA 6/10/2017
Importance: High

Dear Glona,

We cannot find any record according to vehicle SFJ2008R, please assist to
check the vehicle number , thank you.

Best regards



Claims Department

——=-Original Message-—---

From; Gloria Kwok

Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 10:42 AM

To: Motor Claims <motorelaims/@directasia.com=>
Subject: FAX « PRS - §1J9843Z - DOA 6/10/2017
Importance: High

Hi TF.
For urgent PRS.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Glorna

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

This message is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may
contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised
use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended
recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform
the sender.

<201710100942,pdf>
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