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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Pang & Tan Michelle <pangtan_michelle@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 11:03 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE BILL FOR VEHICLE NO. : SJY9467C

Dear Celine 
 
We confirm to accept the COR at Lump sum $9,000.00 ( before GST) and 16 repair days. 
 
Thanks and Regards 
Michelle Tan 
 
On Friday, 9 July 2021, 09:14:47 am SGT, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Dear Michelle, 

  

Revised estimate is attached. 

  

Please confirm repair cost at LS $9,000.00 @ 16 days of repairs. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Pang & Tan Michelle <pangtan_michelle@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 10:43 AM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fw: ESTIMATE BILL FOR VEHICLE NO. : SJY9467C 
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----- Forwarded message ----- 

From: Pang & Tan Michelle <pangtan_michelle@yahoo.com.sg> 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <kennethkong@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020, 10:38:53 am SGT 

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE BILL FOR VEHICLE NO. : SJY9467C 

  

Dear Kenneth 

  

Please see attached resurvey photos for SJY9467C. 

  

Thanks and Best Regards 

Michelle Tan 

  

On Thursday, 6 December 2018, 11:32:46 am SGT, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <kennethkong@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

Hi Pang, we are still waiting for your resurvey photos for SJY 9467C. Kenneth 

  

From: Pang & Tan Michelle [mailto:pangtan_michelle@yahoo.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 16 March, 2018 10:12 AM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: ESTIMATE BILL FOR VEHICLE NO. : SJY9467C 

  

Dear Kenneth 

  

Please see attached Estimate. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards 
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Pang Yee Kong 

Pang & Tan Vehicle Service Centre 

160 Sin Ming Drive #04-03 

Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 


