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This mail is associated with :

  
*SLB309H (C0456027)

 [SKE5604T]
 TP

 HAZEL LEONG WAI YHEE
 Oct 17 2017 12:00AM

 [JAIN PUNEET MANGERAM]
 Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

  
 

 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 12/03/2018 10:20 AM.
To   AXA_SG; ernest.tay@axa.com.sg

Subject   RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKE5604T (OI : AXA - C0456027) and SLB309H (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17020209/zb3 ) on 17/10/2017

 
Dear Ernest,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Please be informed that insured had converted OD.
 
Please take note that NO survey done for this case.
 
In view of the above, we will proceed to close the file at our end without billing to your good office.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ
CC: AXA_SG; zayyer@lkkauto.com; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 12/03/2018 09:42 AM
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKE5604T (OI : AXA - C0456027) and SLB309H (TP : LKK REF - CC4/AXA17020209/zb3 )
on 17/10/2017
 

 

 
 
Hi Shu Pei,
 
Not reported.
 
Thank you.
 
 
With regards,

 Ernest
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; zayyer@lkkauto.com; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 13/11/2017 06:33 PM
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKE5604T (OI : AXA - C0456027) and SLB309H (TP : LKK REF - CC4/AXA17020209/zb3 )
on 17/10/2017
 
Dear Ernest,
 
Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
 
Thank you.
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Best Regards,
 Shu Pei | Admin

 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
<-- Original Message -->
From: LKK_HQ
 
To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; zayyer@lkkauto.com; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 07/11/2017 10:33 AM
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKE5604T (OI : AXA - C0456027) and SLB309H (TP : LKK REF - CC4/AXA17020209/zb3 ) on
17/10/2017
 
Dear Ernest,
 
Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
 
Please advice also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.
 
We will obtain OID's driving license for your perusal and consideration before proceed with direct settlement.
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zayyer and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,

 Shu Pei | Admin
 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

 Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
 There are no documents.
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