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Catherine Chona (LKK Autn!

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.coms
Sent; Wednesday, 25 October, 2017 2:41 PM

To: "Lim, Sheng Yang'

Subject: RE: TP claims / S7713172745G / GBE1612C

Dear Sheng Yang,

Please be informed that according to Kah Matar Co Sdn 8hd, this claim submit by Kah Motor Ubi Branch and will
survey by FormTearn.

We will clase this file at our end without billing:

Bést Regards,

Cp I:hurine- Chong | Adimin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-84/14 | email: gssignments@kKknutb.com. | fox: 6256-4315
BIk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Sl408933)

From: Lim, Sheng Yang [mailte:ShengYang.Lim@aig.com)]
Sent: Wednesday, 25 October, 2017 2:29 PM

Te: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP claims / 57713172745G [ GBE1612C

Hi Catherine,

According to FormTeam Adjusters, there’s no confirmation on change of workshop.

But according to doc in TP ¢laims, on'20/10/2017, there's a PRI request stated repairer Kah Motar Co Sdn Bhd, same
goes to the PRI we receive which stated venue at Mandai Service Centre.

Appreciate if you're able to assist to confirm on the correct repairer so that unnecessary claim can be cancel in
Merimen,

Thank you,
Best Regards,

Lim Sheng Yang

AlG

Claim Adjuster |l, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Services - Malaysia | Global Business Sarvices

A5 Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887191-D)

Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 198 Jalan Bukit Bittang, 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tal +5 03 2719 6000 | Ext 1012101 | Fax +& 03 2685 5898

ShengYang Lim@aig.com | wwiw. 2ig.com

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto;admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2017 1:20 PM

To: Lim, Sheng Yang

Subject: RE: TP claims / 57713172745G | GBE1612C



Daar Sheng Yang,
Moted with thanks,

Best Rigards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-84134 | email: gssienmente@IEkanto.com | fax 6256-4315
Bl< 51, Payn Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #oz-25 | 5{a08033)

From: Lim, Sheng Yang [mailto:ShengYang Lim@aiz com]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 October, 2017 11:48 AM

Te: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP claims / 57713172745G / GBE1612C

Hi Catherine,
Pending reply from FromTeam Adjusters, will update with you thereafter,

Thank you,
Best Regards,

Lim Sheng Yang

AlG

Clair Adjuster Il, Singapare FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Services— Malaysia | Global Business Services

AlG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887191-D)

Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 198 Jalan Bukit Bintang, 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tel +6.03 27196000 | Ext 1012101 | Fax +6 03 2685 5898

From: Cathefine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:ad
Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2017 10:39 AM

To: Lim, Sheng Yang
Subject: RE: TP claims / 5771317274SG / GBE1612C

Dear Sheng Yang,
Ay update?

Hest Regands,
Cantherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 67418434 | email: sssignments@ kkavto.com | fas: 6256-4315

Bl 55, Pavn Ubl Trdtstrial Park, Ubi Avetiue 1, #02-a5 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkaito.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 October, 2017 9:50 AM
To: 'Lim, Sheng Yang' <ShengYangLim@aig.com>

Ce: assignments@ikkauto.com
Subject: RE: TP claims / 57713172745G / GBE1612C



Dear Sheng Yang,
Please be informed that according to the repairer, owner not yet confirmed with them change workshop.
Kindly advise,

Best Regards,

Cotherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 67:41-8434 | emaill: sssignrmentsidlikaulocom | fok: 6256-44915
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | St4o8a1)

From: Lim, Sheng Yang [mailto:ShengYang Lim@aig.com|
Sent: Tuesday, 24 October, 2017 9:02 AM

Ta: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: assignments@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: TP claims / 57713172745G / GBE1612C

Hi Catherine,
Any update for this?

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Lim Sheng Yang

AlG

Claim Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Services — Malaysia | Global Business Sarvices

AlG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887191-D)

Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 198 Jalan Bukit Bintang, 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tel +8 3 2719 6000 | Ext 1012101 | Fax +6 03 2685 5898

RE: TP claims / 577131727456 / GBE1612C

Dear Sheng Yang,
Thank you for your email,
We will check with MCS Auto:

Best Regards,

Catherine Chiong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone! 6741-8434 | email; gsstirnmentd@lkisuwto com | fax: b258-4315
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, thl Avenue 1, oz-25 | S(aoBoaz)



From: Lim, Sheng Yang [mailto:ShengYang.Lim@aig.com]
Sent: Friday, 20 October, 2017 11:44 AM

Te: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TP claims / 577131727456 / GBE1612C

Dear Catherine,

Noticed that there are 2 TP claims in Merimen with different repairer. _
May | know is It change repairer from Mes Auto (HQ) to Kah Metor Co Sdn Bhd (Ubi)?

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Lim Sheng Yang

AlG

Claim Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Sarvices — Malaysia | Global Business Services

AlG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887181-D)
Menara Worldwide. Level 12, 198 Jalan Bukit Bintang, 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tel +6 032716 6000 | Ext 1012101 | Fax +5 03 2685 5898

ShenaYanyg Lim@aia.com | www.aig.com

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachmerits are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
thz recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Giroup, Ine. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" commeand and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
thz recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American Intemational
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.
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- FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED V... Pagelof ]

- FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED

VEHICLE GBE1612C AND SLLBO1BE ON 14/10/2017
From. Chin, Lee-Ying

To ‘asslgnments’, ‘Admin A’
Ca: Fang, Andy-SY
Sent  Thursday, 18 October, 2017 3:42:44 FM

Attachments. [ GRE161CPRLTIE

Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey.

Thanks,

Best Regards:

Lee Ying, Chin

AlG

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1947 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Lee-Ying Chin@alg com lwaww.alg com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

Tha information in this-smail (and any attachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipiant, you must not
use or disseminate the information, If you have recaived this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any coples dr printouts thereof, Although this email and any
sttachments are balievad la be fres of any virus or other defect that might affact any computer system into which it is
received and opaned, it is the responsibility of the recipient to-ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severaily, for any loss or
damags arising In any way from its use '

https://securemail.aig.com/securereader/read.jsf 19/10/2017
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CATHERINE UM LIS s 5 Bw eorporation
with fimitad Hahifey

Your Ref: GBE 1612C

Our Ref: CL/( T104R/T/MCS 55

19 Ociober 2017

AlG Ayin Pacific Insuranite Ple Lid

AlG Building Uiﬂ.fbl:ﬂlii?i‘?&.ﬂy}hnd

78 Shenton Way

o7-16

Singapore 079120

Ann: Motor Claims Departmient

Shermaz Interior Design Me Lid CERTIFICATE OF POSTING

508 Sims Ave (Pheasg be informed than nll supporting docimenta

Singapore 387570 have been forwirded th your insurer, )

Dhear Sir

RE: NOTICE TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO
FRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLATMS (NIMA)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 6018E / CBE T612C ON 14.10.2017 ALONG WOODLANDS CENTRE
ROAD TURNING MARSILING ROAD

We are instructed by Lim Teck Leng 1o notify you of a road traffic secident invalving our client's vehicle No, SLL
GD1BE and vehicle No. GBE 1612C driven by you a2 the material time, A copy of the Singapore Accident Staterment
and/er Police Heport is enclosed.

As 3 result of the accident. our client's motor vehicle has been damaged, Before our clicnt proceed to ropuir the
damaged motor vehicle, plense ket us know within 2 working dgvs of your reacipt of this notice whether youyour
insurer would like to conduct & pre-repair survey of the motor vehicle, If we do not receive any reply from yow'your
insurer within the stipulated timeline, our clicnt shall proceed to repalr the vehicle without further referénce to you.

Flesse let us know your appointed surveyor,

Venue: Mandai Servicy Centre
6A Mandai Estate
Singapore 729901

Cantact: Stephanie @) 6396 9939

ﬁmwy

oc: chients



