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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 12:33 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: KKLau; Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Simon Ho (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: PRE- REPAIR SURVEY OF FBJ741T 
Attachments: LKKInspection.pdf; LKKAdjustment1a.pdf

Dear Gerald, 
 
Our surveyor has review this case and enclosed the adjusted report. 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 January 2018 10:25 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Simon Ho (LKKAuto) 
<SimonHo@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PRE- REPAIR SURVEY OF FBJ741T  
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Our surveyor will review this case, if necessary will re-adjust to submit report to you 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: KKLau  
Sent: Friday, 5 January, 2018 9:54 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Simon Ho 
(LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: PRE- REPAIR SURVEY OF FBJ741T  
 
Hi Simon, 
 
Please check this case. 
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Regards, 
K K Lau 
LKK Auto Consultants P L. 
 

Sent from my iPad 
 
On 5 Jan 2018, at 9:32 AM, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 

  
Our Ref        : 16/17/17/VP05/020085 
  
  
Dear Mr Lau, 
  
The pre-repair survey was conducted by Sebastian Yeang.   
  
Thereafter, the third party workshop engaged Automax Survey  
to survey the vehicle and the recommended repair costs was 
$12,250.00. 
  
We then seek your surveyor’s opinion on the repair costs claimed 
by the third party workshop and this was further adjusted to $1,700.00 
on lump sum basis. 
  
In view of the discrepancy in the repair costs, it is very unlikely that the 
third party would accept your adjustment. 
  
Kindy let us have your views if any.  
   
  
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  


