Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 5:13 PM

To: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF); Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments
Cc: Cui Fen ENG (SPF); Lai Kuen LUI (SPF)

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey of SKZ 8910D (Upper range of Repair Cost)
Attachments: LKKInspection.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf

Dear Haifizul,

Enclosed amended report

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 July 2020 3:49 PM

To: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF) <Hafizul_Farhan_RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg>; Lai Kuen LUI (SPF) <LUI_Lai_Kuen@spf.gov.sg>
Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey of SKZ 8910D (Upper range of Repair Cost)

Dear Hafizul,
Repair Range $2500 - $3500
Repair days: 4

Weekend: 1
Total: 5

Amended report will sent to you shortly

Sorry for any inconvenience caused

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF) <Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 July 2020 3:42 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg>; Lai Kuen LUI (SPF) <LUI Lai Kuen@spf.gov.sg>
Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey of SKZ 8910D (Upper range of Repair Cost)

Dear Denise,
Any updates on the matter?

Best Regards,

Hafizul Farban Bin Rabmat

Assistant Logistics Support Officer

Logistics Support and Services Division

Tel: 6842 8429

Police Logistics Department | Singapore Police Force

3) | SPF200

SALUTING THE PRST - SAFEGLIARDING THE FUTU RE o>

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any
action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error."

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 July 2020 12:11 PM

To: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF) <Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG Cui Fen@spf.gov.sg>; Lai Kuen LUI (SPF) <LUI Lai Kuen@spf.gov.sg>
Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey of SKZ 8910D (Upper range of Repair Cost)

Dear Hafizul,

Will check and get back to you

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF) <Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 July 2020 12:06 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
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<assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG Cui Fen@spf.gov.sg>; Lai Kuen LUI (SPF) <LUI Lai Kuen@spf.gov.sg>
Subject: Pre-Repair Survey of SKZ 8910D (Upper range of Repair Cost)

Your reference: CS/SPF17019741/T1tbe2
Our reference: AEMD/105/009/2017/138

Hi,
Kindly provide the estimated upper range of repair cost for this report.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hafizul Farban Bin Rabmat

Assistant Logistics Support Officer

Logistics Support and Services Division

Tel: 6842 8429

Police Logistics Department | Singapore Police Force

ot SALUTING THE PAST - SAFEGUARDING THE FUTURE oo

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any
action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error."



