Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 February 2017 4:27 PM

To: tzeyong.lui

Cc: CS A Team; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg;
claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref:-AAD1112-0136 & Your Ref:CC3/AXA11025676/Krc3 ---- Acc-Inlvg.

SHD5537U & YM8097D on10.12.2011 along Ang Mo Kio 6

Without Prejudice
Dear Mr Lui,
We refer to the above matter.

Based on our record, we were informed by your good office that your client had decided to pass the case to
lawyer for further handling.
Therefore, no direct settlement for this matter.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: tzeyong.lui [mailto:tzeyong.lui@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 9 February, 2017 11:12 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg;
claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref:-AAD1112-0136 & Your Ref:CC3/AXA11025676/Krc3 ---- Acc-Inlvg. SHD5537U & YM8097D
0on10.12.2011 along Ang Mo Kio 6

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Our Ref:- AAD1112-0136
Your Ref:- CC3/AXA11025676/Krc3

Just a gentle reminder again!!!!

What is the claim status of our settlement for the above captioned accident?
1



Thank you & Best Regards,

Lui Tze Yong

TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
(Accounts)

tzeyong.lui@transcab.com.sg
Tel:-66031265 Ext.232

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

m N ﬁ_ No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
- "ca Website: www.transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: tzeyong.lui [mailto:tzeyong.lui@transcab.com.sq]

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2016 10:54 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong'

Cc: 'CS A Team'; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg; 'Admin A'
Subject: RE: Our Ref:-AAD1112-0136 & Your Ref:CC3/AXA11025676/Krc3 ---- Acc-Inlvg. SHD5537U & YM8097D
on10.12.2011 along Ang Mo Kio 6

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Our Ref:- AAD1112-0136
Your Ref:- CC3/AXA11025676/Krc3

Once Again

What is the claim status of our settlement for the above captioned accident?

Thank you & Best Regards,

Lui Tze Yong

TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
(Accounts)

tzeyong.lui@transcab.com.sg
Tel:-66031265 Ext.232

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

g Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
~ 'ca Website: www.transcab.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2016 7:48 AM

To: tzeyong.lui

Cc: CS A Team; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; 'Zhe Wei'; claims@transcab.com.sg; jeanteo@transcab.com.sg; Admin A
Subject: RE: O/Ref:-AAD1112-0136 -- Acc-Inlvg. SHD5537U & YM8097D on10.12.2011 along Ang Mo Kio 6




Our Ref: CC3/AXA11025676/Krc3 Without Prejudice
Dear Mr Lui,

We will check and revert.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: tzeyong.lui [mailto:tzeyong.lui@transcab.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 March, 2016 4:07 PM

To: Hsiao Tong

Cc: Zayyer; CS A Team; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; 'Zhe Wei'; claims@transcab.com.sg; jeanteo@transcab.com.sg
Subject: O/Ref:-AAD1112-0136 -- Acc-Inlvg. SHD5537U & YM8097D on10.12.2011 along Ang Mo Kio 6

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Our Ref:- AAD1112-0136
AXA Ref:- ??? unknown

What is the claim status of our settlement for the above captioned accident?
Is there an offered previously by your principal insurance:- AXA where we might have miss out, please do resend to us for
a review.

Attach the LOD & GIA report for your perusal & investigation.
Thank you & Best Regards,

Lui Tze Yong

TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
(Accounts)

tzeyong.lui@transcab.com.sg
Tel:-66031265 Ext.232




