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Catherine Chanﬁ (LKK Auto)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Saturday, 12 May, 2018 4:08 PM

To; ‘Claim Workflow System', 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
Cc: 'KARENTAN@FIRST-INSURANCE COM SG'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17009123MFSH/1

Daar Sir / Madam,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts ta Inform the workshop {o
present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavallability of the owner, therefore we decided to
tempararily close this case.

Kindly ativise us if there is any arrangement made and wil| be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Ropards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phoe: 67.41-8434 | email: pssignments@ikkajito som | fax: 62564315
Hlk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408033)

From: Claim Workflow Systern [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg)

sent: Tuesday, 26 September, 2017 5:08 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO,COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG; KARENTAN@FIRST-INSURANCE .COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17009123MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



First Capital Insurance Limited m@ﬁm& 165000100C

A FAIRFAX Company
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 25.09-2017 Our Ref No. D17009123MESH
Accident Date 23-09-2017 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHD4548A Third Party Vehicle. EC10X
Survey Location PANDAN LOOP SERVICE CENTER 188 PANDAN LOGE
Contact Person. ERIC LEE MING HUI
Contact No. 67714336/ 96438167 Fax No. 68721272
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:
Appointad LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 88418315
Contact Number. NA i
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit 1o us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
CYCLE & CARRIAGE
: i |
Cc : Workshop INDUSTRIES PTE LTD Attantion, NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solleltor Fax No. NA
~
{) s
Officer Incharge KARENT
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

Main Officn 1 6 Ptz
Caims Departments & Motar Undprwriting

Qs #2100 Singapor DINSA0 Tal: S5-4222 2911 Fax 630222 1547 Wabssie: wn lig3-iriskicanen e ag
Departriunt ;38 Aobinson Pogd #1801 Gty Hesosa Sivgiapore DBARTT Tal: 556507 3248 Farr BSEH07 MBS




Catherine Choﬂﬂ_(LKK Auto!

————
From: Eric Lee Ming Hui ceric.lu_e@cycrecarriage,mm.sg:
Sent: Wednesday, 27 September. 2017 B:3B AM
To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: EC 10X

Dear Catherine,
Car notin.

Thanks
Regards
Eric Lee Ming Hui

From: Catherine Cho ng {LKK Auto) [mailto:a dmln-d@fkkauto-mm]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 September, 2017 7:21 P

To: Eric Lee Ming Hui

Subject: £C 10%

Dear Eric,
Kindly check the vehicle currently got in the workshop?

Hest Repardy,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | emafl: assigaments@ikkauto.com | fax: Bag6-4915

Blk 51, Paya Ubi tndustriaj Park, Uli Avenue i, ¥02-25 | S{qoBeas)



