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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Zhong Cheng <zhongchengauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 12:46 PM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLF7197X

Dear All, 
 
Ok to accept COR $4300 and 4 repair days. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
Sini Tan 
Zhong Cheng Enterprise Pte Ltd 
Blk 6, 399J 
Yew Tee Industrial Est 
S678008 
HP: 93382859 Fax: 68942883 
  
 
On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 2:48 PM, Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sini, 

  

Kindly confirm L/S $4,300.00 @ 4 days. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Zhong Cheng [mailto:zhongchengauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 2:10 PM 

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLF7197X 

  

Dear Taufikh, 

  

Kindly please reconfirm the list price for the headlamp. Its HID headlamp and I've called up to check again, 
the list price is $1794.10. 

  

Please readjust. 

  

Thank you 

  

  

  

 
 

Best Regards 

Sini Tan 

Zhong Cheng Enterprise Pte Ltd 

Blk 6, 399J 

Yew Tee Industrial Est 

S678008 

HP: 93382859 Fax: 68942883 
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On Mon, Sep 10, 2018 at 3:36 PM, Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sini, 

  

Enclosed marking estimate as per request.  

  

Kindly confirm L/S $3,700 @ 4 DAYS 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Zhong Cheng [mailto:zhongchengauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 2:14 PM 

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLF7197X 

  

Dear Both, 

  

Attached are the after paint pics fyi. 

  

Thanks 
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Best Regards 

Sini Tan 

Zhong Cheng Enterprise Pte Ltd 

Blk 6, 399J 

Yew Tee Industrial Est 

S678008 

HP: 93382859 Fax: 68942883 

  

  

On Tue, Aug 7, 2018 at 3:22 PM, Zhong Cheng <zhongchengauto@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Janice, 

  

Dismantle pics resend fyi. 

  

Thanks 

 
 

Best Regards 

Sini Tan 

Zhong Cheng Enterprise Pte Ltd 

Blk 6, 399J 

Yew Tee Industrial Est 

S678008 

HP: 93382859 Fax: 68942883 
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---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Zhong Cheng <zhongchengauto@gmail.com> 
Date: Thu, Mar 8, 2018 at 3:21 PM 
Subject: Re: SLF7197X 
To: "Taufikh (LKK Auto)" <taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: admin-d@lkkauto.com 

Dear All, 

  

Attached dismantle pics resend for finalization. 

  

Thanks 

  

 
 

Best Regards 

Sini Tan 

Zhong Cheng Enterprise Pte Ltd 

Blk 6, 399J 

Yew Tee Industrial Est 

S678008 

HP: 93382859 Fax: 68942883 

  

  

On Fri, Mar 2, 2018 at 3:11 PM, Zhong Cheng <zhongchengauto@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Taufikh, 

  

Attached pics for finalization. 
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Thanks 

 
 

Best Regards 

Sini Tan 

Zhong Cheng Enterprise Pte Ltd 

Blk 6, 399J 

Yew Tee Industrial Est 

S678008 

HP: 93382859 Fax: 68942883 

  

  

  

  

  

 


