Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 March 2022 10:12 AM

To: chenhow.ng

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: Your ref: GBF4245D_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJK 8422L AND GBF
4245D ON 09/06/2017

Attachments: Scan2022-03-26_114403.pdf; GBF4245D170609_DVTPD-1.pdf

EQ: ref: DM17H001367/JT
Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the below email from third party for your easy reference.

We have rejected third party claim since 2018. Now, third party appealed for settlement as our insured counter
claim was settled at 50% by MS FCIL.

Kindly review the matter and let us have your instruction(if any).

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 26 March 2022 11:51 AM

To: Su Ling (LKK Auto) <suling@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your ref: GBF4245D_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJK 8422L AND GBF 4245D ON 09/06/2017

We refer to our attachment (email from our client's insurance company "MS FCI" Officer In-Charge)

We would appreciates it if you could review this case more objectly and let us here from you urgently.
Thank.

Best Regards,



Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730

On Monday, 2 April 2018, 03:46:30 pm SGT, Zaini (LKK Auto) <zaini @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your ref: GBF4245D “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”

Our ref: CC6/EQI17018036/Ukb3

Dear Susan,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJK 8422L AND GBF 4245D ON 09/06/2017

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate
either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






