Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax . 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLN 3790 S.

Damage Parts & Prices

S/IN  Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 FRONT BUMPER £ 2.445.00
> FRONT BUMPERGRILLE A4 $ 106.00
3 LOCKING CLIP L 14 § 47.00
4  FOAM FILLER $ 193.00
5  REINFORCEMENT BEAM ; $ 674.00
6 FRONT PARKING SENSOR OUTER = 18 208.00
7  HEADLAMP MOUNTING RH $ 100.00
8  LIFT CYLINDER RH ' $ 204.00 °
9 LED HEADLAMP RH $  9,454.00

10 SUNDRIES /' $ 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 13,731.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,572.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 17.:23.0!1

All charges are not inclusive of GST
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Nol approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name
Surveyed Date . N Aimstis
Authorised Date : Date

Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks 5 ol tlonies OB

Please Note - This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel'6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

'.I-\u_'.‘!‘l'._.ll- |

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



PARF/COE Rebate Enguird

Enquire PARF/C

OE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |0 Type!
Crwner 100
vehicle Details

ahicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:

Singapore NRIC

1730F

SLN37905

g [#]

Intended De-registration ga gep 2017

Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:
Primary Caolour
Manufacturing Year.
Engine MNo.:

Chassiz No.

Maximum Power
Crutput.

Open Market Value:

Driginal Registration
Date.

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

AUDI

AF 1.8 TFSI ULTRA (P1) {HAV)
White

2016

CYGO16752
WALUZZZAGEHN043830
140.0 KW (187 bhp)
540,434.00

28 Apr 2017

28 Apr 2017

0

$43,608.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Yes
27 Apr 2027

$32,706.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:!
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

27 Apr 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or STkW (1 306hp)
10

§54 406,00

%52 426.00

$85,132.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Sep 2017

Please do not use the Back or Forward buttons on your browser as this may alter the results of the transactions.
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View Received Mes

sage

Thie mail is associated with
*GSLN3ITI0S
oD
Sep 4 2017 7:45PM

[LIEW FU TANG]
premium Automobiles Pre Ltd

Reply } Reply AII_L Mark as Unread

| print Message | Delete Message | Forward

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 12/09/2017

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Ap

[approved: 14527.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are na documents,

proved (5$14527.00) - SLN3790S - Claim Ha

14:44 PM.

ndler: Loo, Tong Shing




‘Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 September, 2017 5:06 PM
To: Nara Khai: 'Claims Department’ SUR
Subject: RE- SLN 3780 S Own Damage Claim
Dear Sir,

1.8
I

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle é_E_bD 366A {Excess $ 400.00 /-)-

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

+0ur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
glk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(808933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

sent: Tuesday, 12 September, 2017 8:37 AM

To: Nora Khai <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg=; 'Claims Department’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SLN 3790 5 Own Damage Claim

Dear Nora,

\We are still pending approval from AIG, will give a chaser.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mora Khai lmailtﬂ:nura.khai@nremiumaum.com._sg]
Sent: Monday, 11 September, 2017 5:57 PM

To: 'Claims Department’ <claims@premiumauto.COM.Sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: SLN 3790 5 Qwn Damage Claim

Dear All,




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel * 6366 2323 Fax! 6841 1183
Email: Nora khai@premiumalito.com.sg | claims@premiumauto com.sg

Telefax

Estimate . Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No - B366 2323

Fax No . G841 1183
Reference : PA/OD/OBT1/2017/KS
Date :  7-Sep-17

Vehicle NOT in workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name +  Mr. Liew Fu Tang
Address - Blk 706 Pasir Ris Drive 10
#07-153
Singapore 510706
Telephone +  HP +B85 9635 B589
Type of Claim - Own Damage Claims
Policy No. 2 21000508922-00000
Vehicle No . SLN3790S
Model Code . Audi A61.8 TFSI S-Tronic
Model [ Year o Apr-1T
Engine No :  CYG 016752
Chassis No + WAUZZZAGBHND43830
Mileage £ =
Date In :
Liability
Excess Cost S
Estimated By - Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date : 4-Sep-17

Place of Accident . PASIRRIS CARPARK TOOA




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel: 63662323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLN 3790 S.

SIN

Estimated Surveyor's
Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation

To remove and transfer front wire harness for
headlights, horns, fog lamps, gutside temperature SM 480.00 s 480.00
sensor and headlight washer assy.
To dismantle and renew front bumper and rhs
headlight. Re-organise front crash management 1,400.00 $ 750,00
components. Reinstall all parts removed.
To respray front bumper and front rh fender 1,500.00 5 1,100.00
To carry out diagnositic checks. SN 192.00 £ 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES - 3,572.00 s 2,522.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLN 3790 S.

Damage Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 FRONT BUMPER 3 244500 $ 1,956.00
2 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE 3 106.00
3 LOCKING CLIP 14 % 47.00
4 FOAM FILLER 5 193.00
5 REINFORCEMENT BEAM $ 674.00
§ FRONT PARKING SENSOR OUTER 1% 208.00
i HEADLAMP MOUNTING RH 3 100.00
8 LIFT CYLINDER RH g 204.00
9 LED HEADLAMP RH $ 945400 $ 7.563.20
10 Added parts - see attached § 102.00 $ 81.60
1 SUNDRIES 3 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 13,833.00 $ 9,600.80
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,572.00 3 2,522.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 17,405.00 3% 12,122.80

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

5£ Ubi Road 1. Singapore 408689
Tel ; (B5) 6366 2323 Fax : (B5) 6841 1183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg Mo, 18-9902271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Quantity | Description
Parts
1 Tone Chip Guard - RHS

Estimate No.
Date

Service Advisor
Pages

Regn No

Model No

PAJODH0BT1/201TIKS
1-0ct-17

Jeffery Tan

1

SLN 3790 5

Audi AB1.8 TFSI S-Tronic

| _UnitPrice |  Amount
$ 10200 @ § 81.60
$ 10200 § 81.60

For Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Authorised Signature




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost

Liability

Remarks

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further |abour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.
For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:5768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Led Norah Kha
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building 6541 1183

Singapore 079120
Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Yr Ref: SLN 3790 5

Nora khai(@ premiumauto.com.sg
Body & Paint Dept
PA/OD/DSTI/201T/MAS
23 Feb 2018
Dear Sir,
RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SLN 3790 S, Audi Ab 1.8 TFS1 S-Tronic
With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no SL.N 3790 S. claimant.
AMr. Liew Fu Tang, please find the related document per attached.
1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85012176 — 8812,543.40

3. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document. we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
A768 9911,

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. Mo signature 15 required.

MNaorah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

AIG - SLN 3790 5

fram

Telephone +63-
Telefax  +65-
EMail

Qur department
Qur Ref

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automobiles Pte L

Showroom

2 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159080
Telephone (85) 6368 1 111
Telefax  (65) 64713733

Service & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408693
Telephone (65) 6336 2323

Telefax  (65) 684 11183



a1y

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

#  Audl Centre Singapore Alexandra Service Centre Ubl Service Centre Custamer Service
8T Alpxardra Road 201 AeandraRoad 55:Ube Boad | Service Agpointment 366 2333
ri §55830 Ingapore: hour own Serice
;:ﬁ-ilifkpl-:: RIS 2213 :f:?"f:l’t"‘::::ﬁ}}l] INE Teraph :”E DI Eﬁar o s:u-n(nr-l:rf.drr.-ﬂprernlumnu!:}!:a::.i;
Mal Telnfan 0471 3723 reletas 5475 1023 Cowpany tHegs Nosel 1W
Page 1 1h:ih4 GST Reg. No. 139302271
Invaice: B5812176 ficcount: POBRE (T ]
IPIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
hﬂTﬂH CLAIM DERT Date : 22/@2/201B MOTOR CLAIM DERT
AIG BUILDING ALG BUILDING
78 SHENTON WAY Oeder + SLNITI0S 78 SHENTON WARY
#W7-1& #7-16
SINGAPORE 279120 A79129 Ters 1 3 SINGAPORE @79120
Regn Mo.: SLN37985  (V 31745) Rebn Date: 2B/04/2817 Mileage: 14816 WIF No.: 371%
Model: B6 1.8 TFSI  tronic 460066 (N Chassis: WAUZLT4GGHN@43838  Engine: CYB 16752 Dept: U
VSB Mo s
You have been assisted by :- UB-Carrine {33 )
Details Qty Urut Price Amourt
8 BODYWORK, M 400, o 1.0@ 48, DR

(TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS FOR
HERDLIBHTS, HORNG, FOG LAMPS, DUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
' SENSOR AND HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY.

0 |EC M: 8883 40, @ .00 -42, 0@
Insurance Excess/Liability
5 | BODYWORK LH 758, o0 1.9 750, 8
-,mmamummmnummum
HEADLIGHT. RE-ORGANISE FRONT CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPOMENTS. REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED.

S BODYWORK L H 1108, 8 1.00 1, 169, o
TO RESPRAY FROG BUMPER AND RHS FRONT FENDER.
5 BODYHORK . Mz 192. 00 1.0 192, 0
'TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECKS.
§ | RAGRISITTH HEADL 1GHT Less @20 L0 | 95400 7,53.20
§ | RAGRARTeLSASERU COVER Less G2y L 2445, 80 1,956, 09
§ | GAGRATRINE FOIL Less @2 1.0 102, 0@ ]
|
Parts  9,600.80 Sub-Total 1 4y 7ee.00
Labour 0,8 )
Sublet  2,522.00 7% GST 820, 60
Menus 8.00 F
Uit 0. 08 Grand Total t&, 543,40

Received by For L on behalf of
Presius Autowobiles Pte Ltd

Customer



Premium Automobiles

Telefax

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Litd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AlG Building

Singapore 079120
Motor Claims Dept
Yr Ref: SLN 3790 5

Norah Khai
6768 9828
841 1183

Body Repair

PA/OD/0871/2017/TF
28 Sept 2017

1

RE: CLAIM - OWNER’S SATISFACTION/DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Make & Model
Vehicle Chassis No.
Vehicle Regn No.
Vehicle Mileage
Vehicle Owner
Certificate No
Policy Excess
Accident Date
Place

Repair Cost

WIF No.

Repairer's Name

I/'We certify that the vehicle has been fully repaired to my entire satisfaction and that
payment of the repairer's charges that are claimable under the policy will be deemed in

Audi A6 1.8 TFSI S tronic
WAUZZZA4G6HN043830
SLN 3790 8

9998 KM

Mr. Liew Fu Tang
2100508922

5$428.00 (inclusive GST)
4 September 2017

Pasir Ris Carpark T00A

$ 12,5%%-4

37192

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

full and final settlement of my claim.

Owner / Insured Signature

Time

Date

PN

&

e

_Fw}\ 1-'3!,

DISCHARGE VOUCHER- AIG - SLM 3790 §

from

Telephone +65-
Telefax  +65-
Mobile +65-
Cur department
Your Claim Ref
Our Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automobiles Pte Lt
Showroom

9 Leng Kee Road

Singapore 159080
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Parts Centres
55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699
Telephone (65) 6366 2323
Telefax  (65) 6841 1183




3M1/2018 Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

e e S - B
[CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _______—— B 1|
| Case _rN'.II1-|-|J | Est Submikied l-"-"_| Azcigned Adj Bpt Ady Submitted |1:‘Ib Auth'ed rS‘ratn.-.-. S |
Case (Notied 4= e g7 | ' z
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I ' Edit Adj Rpt || Cancel Case ,
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Show All I

[[Created by insurer]

Claim Details

Referance

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

e LW FUTANG, ID: 514917307, Tl 16506350589, Emal efreyif@gmal.com — |
VeniceReg Mo |SLN3790S Tosteotioss: _ [o4/09/20171900-:89

| Claim Type: OD / 983454552556 Policy/Cover Note No.: lz_mumagzz (Comprehensive) _I
| AT T lexeess |5$400.00 ==}
FEFEL - ~ Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI) == Ubi Road 1, 408699 UDi - Tel: 67689828/9827/9911 __|
_. Handling Insurer: I?:E.i:ﬁ:;ﬁg} Er:nnca Pte. Ltd. (5G) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Loo, Tong Shing] J

I;djuster;

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt
guser  |due 19/09/2007) o ey |
[Driver/Custodian: _ [LIEW FU TANG (56 / Male), NRIC: 51491730F, Tel: +6596358589

"ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
. AIG_SG (14/09/2017): SLN3790S / 0D / 04/09/2017 / Coverage & Excess update
. AIG_SG (13/03/2017): SLN3790S / OD / 04/09/2017 / Coverage & Excess update
« AIG_SG (12/09/2017): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5514527.00) - SLN37905 - Claim Handler: Loo, Tong ... |
'+ AIG_SG (11/09/2017): SLN3790S / OD / 04/09/2017 / Coverage & Excess update

Wiew .MIJ Compose Case Mail

e ; 1
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS® View All | | Search Tasks | _Create New Task | Complete |
Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |

| Mo results.
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Claim Documents

*SLN3790S (98345455255G)
oD
Sep 4 2017 7: :45PM
[LIEW FU TANG]
premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
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3/1/2018

Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqNo:1s9607198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25,

Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email.

sur@lkhaum.cnm;assignments@lkkﬁutu.mm

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. OurFile No:  CC3/AIG17017412/ATBSZ
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #07-16
Singapore 079120 Date: 01/03/2018
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: LIEW FU TANG Palicy No: 2100508922
Date of Loss: 04/09/2017 Nature of Claim: oD Claim Na: 083454552556
QESCRIETK}H & |IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg MNo: SLN3T90S
Make & Model: AUDI A6, 1.8 TFSI S-tronic (C7) (A) Engine No: CYGO016752
Req. Date: 2B/04/2017 (Man, Year: 2016) Chassis Mo WAUZZZ4GEHN043830
Colour: White Odometer: 8656 km
Engine Capacity: 1798 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: §$200,000.00
Sum Insured (S5) Market Value/Mew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME QF SURVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF YRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/55R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/55R17
Front Left Side: Michelin & mm Rear Left Side: Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The ahove vaiues regresent the remaining tyre treads deplh
COST OF CLAIMS. © Reparers  Adjsters “Difference _ Diff %
Parts 13,731.00 9.519.20 4,211.80 30.67
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,572.00 2.522.00 1,050.00 29.40
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5%) 17,303.00 12,041.20 5,261.80 30.41
- Excess |S§) 400.00 400.00 0.00 0.00
(s%) 16,903.00 11,641.20 5,261.80 3113
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 1,183.21 £14.88 368.33 33
Mett Amount (S5) 18,086.21 12,456.08 5,630.13 31.12
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 08/08/2017
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (HQ)
Date Inspected: 08/09/2017 Inspected AL 55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699
Estimated Period of Repair. 4.0 days
Adjuster:  ADRIAN LING Manager: DENISE TAY KWEE CHENG

NOTE: This reparl reprasents our findings &t the time and place of inspection stated harsin. Such inspeciion has bean carriod out fo the best of our knowledge and abitify but

any other liability under any other circumstances is heredy gupressly sxcluded.
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an2ome Adjuster Reporn
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Adjuster Report

No. Qty PartMNo. Pa rticulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed 2.445.00F5 *4,056.00F5
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER GRILLE Mot Necessary 106.00FS *F5
3 14 *LOCKING CLIP Mot Mecessary 47.00FS *-F5
4 1 *FOAM FILLER Mot Mecessary 193.00FS *FS
5 1 *REINFORCEMENT BEAM Not Necessary 674.00FS *-FS
6 1 “FRONT PARKING SENSOR OUTER Mot Mecessary 208.00F3 *-FS§
T 1 *HEADLAMP MOUNTING RH Mot Necessary 100.00F3 -F5
3] 1 *LIFT CYLINDER RH Mot Necessary 204 00FS *-FS
9 1 *LED HEADLAMP RH Cracked 9,454 DOFS *7.563.20FS
0 1 *SUNDRIES Mot Necessary 300.00FS *-F3
F=Franchise parl. S=Spehett, —
Total Parts (S$) 9,519.20

13,731.00

Report was Lnsubmitted during this print-out.
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AM2018 Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS FOR Mew 480.00 480.00

HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, FOG LAMPS, OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE SENSOR
AND HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY.

2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER AND RHS HEADLIGHT. New 1,400.00 750.00
RE-ORGANISE FRONT CRASH MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS.
REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED.

3 TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND FRONT RH FENDER. New 1,600.00 1,100.00
4 T0 CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECKS. Mew 192.00 192.00
Gross Labour Cost (55%) 3,572.00 2,522.00

Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out. :‘

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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