Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Yvonne,

Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Monday, 15 January 2018 9:24 AM

ANG Yvonne

Celine Fong (LKKAuto); SUR; KKLau; HO Vincent; HO Kow Wai
RE: Assistance required: Effect MV for SCU2823H - Toyota Vios

The market value for SCU 2823H is $30K - $32K(est) as at Jan 2018

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KKLau

Sent: Saturday, 13 January 2018 12:03 PM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fwd: Assistance required: Effect MV for SCU2823H - Toyota Vios

Urgent please !

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>
Date: 12 January 2018 at 1:52:08 PM SGT

To: "bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg" <bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg>, "admin@autoprobe.com.sg"

<admin@autoprobe.com.sg>, "bernardong@ajaxinspection.com"

<bernardong@ajaxinspection.com>, "joseyloh@ajaxinspection.com"

<joseyloh@ajaxinspection.com>, "frankie @fta.com.sg" <frankie@fta.com.sg>,

"motorsurvey@fta.com.sg" <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>, "benson@Ibs-auto.com" <benson@Ibs-

auto.com>, "nick@Ibs-auto.com" <nick@I|bs-auto.com>, "kklau@Ikkauto.com"

<kklau@Ikkauto.com>, "olivialau@lkkauto.com" <olivialau@lkkauto.com>,

"limmy.lee@priorityservices.sg" <jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg>, "cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg'

<cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>, "ricky@rta.com.sg" <ricky@rta.com.sg>, "elson@rta.com.sg"
<elson@rta.com.sg>, "collin.wong@a-pac.sg" <collin.wong@a-pac.sg>, "patrick.soo@a-pac.sg"
<patrick.soo@a-pac.sg>

Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>, HO Kow Wai <kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Assistance required: Effect MV for SCU2823H - Toyota Vios

Dear Partners,



Please assist to provide Ms Yvonne Ang with the Market Value for this case.
DOA: 03/01/2018

Thank you.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicl

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 5498E

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: S5CU2823H
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended De-registration Date: 03 Jan 2018
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: VIOSEAUTO
Frimary Colour: Green
Manufacturing Year: 2007

Engine No.: INZX582569
Chassis No.: MROS3HY 9305013755

Maximum Power Output:

80.0 kW (107 bhp)

Open Market Value: $12,607.00
Original Registration Date: 25 Jul 2007
First Registration Date: 25 Jul 2007
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $13,868.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited



Warmest Regards

Vincent Ho

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: vincent.ho@axa.com.sg

DID: (65) 6880 4349

We are stronger when collaborating f

4\ 74 and acting as one team A ™ (

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named
addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the
content of this message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender
immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group,
unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



