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' 74l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

— P ; —ff— 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4015

Reg Mo: 199607T188R GST Reg. No 15-865071688-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Rel CCHIII1T016456/Guald
#05.02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE 048711 Ople: | aaaehy Il“ﬂl““ll"“lﬂllu
Code: 12
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 4375L Veh. Inspected SLO 6663R
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim Neo. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 24/08/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/08/2017 ]lnspentiun Date 13/08/2017
Survey held at  JA AUTOCARE PTELTD

8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
#02-37 PREMIEREKAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ASWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BIIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




LEK Aulo Consultanty hence nolify
the Repairer of the fallowing

«To Dofora/alter apray ¢
s L
* Parts prods e suom 1o confirmalion
#02-37 Premier@Kaki Bukit * Third paTy survery & on @ “Wilnou! Prejucics” besa
Singpore 415875 * Mo Begal mosficrzon| 1) W aficwsd
tel - 94513429 * Supplementary fm{s| must be eeurveyed and

o sutsect 1o final Bpprival from inpursece Cormpany
emall : elivacassandra@hotmail.com

Asvowapindd by Reparr
Syt ESTIMATE
India Int'l Insurance Pte Ltd — Date 11.09.2017
64 Cecil Street Vehicle no SLO 6663R
704 02 108 Building Model: BMW M 5
Singapore 049711 DOA 19,08.2017
Parts.

01) Front bumper 7~ C«Jr e PMﬂ 5 420000 22le
02) Front bumper bracket th 9 MV 5 250.00 ¥
03) Front bumper clips - ﬁ‘t 5 60.00 _.
04) Front fender rh X l&?m.‘r $  3,980.00
as) Head lamp assy rh 7 S 4,500.00 2
06) Head lamp clips rh 7 5 B0.00 9
07) Front bumper sensor R, 4/ A/ $  380.00 X
08) Frontrimrh ¢ 5 5 3,800.00

5 17.230.00 ‘x Lz-?a

Less 10% 5 (1,723.00)

$ 15,507.00
5/Nett items Q’%
09) Tyerth ¢ IV $  800.00 X
Labour charges
17) To check wiring $ 15000 3G
18) To apply anti chemical S 30000 X e
19) To dismantle upholstery etc $ 35000 X 6 WA
21) To perform 4 wheel alighnment S 38000 X
22) To knock out dents an affected areas S 1,600.00 @0&

renew parts

23) To Putty & Respray painitng 5  1,400.00 q-ac.

$ 4,180.00

e
Total $ 20,487.00

[PT* .p t a
e Ty lefove patnt phtss
h Guie &.’ﬂh? _ koL
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |

Text size + - |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Cwnar ID Typa Singapora NRIC
Owner I0: 3823E

Vehicle Details

Wehicls No. SLOG6BIR

“ehicle to be Exparted Mo
Intended De-registration
Date: 13 Sep 2017

Vehicla Make: BMW

ehicle Model: M5 DvAB SR ABS HID DSC NAV HUD RRVENT
Prnmary Calour White

Manufacturing Year 2012

Engina No_: 208102515638448

Chassis No WBSFV220900X85810

mu"" i 412.0 KW (552 bhp)

Open Market Valus $85,127.00
mnﬂ Registration 23 Aug 2012

First Registration Date. 23 Aug 2012

Transfer Count 1

Actual ARF Paid £95127.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligitility. Yes

b Elighilty By 22 aug 2022

PARF Rebate Amount  $66 588.00

Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date 22 Aug 2022
COE Category E - Open Category

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid $86,886.00

COE Rebate Amount,  $42.104.00

Total Rebate Amount: $108,692.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Sep 2017

Lund Transpor Autharity

Plaase read mrough the Privacy Statement, Terms of Usa and Disciaimes
Piaass do nol use the Back or Forward butions on your browser as this may alier the results of the transactions.
Beal viewed with [E 8 0 5P3 and above 1024 X TE8 resciution
Copyright @ 2017 LTA | Privecy Statement | Terma of Use | Oiscaimer | Ruie the Wabsite | Rate this o-Service
Last updated on I7 Aug 2017 s 01,05 AM

https://vrLIta.gov.sg/Ita/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereginput ?FUNCTL...  13/9/2017



Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

e ——————————— e —————

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 29 October 2018 6:46 PM

To: Jen Eliva

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 5LO 6663R B SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CCBNITTD16456/uad

Without Prejudice,
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below email.

Kindly advise if your client is still claiming for third party against our principal M/s i1,

Best Repards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lud

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jen Eliva <elivacassandra@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 11 November 2017 11:14 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/11117016456/ua3

Dear Thin Thin,

We only have the scene picture which has attached during the submission of the GIA report.

Kindly refer to the attached GIA report Pictures.

The scene pictures clearly shown that its the Taxi who cut into our customer's lane resulting his rear bumper
to putt off.

Kindly look into this matter and let us have the settlement soon.

1



Thank you.

best Regards

Jenny Chew -94513429

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, September 29, 2017 6:41 AM
To: Jen Eliva

Ce: vhe.jeannie@gmall.com
Subject: RE: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/11117016456/ua3

Dear Jenny,

We are still pending the video footage from our principal.

Meanwhile, kindly help me check with your client for the evidence / accident scene photo.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jen Eliva [mailto:elivacassandra@hotmall.com]
Sent: Friday, 29 September, 2017 2:27 PM
To: Thin Thin [LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: yhe.jeannie@gmail.com
Subject: Re: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CCB/I117016456/ual3

Dear Thin Thin ,



Understand from our customer that ur taxi has a video cam installed. Kindly obtain a copy from them . And
also , the the view of the damages to the taxi, the rear bumper was 'pulled out’ and it's impossible for our
customer to hit onto his taxi rear .

Kindly review and revert settlement soon .

Thank you

Best regards
Jenny Chew

Sent from my iPhone

On 29 Sep 2017, at 2:09 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

"Without Prejudice"”

Dear lenny,

We refer to the below matter.

We do not have any of video footage for this case.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the
liability is unclear for the above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to
substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith is a copy of our insured's accident report
for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying
further with our Ol we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not
refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV [/ evidence in order to seek further instruction
from our principal.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability.
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin® lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{qu8933)



From: Jen Eliva [mailto:elivacassandra@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 28 September, 2017 12:26 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLO 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/11117016456/ua3

Dear Thin Thin,

Please revert liability.

Thank you.

Best regards.

Jenny chew - 94513429

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 21, 2017 1:26 AM

To: Jen Eliva; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: 5LQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/IN117016456/ua3

Dear |enny,

Thank you for your email.

By copy to Thin Thin.

For your information and necessary action please.



To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fox: 67414108

Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, woz-25 | S(408933)

From: Jen Eliva [mailto:elivacassandra@hotmail.com
Sent: Tuesday, 19 September, 2017 12:45 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CCH/1117016456/ua3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Any update ?

Thank you

Jenny

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAUto) «<Melkwan{@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, September 11, 2017 2:56 AM
To: Jen Eliva; assignments



Cc: Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 &% LKK REF: CCE!I!IITGIE#EE.-’UH

Dear Jlenny,

Thank you for your email,

By copy to assignment team.

Kindly assist to confirm appointment.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6366 0os5 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya UThi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S{408933)

From: Jen Eliva [mallto:elivacassandra@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 11 September, 2017 8:51 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 5LQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/11117016456/ua3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please arrange Marcus to conduct survey on 13.09.2017 @11am.



Thank you.

Best Regards

Jenny Chew 94513429
for JA AutoCare Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4

#02 37 Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 5, 2017 11:29 AM

To: len Eliva

Subject: RE: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/1117016456/ua3

Dear lenny,

We requested the CCTV from Ill and currently pending for their reply.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Jen Eliva [mailto:elivacassandra@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 5 September, 2017 11:16 AM

To: Meil Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkk .coms>
Subject: Re: SLQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CCB/11117016456/ua3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Did u obtain a video cam from the taxi company?

Thank you.

Jenny Chew - 94513429

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan m>

Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2017 4:01 AM

To: Jen Eliva

Ce: Admin A; assignments; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 5LQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CCB/N17016456/ual

Dear lenny,

0l's sketch plan and statement as requested.

<image001.png>

<image002.png>



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Jen Eliva [mailto:elivacassandra@hotmalil.com]
Sent: Maonday, 28 August, 2017 11:06 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>,; asmgnments ﬂiﬁm&hﬁq}_} Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <j lkkauto.

Subject: Re: 5LQ 6663R & SHB 4375L ON H.DB.!DI? *** LKK REF: CCB/ Ii!l?ﬂlﬁﬂSﬁ,f uald

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please advice liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Jenny Chew

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 24, 2017 10:43 AM



To: Jen Eliva
Cc: Admin A; assignments; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SLO 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/11117016456/ual

Dear Jenny,

Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured report from our principal.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Thin Thin at 6841
2360.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108

ik 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

10



From: Jen Eliva [mailto:eliv ndra@hotmail.

Sent: Thursday, 24 August, 2017 11:40 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@| X >
Subject: Fwd: 5LO 6663R & SHB 4375L ON 19.08.2017

Hi,

We are the authorization workshop for 5LQ 6663R to claim against your insured
SHB 4375L.

Please advise liability.

Thank you.

Best regards

Jenny Chew -94513429

for JA AutoCare Pte Ltd

11



Ash_er Sni (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday. 4 March 2020 619 PM

To: Manivel Priyadarshini

Subject: Your Ref. MCT17080671 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 43750 AND SLQ 6663R OMN
19/08/2017

Your Ref: MCT17080671

Hi Priya,

We refer to the above matter

AC VING SHB 4375L AND R

We were informed by TP workshop that claimant da not come back ta their workshop for survey [ repair up to date

In view of the above, We will proceed to clase file and submit our w/p report.

Thank You

Beast Ragorg
Asher Sng | Cose Hondier
LEE Aulo Comullonts Ple Lid

e a4 | -&05 | emol gehersng #ikkguin com | Tox &741-4108

Bl 51 By Ubl Indbicl Pork Ul Avenile 225 LIA0EF TN




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B
Case | Wotified Est Submitted | Adj Assigned | Ad) Ript [Adj Submitted | i Auth'ed Status
|25 M9 2007 S B lssagmie0  592,873.00 et e
£t Aeg | gy _mmuLunml concel s |

Claim Details

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

insurea. | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co fieg. Mo - 193303821R
Maimn _
‘Elqirnnru:: TIONG KENG KONG, (D S1673923E
Vehicls Reg T19/08/2017 12:00 - ;59
No.: SLQ6663R Date of Losi: | /g uonths and 27 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r]]
Claim Type: |TP / MCT17080671 rascyicaver | mcomoo1s
Vehicle Rag.
No. SHB4I7SL m, CNEA5006
[Insured) =
Excess:
REpairer: Ja Autocare Pte Lid () 8 KAK] BUKIT AVE 4, #02-37 PREMIER@KAK] BUKIT, 415875 Kaki Bokit - Tel:
T |tndia tnternational Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [Handled by Priva]

Claimant’s | s tnsurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel- 6880 4588

1nsurer:
Adjuster  LNK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - 1=l 6256-3561 .. [Handied &

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Ml |  Compose Case mail |

s [II_SG (14/00/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLOS66IR - Claim Handler: Priys
s II_SG (21/11/2017) Alert - Ad] Mandate Maintalned - SLQES6IR - Clalm Handler: Priya
 [I_SG (D8/11/2017) Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLQESSIR - Clalm Handler: Priya
« [I_SG [(29/08/2017): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLQES6IR - Claim Handler: Priya

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view A1l | Search Taaks | Croate New Task | Compiees |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 11/3/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Upioad Documants I Lpisad Protos T ka-ml

Claim Documents

*SLQ6663R (MCT17080671)

[SHB4375L]
™

TIONG KENG KONG
Aug 19 2017 12:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Ja Autocare Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

View [viem m Browsar] ]

Video iperpage (V]| B
\Mo_| Finalized On India International Insurance Pta Ltd [HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |23/10/37 12:07 | Vides - Accident @ | Loaa mes
| Photos /Images ~]| &
Mo | Helabal/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbeaall | Print
1 |30/05/18 12:5% Ganaral View | loadirc | M
2| 30/05/1812:55 | General View @ eawc | A
3 | 30/05/18 12:55 Ganaral View 0| t=mdwe | A
& |30/05/18 12:55 Ganeral View 0| s | M
5 | 30/05/18 12:55 | General View 0 wwrs | A
& | 30/05/18 12:55 Ganeral View 0| loadwc |
7 |30/o%/18 12:55 | General View 0| teaawe | 4
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne1sseorissr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408033
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@likkauto.com;assignments@/kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB&NIMT018456/GEA3Q2Z

Data: 11/0372020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No MCOMDO15
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SLO6663R Insured Vehicle No : SHB4375L
Date of Loss. 18/08/2017 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT17080671
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg Na: SLOG6663IR
Make & Model: BMW M5, Engine No: 20810251563B44B
Reg. Date: 23/08/2012 (Man. Year 2012) Chassis No WESFVE2080DX85810
Colour: White Cdomeler: 54548 km
Engine Capacity. 4395 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$). Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Enpine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 265/35Z R20 Rear Tyre Size: 265/35Z R20
Front Left Side: Michelin & mm Rear Left Side Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above walues reprosant the mmaining fyre resds depift
/COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 16,307.00 2,043.00 14,264.00 B7.47
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4,180.00 B30.00 3,350.00 80.14
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0,00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S5) 20,487.00 2, 873.00 17,614.00 85.98
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 13/082017
Date Inspected: 13/08/2017 Inspected At Ja Autocare Ple Lid
B KAKI BUKIT AVE 4, #02-37
PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT
Singapore 415875
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This report reprasents our findings af the time and place of inspection staled herein, Such inspection has been camed ouf o ihe bes! of our
knowledpe and ability but any othar Fabiity under any ofher circumstances is heraby sxpressly exciuded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Las! Synchronised; 10 Mar 2020)

Parts: 143 BMW M5 (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0}
|Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
|Print Code: (Unsubmitted. no print-code for SLOG663R)

Validity:

i_Furth-r Info: temsivalues not In reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 9 *FRONT BUMPER Cut 420000FL  *2210.00FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET RH Not Necessary 250.00 FL “-FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 60.00 FL *80.00 FL
4 1 *FRONT FENDER RH Repair 3,880.00FL “FL
5 1 *HEAD LAMP ASSY RH *Check 4,500.00 FL "-FL
6 1 *HEAD LAMP CLIPS RH *Check B0.00 FL "-FL
701 *FRONT BUMPER SENSOR Not Necessary 380.00FL "-FL
8 1 *FRONT RIM RH Not Necessary 3,800.00FL “-FL
8 1 *TYRE RH Not Necessary 800.00FS "-FS
FeFranchise pant S=Spchetl. L=ListhamDsc
Sub Total (S§)  18,030.00 2,270.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$)  1,723.00 227.00
Total Parts (SS) __ 16,307.00 2,043.00
i Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items salecied.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO CHECK WIRING New 150.00 30.00

2  TOAPPLY ANTI CHEMICAL MNew 300.00 0.00

3 TO DISMANTLE UPHOLSTERY ETC New 350.00 0.00

4 TO PERFORM 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 380.00 0.00

§ TOKNOCK OUT DENTS ON AFFECTED AREAS RENEW New 1.600.00 400.00

PARTS

1 TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING New 1.400.00 400,00

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 4,180.00 830.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out.

<END OF ESTIMATES >
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