Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 2 December, 2017 12:42 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); 'Ng Wai Yin'; claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3q2; TCS REF: AAD1308-078

Without Prejudice
Dear Thin Thin

Please proceed to send us the DV and a copy of your insured accident statement (front page).

Thank you
Best Regards
Jasmine Tan

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

ﬂcag Main Line :(65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6257 1330
Direct Line :(65) 6603 1250
Website: www .franscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 15 August 2017 2:20 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>;
claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3q2; TCS REF: AAD1308-078

"Without Prejudice"
Dear Ng Wai Yin,
We refer to the below matter.

Please refer to the attached email and below screen shoot.

2 | cca/AxA13014524/kjm3 | SHR'5327) | 06/08/2013 | COR|w/GST) $5029.00 | NO LOD DOCUMENTS
LOR($96.30 x 7 DAYS) $ 67410
LONS50 x 7 DAYS) 5% 350,00
LTA search fee 5 h3s
TOTAL % 6,058.45
GLOBAL SUM OFFER AT 50% 5 3.025.00

Kindly let us have your acceptance.



Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 15 August, 2017 2:10 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3q2; TCS REF: AAD1308-078

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Shu Pei
Enclosed is our GIA report and LOD for your investigation.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"C ﬂg tn

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, August 15, 2017 1:36 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3q2; TCS REF: AAD1308-078

Dear Wai Yin,
Kindly forwards to us LOD for our necessary action.

Thank you

Best Regards,



Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 August, 2017 5:00 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: LKK REF: CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3g2; TCS REF: AAD1308-078

Hi,

Please assist o re-assign the case.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 10 August, 2017 2:53 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: LKK REF: CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3q2; TCS REF: AAD1308-078

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Hsiao Tong

Kindly forward your email of 50% offer to us once again.

3rd Party Accident Place of
TCS Ref. No. LKK Ref. No. Vehicle No. | Vehicle No. Date Accident TP Insurer R
AXA
06-08-13 Shipyard INSURANCE S | Te
AAD1308-078 | CC3/AXA13014524/Kjy3q2 | SHD5327) YM9238H 16:00 Crescent PTE LTD re

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308



TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
— " Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
Ca Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened

for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet



