Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Pegasus Engineering <claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 January, 2019 9:02 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: Your Ref: SLC 6156P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLC 2388K AND SLC
6156P ON 01/07/2017 LKK REF CC4/AXA17012961/Uhb3

Attachments: Weekly Partner Statement - 2017-W22(3).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2017-

W20(3).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2017-W23(3).pdf; Weekly Partner
Statement - 2017-W24(4).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2017-W21(2).pdf, Weekly
Partner Statement - 2017-W24(5).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2017-W25(2).pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

Our counter proposal of $4970.00 is base on the following :-

The cost of repair was finalised at $4494.00 inclusive GST and

Loss of rental and earnings was based on the surveyor recommendation of 4 days. i.e loss of
rental at $66.95 x4 days =$267.80 and loss of earnings base on benchmark rate at $50 x 4days =
$200.00.

LTA $5.35 was the insurance search fees incurred.

Hence, regret to inform that we are unable to accept your latest revised offer. Please re-consider
our appeal of $4970.00. If we are unable to reach direct settlement with you by this, please let us
have your agreement to let our client to take over the conduct the matter without delay.

We enclosed the weekly partner statement for your consideration.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Ow
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

51 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539216

Tel : 6858 1846

Fax 1 6487 6070

Email : claims @pegasusengrg.com.sg

On Thu, Jan 10, 2019 at 2:18 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Save as to Cost

Dear Sharon,



We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we had strict instructions from our principal to maintain our offer of $4,800.00 (all in).

Our principal is in the view that the our offer was already fair and reasonable.

Purely for an amicable settlement and for your acceptance please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

SR2% W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 7 December, 2018 10:40 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: Your Ref: SLC 6156P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLC 2388K AND SLC 6156P ON 01/07/2017

Without prejudice



Dear Vic,

As per tele- conversation minute ago. We understand that AXA is maintaining their offer of
$4800.00.

However, our client maintain rejection of your offer and request for $4970.00 all in for amicable
settlement.

Please convey our message to your principle as this is our best attempt to have a direct
settlement with your principle, failing, please let us have your confirmation to let our client to take
over the conduct of the matter.

Please reply within the next 3 days as this claim has been delay for years.

Thanks & Regards,
Sharon Ow

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539216

Tel : 6858 1846

Fax 1 6487 6070

Email : claims @pegasusengrg.com.sg

On Wed, Nov 28, 2018 at 3:25 PM Pegasus Engineering <claims @pegasusengrg.com.sg> wrote:
Without prejudice

Dear Vic,

Our client maintained their mandate at $4970.00



Please reply.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Ow

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539216

Tel : 6858 1846

Fax 1 6487 6070

Email : claims @pegasusengre.com.sg

On Mon, Nov 12, 2018 at 11:14 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice
Dear Sharon,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, our principal is prepared to improve and increase our offer to a global sum of $4,800.00 (all in) to
settle you client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly let the owner chop and sign the enclosed DV then forward back to us together with the copy
of the Authorization to Act Letter for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this
offer in any other related matters.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August, 2018 12:49 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: Your Ref: SLC 6156P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLC 2388K AND SLC 6156P ON
01/07/2017

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic,

As spoken. Our cost of repair is subject to 7% GST.

Hence, we propose to close at global sum $4970.00.

Please reply.

Thanks & Regards,



Sharon Ow

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539216

Tel : 6858 1846
Fax : 6487 6070
Email : claims @pegasusengre.com.sg

On Wed, Aug 29, 2018 at 10:20 AM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice,

Dear Sharon,
Please refer to the below email.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this
offer in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended
recipient. Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If
you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items.
Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 August, 2018 3:30 PM

To: Richard Ang

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Pegasus Engineering



Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLC 6156P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLC 2388K AND SLC
6156P ON 01/07/2017

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer further to our below email and we would like to withdraw any offer that has been made for this
case previously.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to
our Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer a global sum of $4,605.35 (all in) to

settle you client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly let the owner chop and sign the enclosed DV then forward back to us together with
the copy of the Authorization to Act Letter for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this
offer in any other related matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended
recipient. Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If
you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items.
Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 July, 2017 3:35 PM

To: Richard Ang

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SLC 6156P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLC 2388K AND SLC 6156P
ON 01/07/2017



Your Ref: SLC 6156P “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”

Our Ref: CC4/AXA17012961/Uhg3

Dear Richard,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLC 2388K AND SLC 6156P ON 01/07/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear
subject to the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is
subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of
LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



