Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 January, 2018 1:51 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan'; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1410-192--Accident involving SHD5499X & SJN3928L on 18.10.14
Attachments: AAD1410-192 - DV.pdf; AAD1410-192 - LTA.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Joy Irene

Attached duly signed DV and LTA search for your action to effect the payment.
Original hard copy will mailed to you by post.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"""'C alqw -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 8:44 AM

To: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1410-192--Accident involving SHD5499X & SIN3928L on 18.10.14

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wai Yin,

Good morning.

Kindly assist to return the DV sent to you on 09/01/2018 for closure.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6749-5792 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 January 2018 1:36 PM

To: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1410-192--Accident involving SHD5499X & SIN3928L on 18.10.14

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jasmine/Wai Yin,
Attached DV for your necessary action.
Kindly also send supporting doc for the LTA search fee.

Thank you.

Note: There is correction on rental rate, from $96.60 to $96.30

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-5792 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Jasmine Tan [mailto:jasminetan@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 January 2018 8:34 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1410-192--Accident involving SHD5499X & SIN3928L on 18.10.14

Without Prejudice
Dear Joy
Please proceed to send us the DV.

Thank You
Best Regards



Jasmine Tan

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line :(65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6257 1330
ﬁcag © ©

Direct Line :(65) 6603 1250
Website: www.franscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this
message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are
not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 8 January 2018 4:24 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TCS REF: AAD1410-192--Accident involving SHD5499X & SIN3928L on 18.10.14

Our Ref: CC3/AIG14020801/Kha3q2-1

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wai Yin,

We have reviewed the case file and we understand that your driver reported a straight front-to-rear scenario that
occurred on the same lane.

Your driver’s sketch below.
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We observed that the damages of your taxi vehicle did not correspond or corroborate with our insured’s report and
damages.

Our insured vehicle sustained damages_on its front right hand side. Photos attached for your comparison and
reference.




In view of the above, we are of the opinion that our insured’s version is more probable. Your driver likely changed
lane and our insured’s evasive reaction to avoid collision fall short hence, contact of their vehicles.

As such, in the absence of strong evidence from both and conflict of their reports, we believe that an equal liability
settlement of 50:50 is already fair and reasonable, solely for the purpose of an amicable settlement and to bring this

2014 claim to rest.

On without prejudice basis, we offer as follows:

Cost of Repairs (with GST) $909.50
Loss of Rental (596.30 x 1.5days) $144.45
Loss of Use (550.00 x 1.5days) S 75.00
TOTAL $1,128.95
AT 50% S 564.48
LTA Search Fee S 6.00
TOTAL $ 570.48

Please confirm acceptance.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-5792 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



