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sn WA ™ Pl Company Registration No. 1996071888

L 74 C e

S UBEAVE 1, 8U2-25 PAYA URL INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 400933 TEL @ (0651 62563501 FAX 1 (065) h2564315

Your ref; TBA Date: 05022018
Owr ref: CCHICSI1TON8392/T lead

The Motor Claims Department

M/s ECICS LTD

Dear Sir’Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. PC 2802)

We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed thal we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 17/1122017
at the premises of M/s CARLIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S§ 4,179.34
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2,154.83
"Check" Items Amount : 5% -
Market Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 5% -
MNen Value : 5% -

Description of Damage: -
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front N/S Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 day

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Fark. Singapare 408803
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62586 4315
Reg. No 185807198 GST Reg. No, 19-9607188-R

Affiliated 1o Federation Intamationale Des Experts En Automobile

ECICSLTD Rel CCA/ICS17008382/T 1aal
Lo SONTES TOMER | AT
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE Daie: 27-04-2017
SINGARORE 038987
Code . ICS
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLE 93028 Veh. Inspected PC 2802J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date Zifoarzoy
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
1, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. ] Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/03/2017 [Inspection Date 2710412017
Survey held at CARLIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES
BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-75
SINGAPORE 153719
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




4
CAR LIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES
70 LI HWAM DRIVE , SINGAPORE 557098 TEL : 62733810 FAX : 427HTS22
E-mail : autolife_sin@yahoo.com sg
Date 18-Mar-17
Address : JET WIN CONVEYANCE Reference : TP 1103/03117
INTERNATIONAL MERCHANDISE MART  Vehicle No : PC 2802)
POST OFFICE P.O.BOX 1079 Make/Model  : NISSAN URVAN
SINGAPORE 916012 Insurance Co. : NTUC
RE : QUOTATION REPAIRS TO PC 2802J FOR THIRD PARTY CLAIMS.
PARTS REQUIRED ary COST AMT $
1) FRONT BUMPER 1 $892.70 de
2) FRONT BUMPER RETAINER 1 $150.30/40
3) HEADLAMP 1 oZ $324.50 o~
4) STEP GARNISH LEFT DOOR 1 $232.40 Az .~
5) FRONT LEFT DOOR 1 $1,232.90 A
LIST PRICE TOTAL s2s:280 'S ('
LESS DISCOUNT 30% $849 84 11991
LIST PRICE TOTAL AFTER LESS $1,982.96
B) HINGES 2 $118.20 K>
NETT PRICE TOTAL $118.20
LESS DISCOUNT 10% $11.82
NETT PRICE TOTAL AFTER LESS $106.38
TOTAL PARTS COST
LABOUR AND ELLANEOUS CHARGES
Foo
1) TO REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, HEADLAMP LH $800.00
,LH DOOR AND TO ALIGN. (4 DAYS)
Lpd.
2) TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT FRONT BUMPER & FRONT muof
LH DOOR & STEP GARNISH. (4 PANEL)
20
3) TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING & FOCUS HEADLAMP $60.00
4) TO REMOVE DOOR MECHANISM AND GLASS AND swn.anx‘ nL
TRANSFER TO NEW DOOR LKKAUlp Consutarre o
the ;"ﬂﬂ‘éll-'e" of "_".I-"_: l;‘l '|r;;|-1:lj-;E o if 0 .
5) TUFF KOTE o Toreaurvey bekceiafn yorr - s25000 1710
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TOTAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST



' .ishlg Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay®@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 27 April, 2017 2:03 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802J & SLE 93028 ON 18.03.17
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Casa Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phane: 6256-3561 | email: denisetav@®ikkautn.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[4D8933)

vehde W
Aawiih

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 27 April, 2017 11:38 AM

To: 'Valerie Yap Jia Pei (ECICS, Operations)' <Valerie_Yap@ecics.com.sg>; Carlife <autolife_sin@yahoo.com.sg>
Cc: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Phoebe lay Xie (ECICS, Operations / Claims)

<Phoebelay_Xie@ecics.com.sg>; Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Operations / Claims) <Lionel_Chua@ecics.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802J & SLE 93028 ON 18.03.17

Dear Valerie,
Thank you for your assignment.
Dear Assignment team,

Please arrange

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | amail; denisetay@Ikkayto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Lk Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5[408933)

From: Valerie Yap Jia Pei (ECICS, Operations) [mailto:Valerie Yap@ecics.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 27 April, 2017 11:41 AM
To: Carlife <autolife sin@vahoo.com_ sg>

Cc: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Operations / Claims)
1



, ‘-;'Phnehejau Xie@ecics.com.sg>; Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Operations / Claims) <Lione! Chua@ecics.com.sg>;
- Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denise m>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802J & SLE 93028 ON 18.03.17

Dear Mr Tan,
Thank you for the reminder to us.
Aside to Denise, kindly assist to arrange surveyor

Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Valerie Yap
Operations

DID: +65 6303 0181
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS LIMITED

Email: valerie ECiCs.com.s

follow us on follow us on visit our website H
facebook b & twitter E ecics.com.sg Ech_,‘s
From: Carlife [mailto: life_sin

Sent: Thursday, 27 April, 2017 9:18 AM
To: Valerie Yap Jia Pel (ECICS, Operations)
Subject: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802) & SLE 93028 ON 18.03.17

Hi, Valerie

can you look in this matter
LKK did not receive this case
the vehicle is in for survey,

thank you
regards

On Tuesday, 21 March 2017, 15:51, CarlLife <autolife sin@yahoo.com sg> wrote:

Thank u we shall liase with LKK for the pri survey.

Regids

Tan

On Tuesday, 21 March 2017, 8:53, ECICS Claims <claims({@ecics. com.sg> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above accident.

We intend to conduct & pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle jointly with your client's workshop, We propose
to use one of the motor surveyors named in our list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.



" Please let us know within 2 working days whether you are agreeable to the appointment of any these motor surveyors provided to
" you as'a single joint expert. You may select one of the listed motor surveyors.

‘Our list of the survey firms for your nomination:

LEK
Formieam
Autoprobe
Raleigh
JP Knights

A )

Please furnish us a copy of repair quotation/estimate to show the detail of cost of repair breakdown for each item together with the
full description for the GLA/Police reports and colour photographs of the damaged vehicle to evaluate transparency on the pre-
repair survey of this claim,

Thank vou.

Regards,

Lionel Chua

DID: +65 6303 0167
FAX: +65 6338 9267
ECICS LIMITED

Email: claims@ecics.com.sg

follow us on follow us on visit our website
facebook i twitte r & ecics.com.sg ECI&,,,S

= o

From: CarLife [mailio:autolife_sin@yahoo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 20 March, 2017 3:33 PM

To: ECICS Claims

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802J & SLE 93028 ON 18.03.17

Hi, SirMidm

Refer 1o artach
Pre-inspect of Vehicle Van

thank vou
regards

agagag

This message may contaln privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
wr undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinisns
contalned in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole ar in part is prohibited. [f you are not the sddresses
indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message te such persan), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyune. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply emall. Opinlons contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and 1 only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied Is made by ECICS Limited; as to the falrness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part ks prohibited. If vou are not the addresses
Indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone, In such case,
you should destray this message and kinily notify the sender by reply email. Opirions contuined herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessanty represent the views of ECICS Limited.



Asher EnE (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 May, 2017 12:27 PM

To: ‘autolife_sin@yahoo.com.sg’

Cc Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802) 8 SLE 93028 ON 18.03.17
WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

Thank You.

Best KeQards
Asher Sng | Cose Handles
LKK Aute Consuliants

phone; &841-6051 | emall gshemsng@kkguto.com | tox: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Pava Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenye |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: CarlLife [mailtocautolife_sinf@vahoo.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 20 March, 2017 3:33 PM

To: ECICS Claims

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 2802) & SLE 93028 ON |B.03,17

Hi, SirMdm

Refer 10 uttach
Pre-inspect of Vehicle Van

thank you

regands

follow us on [ follow us on ﬂll_t our website

facebook twitter ec:cs.cum.sg Ec‘cs
’ I - i s s i e pTELEs

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is anly intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantes
or undertaking expressed or implied |s made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairmess, accuracy or completeness of any information. projections or oplnlans
contained in this message, Any unauthorized disclasure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
Indicated in his message [or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message 1o anyone. In such case,



you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opitions of the sender and do
rl necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited

fall Lo fallow visit our website
f;c:b&? twitter 5] ecics.com.sg EC‘CS

PP — W=

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantes
or undertaldng expressed or implied is made by EQICS Limited; as to the falrmess, scocuracy or completeness of any informatien, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part |8 prohibited. Ifyou are not the addressee
indicated in his message [or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may nat copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
nat necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



CAR LIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES

c/o: BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-75 .| SINGAPORE 159719 TEL : 62733810 FAX : 62787522
E-mail ; autolife_sin®yahoo.com sg

Our Re: TP 1103/03/17
Yr. Re: SLE 9302B

Date: 02 March 2019

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE. LTD. WITHOUT
51 UBI AVENUE 1 PREJUDICE
#01 - 25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRAIL PARK

SINGAPORE 408933

ATT: ASHTER SNG.

RE: ACCIDENT INVLG. PC 2802 & SLE 9302B ALONG WOODLANDS AVE 3
TURNING INTO AVE 5 ON 18/02/17 AT ABOUT 2130 HRS.

We refer to the captioned.
Attached copy of your discharge voucher duly signed by claimant.

We appreciate if payment could be processed and settlement be completed
soonest.

Thank you.

\
Yours faithfully,
\ u\\J\
1,\._ \ 1'.

Car Life Auto Engiﬁéeﬁr:g Services.

c.c. ECICS LTD.

CERTIFICATE OF POSTING
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Company Registration No. 199607 188R

51 UBLAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 2564315

To: M/s ECICS LTD Date: 12/03/2020
THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
—— SLE 93028 (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMPU1700150H/DL
ehicle No. Salie.
PC 2802J (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC4/ICS517008392/T1ealq2
Date of Accident 18/3/2017
Liability 100% B
Final Repair Cost '8 2,154.83
Loss of Use '$ 300.00 3 da_fs
Rental (If any) '3 days
Others: - $ 2.00
-
2.456.83
Final Settlement Sum . 1 2,456.83
Remarks ==
ayment | n. P 's Breakd

1) |CAR LIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES

2456 83

LR

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

ECICS LTD Ref CC4/NCS17T0083592/T1ealg2
A
SINGAPORE POST CENTRE #09-04A SINGAPORE Date: 12-03-2020

408600

Code: ICS

1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Vieh. SLE 83028 Veh. Inspected PC 2802
Policy No. MPU16A00108800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, DMPU1700150H/OL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From VALERIE Assign Date 27/04/2017

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  NISSAN NV350 G 2488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JN1TC2E268Z0000899 Colour WHITE
Odometer 274378 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD

3. _ Conditions of Tyres

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[185R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm

4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

B General Information e~ Lda™
Accident Date  18/03/2017 Inspection Date 27104/2017
Survey held at CARLIFE AUTO ENGINEERING SERVICES

BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-75
SINGAPORE 158719

5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR.

3 Working Days




' V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6258 3551 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg No: 189607198R GST Reg No. 18-9607198-R Page No:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC 2802J

1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 892.70 892.70
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER NECESSARY 150.30 150.30
1|STEP GARNISH LEFT DOOR DEFORMED 23240 232.40
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 1.232.60 -
LABOUR
LESS 30% DISCOUNT 752.49 -382.62
1,755.81 892.78
INETT ITEMS
1|HEADLAMP (N) cuT 324.50 324.50
2|HINGES (N) TO REPAIR SEE 118.20
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -44.27 -32.45
39843 292,05
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACE FRONT BUMPER HEADLAMP 800.00| 400.00
LH ,LH DOOR AND TO ALIGN.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF FRONT LEFT DOOR AND HINGES.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT FRONT BUMPER & FRONT LH 800.00 500.00
DOOR & STEP GARNISH .
TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING & FOCUS HEADLAMP. 60.00 30.00
TO REMOVE DOOR MECHANISM AND GLASS AND NOT NECESSARY 180,00 -
TRANSFER TO NEW DOOR.
TUFF KOTE. 250.00 40.00
2,090.00 970.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,244.24 2,154.83

'-"'I-._i

||| s ]

Ftapert Ref No. CC4/ICS1 muaaszm Ea'.':lr.:IZ

P e

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automolive Assessor
Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Report b mste solely lor the use and benelil of the Clenl named on the frent page of this Report.




