Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 4:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: [2014 OST] AXA REF: C0302253 / P1173008 *LKK REF;

CC6/AXA14007470/Kpa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 2123C(AXA) AND SKB
1168C ON 13/04/2014]

Attachments: EMAIL TO AXA.pdf; TP LOD & Docs.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong

Please proceed.

You may submit the settlement document as well.

Thanks.

Regards

Stacey Ng | Assistant Manager, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:stacey.ng@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

all R
50 Years

in Singapore

Please consider the environment before printing this message
Fhis message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht®@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, November 9, 2019 12:48 PM

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> i

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: [2014 OST] AXA REF: C0302253 / P1173008 *LKK REF: CC6/AXA14007470/Kpa3s2-1
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 2123C(AXA) AND SKB 1168C ON 13/04/2014]

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Re-send with attachment.



Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 9 November 2019 12:46 PM

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [2014 OST] AXA REF: C0302253 / P1173008 *LKK REF: CC6/AXA14007470/Kpa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SJR 2123C(AXA) AND SKB 1168C ON 13/04/2014]

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We have temporary close our file on year 2015 due to no response/acceptance from third party on our 50% offer.

Now, third party had accepted our offer at 50% - $653.75(all-in). The breakdown is as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,123.50
2. Loss of Use (3days x $60.00) S 180.00
$1,303.50
@50% |S 651.75

3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee S 2.00
Total | § 653.75

In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case for our further action. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
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message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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SEUBTAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408933 TEL : (43 62363361 FAN @ (0631 62364315

Our Ref: CC6/AXAT14007470/Ksy3
Policy Number: P1173008

17 December 2014

Ong Kim Geok

Blk 159 Bishan St 13
#01-60

Singapore 570159

Dear Sirv’Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVYING SJR 2123C AND SKB 1168C ON 13/04/2014

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
(AXA) 1o resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 27/12/2014 afier we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Accordingly your No Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) may not be preserved.
However, if you are making a claim against third party and successful with 80% in your
favor, our principal will re-instate your NCD.

Please call us it vou have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

Sharon Yee

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 67414108

EMAIL: sharonyeef@lkkauto.com

c.c AXA Insurance Singapore Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept}



Letter of Authorizalion

To Whom It May Concern

Accident on_13th April 2014 involving ___ SKB1168C and SJR2123C
Along X-Junction of Bencoolen Street & Middle Road
e ] Loh Sow Fong Michelle NRIC NO, __S1590896C of

Blk 263 Waterloo Street #14-211 S(180263)

owner of Motor Vehicle Registration No SKB1168C insured by

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTRQynder Poticy No DMPCSN3009781402

do hereby authorize Mfs K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Lid as rayfour

representative with full authority to write, negotiate and setile claim for damages on my/our
behalf against the owner and for driver of Motor Vehicle Regn No. SJR2123C

in regard to the above mentioned accident

1 /We also consent to the agreed settlement sum be made in favour of mylour representative,
M/s K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Lid and the said

payment be forwarded to them to be construed as full and final discharge of ray/our claim.

~z

Owner” Signature & Company Stamp

25.08.2015
Date




AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

( Vehice No: 1 SJR 2123C (insd veh] |

| 1 ___SKB 1168C (17 veh) | medel: Volkswagen Jetta (13890cc)

“ Date of Accident/ Time: j_ 13/04/2014 | B o o
v'n’?’_“'*'h‘f N LS T 5 R M.

23.50 @ 50%. = 56175 f

13 days at 560.00per day

80.00 @ 50% = 90.00

tal {if anvy} days at & ner day

LTa olr’-\:

- — E] i B
Final Settlement Sum L8 653.75

Payee Name : K.Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd o o

Is Third Parw Workshop GiA Registered? {X] YES [ ] NO Kindly indicate below,

VA} For Non GII-‘:-EE-{Eiswred Wrgn:};sigbl; : . i'-\:glrﬁi:ﬁ Liability I N I
8) For GIA Registered Workshap: BOLA Applicable ¥==/ No  BOLA Scemario Mo: NIL
BOLA Liability: f_b_ (%) assesed Liability (%) _
¢ Aseessod Linbility to be filled only for chain collisians and for cuses where BOLA does not apply.
Remaiks ‘
NOTE:
1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVE YOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF SO REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.
2. THIS SETTLEMENT IS ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF
LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY MANNER WHATSOEVER.
3. AXA RESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS & CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW.

Only applicable to rental claim - All document are 1o be submitted with this settlement confirmation.  In the event, rental
agreement / invoices are not received within 7 days of this signed confirmation, we will automatically revert Lo loss of use claim

perthe NIVA rates

We/l confirmed that this is a full and final settlement that we and or our client have/had/has against you (AXA and their
policyholder/authorised driverftortfeasar] for any and all losses {past/present/tuture) arising from this accident.

gvature of workshop reprasentative /Workshop stamp
f{fJ"’L

Narne of Representative: /,4—/\; A
Date: Al pr Ge /‘

Date:

?ignature of / Amiﬁ\ﬁsisax;igy;r_/r‘e e

Name of AXA's surveygr /Rrrese

Date \L

2}

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (Company Reg. No.: 199202
8 Shenton Way #24-01 AXA Tower Singapore DB
AXA Customer Centre #01-21/22
Telephone: +65 G880 4885 - axa.com sy

351
11

wmat.:rn of Withe
Name oi Witness

7= 4
- A:«Z///Mz /

RS Jo{/



Invoice Page 1 of 2

. GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

|NSURANCE 10 Anson Road, #06-16 International Plaza, Singapore 079903
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

- : Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to S5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 3ot pogistration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-14-032597
Date of Request:  16/04/2014 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 34, #01-114

Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575708

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 16/04/2014
Enquiry By SHAN

TP Vehicle No. SJR2123C
Accident Date 13/04/2014

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJR2123C AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Lid 12/06/2013-11/06/2014 6338 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

http:I!singapore.merimen.coch[aimslindex.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&amp;fuseaction=dsp _geninvtp&... 16-Apr-14



Invoice Page 2 of 2

P . GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
s SINGAPORE
| GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

- INSURANCE 10 Anson Road, #06-16 International Plaza, Singapore 079903
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE o Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-14-032997
Date of Request: 16/04/2014 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 34, #01-114
Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575708
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 16/04/2014
Enquiry By SHAN
TP Vehicle No. SJR2123C
Accident Date 13/04/2014
DESCRIPTICN AMOUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO[]Cash[] Cheque

http://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&amp;fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&... 16-Apr-14



