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Catherine Chonﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Saturday, 30 December, 2017 2:12 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
Cc 'LURENEJAW@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17002774MF5H/1

Dear Sir / Madam,

Plaase be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts to inform the workshop to
present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.
“Wislees ve o -'I'll;;'_.“' woew Year 200EN°

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkautocom | fax: 6250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408033)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 March, 2017 59:22 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: LURENEJAW @FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17002774MFSH/1

Dear 5ir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignmentsi@lkkauto.com | fax: d256-4715
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 15 March, 2017 9:13 AM




First Capital Insurance Limited

Company Reg. No. 1950001060
GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9

A FAIRFAX Company

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

14-03-2017 Our Ref No. D17002774MFSH
09-03-2017 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB3309K Third Party Vehicle. GZ8470D

3 TECH PARK CRESCENT TUAS TECH PARK
SUSAN

68639595/ 0 Fax No. 68636477

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: PENDING 1D'S VIDEO FOOTAGE TO DETERMINE
LIABILITY

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MNIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SIN SHENG

ENGINEERING Attention. MIL
SERVICES

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
LUREME

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

Thiz is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

Main Office & B Halles ;_."l_,.|.:,- #2100 ':n'l'h;m_-"-r.- 048580

Claims Departments & Motor Underwriting Department | 30 Aob




Claim Workflow System
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Na SERVICES 6 Cantack Mobile: 0 , Phone: 68639555 , Fax: 6863647
ms (Contact Person Det“'l ¢ Emailld: SINSHENG1981@GMAIL.COM
SUSAN) s
Our LKk AUTO Instructions | WITHOUT PREJUDICE: PENDING ID'S VIDEQ F
Surveyor CONSULTANTS PTE LTD | To Surveyor LIABILITY
I =
Insured Insured b
CITYCAB PTE LTD SHB3309K Vehicle GZB47
MName Vehicle No Nis
PRI . — Surveyor 5 s Surveyor
Hacleved ;:1 03-2017 07:26:06 Appointed ;i‘l 03-2017 09:13:04 Accept 15-03-
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
1
survayor Surveyor :S:::d
: g Y
. Inspe:tmn [— Report Date 15-03-2017 Report
| Date *: 4 Lk
Vehicle Particulars
Make [Please Select Make || | Model [Please Select Model | »| | Year [select
Chasis No [ Engine No 1_ Mileage l
Cubic
C
alak l Capacity | l_
Multiple Documents Upload
| |
Upload Multiple Documents l ‘
‘ File Name

Action ‘

Surveyor Job Remarks

https://cldilshareapp02.cloudapp.net/ ClaimWS/Surveyor/Details/217813

15/3/2017



Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 1:28 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuUtO)

Cc: SUR: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: Accident Involving GZ8470D with SHB3309K on 09/03/2017
Hi Ms Denise,

We are agreed.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On 13 September 2018 at 10:49, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Susan,

Offer at lump sum 350,2days

Please check and revert

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



PARF/COE Rebate Engquiry Page | of |

Textsize+ -

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner 1D 1196M

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.! GZB470D

‘ehicle to be Exported. ‘No
Intended De-registration o, qo. 9047

Drate:

Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model L300 HR M
Primary Colour White

Manufacturing Year: 2006

Engine No.: ADSELC5468

Chassis Mo JMAINPASVEADD 1684
Meximum Fower Output -

Open Market Value: $11.987.00

Criginal Registralion
Date:

First Registration Date: 27 Sep 2008

27 Sep 2006

Transfer Count: L+

Actual ARF Paid: 2600.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

FARF Eligibility Na

FARF Eligibility Expiry

Date:

FARF Rebate Amount; $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Dale. 31 Aug 2021
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Periad{Years) 5
PQP Paid £23,127.00
COE Rebate Amount.  $16,955.00

Total Rebate Amount: $16,959.00

Message

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year periad, subject lo the statutory lifespan {if
applicable) of the vehicle,

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Mar 2017
| ok
and Transysor Al Y
Please read thraugh the Prvacy Statement, Terms of Use and Disclaimer.
Please do nol use the Back or Forward butions on your browser as thes may alter the results of the ansactions

Best viawsd wih |E 6.0 SF3 and above. 1024 X 758 reschudion
Copynightl © 2017 LTA | Provegy Stadement | Teims of Liseg | Dizclaimers | Rais the Weksdg 1 Bate this e=Service

https:/vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTL.. 4/3/2017



SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

3 TECH PARK CRESCENT

SINGAPORE 638129

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6863-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1981@gmail.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123

Attention : Motor Claim Department

Estimate

Date :

\Vehicle Num.
Make/Model
Chassis/Engy#

: ES002547
24/07/2018

: GZ8470D
: MITSUBISHI L300-2006
: IMAINP15VEADO1694/4D56LC5466

Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780 Accident Date : 09/03/2017
Claim No. :
Reference : SHE3309K
Policy No. ; D-16085361 MFCV
/N Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount 55
NETT ITEMS ; )
1. 1 BUMPER SIDE 55.00 e
2. 1 REFLECTOR 55.00 % h+
3. 1 MUDFLAP, RH 95.00 & A
Nett Total 55 : 205.00
10.00% Discount 55 ; 20.50
184.50
LABOUR : -
TO PANEL BEAT/REPAIR RH BODY 250.00
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS
: , 700
SPRAY PAINTING ’Tu,}(‘“‘ g g ?(;H'g] 450.00
LOSS OF USE - 3DAYS @ S 1200AY 07 26[FH(§ @ A%0
Labour Total S$ : = 0] dpgS [M 700.00
L \ |
uv £ !JIJ-(PU-«J’O ‘WA h
Total 55 : 884.50

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

Acknowiedged by Repaires

Sagnatune:




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdis BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 402033
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :©  CS/FCIT005166/T1thn2
36 ROBINSOMN ROAD
Date 1-09-2018
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 wes el ”"ummmm"
Code; FCIZ2

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHB 3309K Veh. Inspected GZ 8470D
Policy No. D-15072702MFSH Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. DA7002774MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 151032017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI L2300 c.C 2477
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2006
Chassis No. JMAJNP1SVEADO 1694 Colour WHITE
Odometer 367536 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GooD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R14 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60R14 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/80 R14 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R14 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/03/2017 |inspection Date 26/07/2018
Survey held at  SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES
3 TECH PARK CRESCENT TUAS TECK PARK SINGAPORE 638129
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R Page Ma.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GZ 8470D
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop () 5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER SIDE (N cuT 55.00 55.00
1|REFLECTOR (M) NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
1IMUDFLAP, BH (N) NOT NECESSARY 95.00 =
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -20.50 -5.60
184 .50 4950
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT/REPAIR RH BODY . TO 250,00 200.00
DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS
SPRAY PAINTING 450.00 200.00
700.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL BB4.50 449.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 350.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI17005166/T 1tbn2

W .

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAl PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

ISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Repor is made solely for the use and banafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
Hao lability ﬁmmwn.mwmwww.wnmwuw
Feporl In whode or n o

arl, dona so al his or her own risk,




