Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 9:19 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); emTautopteltd@gmail.com; SUR
Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD - SKT 8349G DOA 07.03.2017

Dear Sir / Madam,

Kindly forward to CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE, their ref SNM17D01420C02/5

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 5:58 PM

To: emlautopteltd@gmail.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: LOD - SKT 8349G DOA 07.03.2017

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CS/CTI117004893/M1vb Veron

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:emlautopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 2:44 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: LOD - SKT 8349G DOA 07.03.2017




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir /Madam,
Please find the attached LOD.

COR $ 6,955.00
LTA $ 5.35
LOR $1,016.50
Total :  $7,976.85

Kindly arrange for settlement.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Nicole, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Rd Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R



