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Catherine Chuna sLI{K Autuz

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com»
Sent: Thursday, 7 December, 2017 6:11 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System'; 'ASSIGNMENTS@®LKKAUTO.COM'
Ce: ‘MAYCHUA@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM SG'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17001567MFSH/1

Diear Sir / Madam,
Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner would like to withdraw claim.
We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regiinds,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67418434 | emall assignments@lkkautd com | fax: 6o56-4915

Bk 515, Pags Ub) Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2e25 | S(4n8033)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, 16 February, 2017 9:30 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@first-Insurance.com.sg>; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
<ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>

Ce: 'MAYCHUA@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG' <MAYCHUA@FIRST-INSURANCE,COM.5G>; 'sur@Ikkauto.com’
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17001567MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you far the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the warkshop, repairer will arrange.

Boat Regnrds,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

M 6741-8434 | emall: assignmentsilkknmo.com | fax: BURh-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #62-25 | S{468934)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmatorelaims @first-insurance com sg)

Sent: Thursday, 16 February, 2017 9:08 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS BLKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSURANCE COM SG; MAYCHUA@FIRST INSURANCE COM SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17001567MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



First Capital Insurance Limited

M I-‘L\I REAX Coripenny

Company Rog. Mo, 195000108C
GAT Ang Mo, M7 -000VETE-G

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Caontact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
oB-02-2017 Our Ref No.
05-02-2017 Claim Type.
SHC 19800 Third Party Vehicle.

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08

VIVIAN WONG

62723892/ 62723802 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No.

MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D17001567MFSH

Third Party

SLC4830G

6271583

68418315

Please submil to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Otficer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE AL
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No.
MAY CHLUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NiIL

NA

indly submit the survey report vig CWS within 14 days for survey assignmant and 7 days for re-inspection.

This s a tomputer generated lstter, no signature required.
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LTD No
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Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
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Inspestion Report Date Report
Date *: i e
Vehicle Particulars
| Make | Piease Select Make Model | Please Select Madel|=| | Year | Sefect
Chasis No | | EngineNe || Mileage | |
Cubic
Color | Enpadity [
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents |
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Surveyor Job Remarks
https://cldilshareapp02.cloudapp.net/ClaimWS/Surveyor/Details/216292 16/272017

L]



