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Catherine Chnna !LKI{ Auto)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 December, 2017 6:14 PM

To: ‘Annie Koh'

Cc: ‘alice.lowkc@income.com.sg'; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey by LKK

Dear Annie,

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner withdraw claim from their workshop.
We will close this file at out end without billing.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-B434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4915
Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080:3:3)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January, 2017 11:37 AM

To: 'Annie Koh' <annie.koh@income.com.sg>; assignments@Ilkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Jenny Pe' <jenny.pe@income.com.sg>; 'Thio Tse Kiat' <tsekiat.thio@income.com.sg>; 'Toh Choon Hin'
<choonhin.toh@income.com.sg>; 'Gan Boon Chuan' <boonchuan.gan@income.com.sg>; 'Daniel Koh'
<daniel. koh@income.com.sg>; 'Alice Low' <alice.lowkc@income.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey by LKK

Dear Annie,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

"Wishes you a Happy New Year 2017"

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408934)

Frem: Annie Koh [mailto:annie. koh@income.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January, 2017 11:32 AM

To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignm Ikkauto.
Cc: Jenny Pe <jenny.pe@income.com.sg>; Thio Tse Kiat <tsekiat.th me.com.sg>; Toh Choon Hin

<choonhin.toh@income.com.sg>; Gan Boon Chuan <bgonchuan.gan®@income.com.sg>; Daniel Koh



Catherine Chuna !LKK Autol

From: Annie Koh <annie koh@income.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January, 2017 11:32 AM

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com'’

Cc: Jenny Pe; Thio Tse Kiat, Toh Choon Hin; Gan Boon Chuan; Daniel Koh,
Alice Low

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey by LKK

Dear Veron / Catherine,

Please assist to survey the vehicle as per Mr Toh's / Tse Kiat instruction :-

THIRD OUR
5/n | PARTY INSURED WORKSHOP / CONTACT NO. DOA / CLAIM NO / OFFICER

1 SGUB356C | PCS093T BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SVCPL @ | 27-10-16 (MT/0928183-002)
67452088 - SALLY ALICE LOW

Please contact workshops.
Please revert to officer-in-charge after survey.

Thank You

Warmest Regards

Annie Koh
ﬂtl'ﬁ Snr Adminstrator, Motor Insurance

Incorm T +65 6594 7062
nEED

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use
of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the
sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you.




