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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: K Krishna Partners <kkrishnaoffice@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 July 2021 12:40 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR; janicechou@alanutd.com
Subject: Re: Our Ref: SM.17388.2017.vm; Your Ref: CS/TP16024669/Kqh3n2 (GY 3424B)
Attachments: DOC070721-07072021125201.pdf

Our Ref: SM.17388.2017.vm;  
Your Ref: CS/TP16024669/Kqh3n2 (GY 3424B) 
 
Attention: Mr. Kong Seng Cheng  
 
Dear Sir, 
 
We refer to the above matter and your email of even date.  
 
We confirm the appointment on 9th July 2021 at 1030am.  
 
We attach herewith a copy of the acknowledgement for your kind attention. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
 
M VEKNESH  
On behalf of K Krishna & Partners  
 
On Wed, Jul 7, 2021 at 11:31 AM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear M Veknesh, 

  

Kindly confirm whether the AEIC appointment can be fixed on coming Friday, 09th July 2021 at 10.30am.  

And Attached herewith Confirmation Slip, CV of Mr Kong Seng Cheong for your attention. There is no 
amendment on the Draft AEIC. 

  

Kindly chop and sign the Confirmation Slip and forward back to me to enable us to proceed the signing of 
said Affidavit. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: K Krishna Partners <kkrishnaoffice@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 July 2021 9:51 AM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: janicechou@alanutd.com 
Subject: Our Ref: SM.17388.2017.vm; Your Ref: CS/TP16024669/Kqh3n2 (GY 3424B) 

  

Our Ref: SM.17388.2017.vm;  

Your Ref: CS/TP16024669/Kqh3n2 (GY 3424B) 

  

Attention: Mr. Kong Seng Cheng  

  

Dear Sir, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We attach herewith a copy of the draft AEIC of Mr Kong Seng Cheng from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for your 
attention. 

  

KIndly let us have the followings:- 

   

   a. Date and time of Mr Kong Seng Cheng to attend the office to affirm the same; 

   b. CV  

   c. Invoice of the attendance fee  
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Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

  

M VEKNESH  

On behalf of K Krishna & Partners  

   


