Ai Phing (LKKAuto)

From: Ai Phing (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 March, 2017 3:25 PM

To: 'Goh, Stella'

Cc: Tay, Michael

Subject: RE: Our Claim ref:CLMOMVC000000257; Your ref: XD6705E
Dear Stella,

Content noted.

Best Regards,

Ai Phing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Goh, Stella [mailto:Stella.Goh@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 March, 2017 3:21 PM

To: Ai Phing (LKKAuto) <aiphing@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Tay, Michael <Michael.Tay@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: Our Claim ref:CLMOMVC000000257; Your ref: XD6705E
Dear Ai Phing,

We refer to our tele-conversation earlier.

Woon Meng agreed to undertake the OD at lump sum of S 50,000.

Please note that PH will settle the excess directly us.

Thank you.

Stella Goh, Senior Executive | P. 65 6804 6059 | F. 65 6235 3354 | stella.goh@sg.gaig.com
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The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



